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Re: Your Ref: YP684X190513 // LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19008844/Upa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLB9455J(EQ) AND YP684X ON 13/05/2019]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 8/6/2021 1:39 PM
To:  Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

We confirm settlement at g/s $820.00(all-in).

Kindly provide a copy of your client's authorisation to act for our necessary action.

EQ is moving to E-payment modes. Kindly let us have your company’s bank details for our necessary action: - 
 
 

Account Name   
Account Number   
Bank Name   
Bank & Branch Code   

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 5 June 2021 3:03 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: YP684X190513 // LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19008844/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLB9455J(EQ) AND YP684X ON 13/05/2019]
 
Refer attachment and email dated 07/11/2020

We had confirmed acceptance of your offer. 

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon as
possible.
Thank.
Best Regards,
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6/8/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%… 2/3

Susan Low
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Monday, 17 May 2021, 2:47:27 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

REMINDER                                                          Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our email dated 30 Oct 2020.
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 11:05 AM

To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: YP684X190513 // LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19008844/Upa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLB9455J(EQ) AND YP684X ON 13/05/2019]
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our email dated 30 Oct 2020.
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
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HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 9:26 AM

To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Subject: Your Ref: YP684X190513 // LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19008844/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLB9455J(EQ) AND YP684X ON 13/05/2019]
 
Your Ref: YP684X190513                                  Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19008844/Upa3
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB9455J(EQ) AND YP684X ON 13/05/2019
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Attached is a copy of our insured's accident report and photos taken by our insured at the time of
accident. Your driver offered to fix the side mirror and our insured did not proceed with the claim as
he pitied with the driver.
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that both parties should exercise caution. Our
driver was in the midst of reversing and your driver still proceed to squeeze from the left. Thus,
collision happened.
 
Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s
claim in the above matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer at a global sum
of $820.00(all-in) towards your client's claim.
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter
is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from
this offer in any other related matters.
 
Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of
Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents
shall be retained by us after we have made payment on the settlement sum.”
 
 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 / 6271 0196  | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-

8802
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Branch: Blk 1007 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721)
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