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L Consutiants
AdA Bna n Ple Ltd

51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : ((65) 62564315

Your Ref: D19003273MFSH Date: 30/5/2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19008803/Etd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SAH 7660C _ .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
28/05/2019 at the premises of M/s Mova Automobile have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5 2.744.75
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 1.015.27
“Check” Items Amount : 8% 234.00
Market Value - 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%
Nett Value : 8%
rearsice
Description of Damage: rear F‘,TIT__‘=_”‘_.I’=_"_“——--—T“ _—
The vehicle sustained damages at the | S Iy .
rear portion. e

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Steve
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofee o D05000106C  C5T Reg Mo H2-0001675-9
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 0438580

Tel {65)6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Clalms & Hotor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Fobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tek |65) 6507 3848 Fax; (65) 6507 3849
wwiw. mefirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

16-05-2018 Our Ref No. D19003273MFSH
14-05-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHBE328K Third Party Vehicle. SMH7E60C

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/08/08
NITHA

62723892/ 0 Fax No. 62708314

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE Attention. NIL
LTD
MA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.
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Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Jacelyn <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2019 5:23 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SMH7660C - TP/FCI - TOYOTA HARRIER (DOA 14 05.2019)
Moted

Best Regards,

Jacelyn Ooi

Estimatar

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ ©

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only, If you have received this message in eror. please da nol copy, disclose or use
its content. We would ba grateful if you would notify us by email and delste the original fransmiggion and any attachment from your system

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasona hle precaulion fo
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carmy out your 0wn virus checks before opening any attachment

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2019 4:49 PM

To: Jacelyn

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALIZATION: SMH7660C - TP/FCI - TOYOTA HARRIER (DOA 14.05.2019)

Dear Jacelyn,

Reconfirm repair day is 2 day.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Jacelyn [mailto:jacelyn@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, September 04, 2019 12:06 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SMH7660C - TP/FCI - TOYOTA HARRIER (DOA 14.05.2019)

Dear Steve,

Amount confirmed.

Best Regards,
Jacelyn Ooi



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 4:28 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments; SUR
Cc: ‘Eileen Lee'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003273MFSH/
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SMH 7660C.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMH 7660C

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent; Friday, 17 May 2019 4:00 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com=; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003273MFSH/1

Dear 5ir / Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: f741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: bagh-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 17 May, 2019 3:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003273MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 61576

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.: SMH7&60C

Vehicle to be Exported: Neo

Intended Deregistration Date: 28 May 2019
Vehicle Make; TOYOTA

Vehicle Madel: HARRIER PREMIUM STYLE MAUVE 20 CVT
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No: 3ZRB&679078
Chassiz MNo.; Z5U600064325
Maximum Power Output: 111.0 kW (148 bhp)
Open Market Value: $30,946.00
Original Registration Date: 06 Jan 2016

First Registration Date: 06 Jan 2016
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $35,325.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 05 Jan 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $26,493.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 05 Jan 2026

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW {130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $61,103.00

COE Rebate Amount: $40,357.00

Total Rebate Amount: $66,850.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 May 2019
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: Mam ﬂfrca

ra Budd

{ NG 22, dalan Kilar ;;-.
- Sir & 153419
Estimate Tol 155; 6476 3333
Veh# .. SMH7660C A
16/058/2019 ¥
Veh Model - TOYOTA HARRIER w"""“";‘_"?'_kne‘"_'_
Bui r'.-l-ll||l""
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate# . CK419160 401-04/06/08/94
36 Robinson Road . Singapore 159722
#16-01 City House Claim # - hel o it
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date :- 14/05/19 g
Terms - C.O.D Days R
Attention - XAD26 Remarks -
Mo.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts 5%
LIST ITEMS : T
1.  REARBUMPER < v pelT¥3 A as8.00 1,458,00
2. REAR BUMPER LOWER {HDU?H E!L)}E,‘ﬁ] il ”T 1 BC 489,00 489.00
3. REAR BUMPER SPONGE 1 PG 142.00/”" 142.00
4, REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH e " 1 PC 82.00 B2.00
5 REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKETLH - K :‘~" 1 PC 85.00 X 85.00
B, REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKETRH | WM 1 PC 85.00 ¥ B5.00
7 REAR BUMPER CLIPS -~ M 10 PG 5.00 T0/50.00
B REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERRH - [ 1 PC 8200 B2.00
LIST TOTAL S% . 2,473.00
25% DISCOUNT S8 / [6 -618.25
T E 4 1,854.75
Fl = I':.;" v ey =2
SPECIAL NET ITEMS : . -
1, REVERSE SENSOR il - 104 1 PC 280.00 /977" 28000
| / _________________
SPECIAL NET TOTAL S§ _ 07 280.00
L - - IR o A
LABOUR : q €]
TO INSTALL REAR PARKING SENSOR & DIAGNOSE 2430 |
FUNCTION . ) = Jd 5000
LIT- 169 :
TO REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS. REALIGN CONNECTION - ! 7¢7 280,00
TO SPRAY PAINT OM REPAIRED AREAS SR 7(7 28000
LABOUR TOTALSS = e 610.00
E &OE
LKK Autp Consultanis hence notify NON-TAX AMOUNT S
the Repairer of the following: AMOUNT 5% 274475
» To resurvey befare/atter spray painting —r"?f “
« To dispiay damaged part{s) dur Mg Mesurvay / GST @ 7% 19213
» Parts prices are subsect io confirmation 'IIA.-f" . O E E =
= Third party Survey is on 8 "Without Prejudice” basis [ Flf' AMOUNT DUE 5% 2,936.88
» No iegat sodheatontsHs aRawed---—rr-=m———- /

'f;i%ﬁl‘ﬁ#‘;‘;? ?Bﬁri'&fﬁmmm MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Acknowledged by Repainer
Signature:
Diste:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusitrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-2607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCIM9008B03/Etd3n2
iﬁaﬁﬁggﬁ? ngL?;EDSINGAPORE 068877 Ca IH””““”II”"'“I'“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 6328K Veh. Inspected SMH 7660C
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D19003273MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 17/05/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HARRIER c.c 1986
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg, 2018
Chassis No. ZSUB00064325 Colour BLACK
Odometer 57099 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GoOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/60 R18 DUNLOP 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/60 R18 DUNLOP 7 mm
R/H Rear Tj.r:re 235/60 R18 DUNLOP 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/60 R18 DUNLOF 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
3. General Information
Accident Date  14/05/2018 Inspection Date 2B/05/2019
Sunrey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 158722
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 189607198R GST Req. No. 19-2607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMH 7660C
- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (3)) “.J}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 1,458.00 1,343.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER (ROUGH BLACK) cuT 489.00 489.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE BROKEMN 142.00 14200
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH BROKEN 82.00 82.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 85.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKET RH NOT NECESSARY 85.00 .
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @$5.00 MECESSARY 50,00 30,00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH BROKEN 82.00 82,00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -618.25 -542.00
1,854.75 1,626.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
280.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO INSTALL REAR PARKING SENSOR & DIAGNOSE 50.00 30.00
FUNCTION.
TO REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS.REALIGN CONNECTION. 280.00 200.00
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREAS. 280.00 200.00
610.00 430.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,744.75 2,256.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,800.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119008803/Etd3n2

=

CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

S

ADRIAMN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE. AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Roport is made solaly for the uss and bensfit of the Clant namad on the front page of this Report.




