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Yourrel:  To Be Advised Dute: 23.05.2019
Chur ref; CCALPCIB08TIS/R 1ebd

The Motor Cluims Department

M LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Si/Mudam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SLGS0258
We refer 10 the above matter,

Pleusee be mformed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 22.05.2019
at the premises of Mfs _aAh Lim Motwor Company _and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 §% 2.816.74

Revised Estimute Amount : 5§ 1.073.02

"Check” lems Amount . 5% -

Market Value : 8% -

LTA Rennbursement Value ; 8% -

Nett Vilue : 58 -

Pescription of Damage: - e
The vehicle sustained damages ar the L___EE‘___' .
VS Rear Partion -

Commenis/Present Stuus;
Dimiages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: i duys

Yours faithfully.

MOHD. RASUL
Licensed Appraiser



l

AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY =,

: -~ AR
[T S Ming [yrve #1512 S0 Ming Avtocire Singapore 373721 ! [ mo |
TEL: #4436 3637 FAX: 6456 3686  Email. sdmind sl com sg _‘)URL E YJR CDP III{

IS TN, 0. JOCTY MO Dad TOR0OR

M/S:  OHQIHAO

APT BLK 6708 EDGEFIELD PLAIN Estimate No:  MCS1900087

#]1-622 Date: 08 Moy 2019

SINGAPORE 822670 Policy No: PNPV2018-00011652
TEL: 8488 B388 Veh Reg No:  SLGS025S .
ATTN: . i
Your Ref No: SLGS025S Mode[: Nissar @G..E,L\%ﬂ.
Claim Type: Third Party [ >

Accident Date: 06052019
I'P Veh Reg No:  SIPLISIB

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLGS025S

Description Quantity List Price Amount
53 55
Mett
o
| REARDOORRH TH*" | PC 1,140,480
2 REARDOOR TAPE-RH ¥ I SET 30,00
1 REAR DOOR LOWER GARNISH SUL < | PC 264 80)
4 REAR FENDER WHEEL ARCH - RH fel | e AR3.00
1918 6l
Liess 1% |51, 8 1.726.T4
LABOUR
5 TODISMANTLE & INSTALL REAR RH POWER WINDOW MOTOR & I PC 90,00 ¥
GEAR
b TODISMANTLE THE DAMAGED PARTS. TO ALIGN REAR DOOR R & 1P M‘v}m
TO KNOCK & REPATR REAR RH AFFECTED ARFEAS & TO REFTT
LISTED PARTS BACK SAME %
7 TOUSPRAY REAR DOOR RH & REAR FENDER RH | 1 ?xﬂﬂ oo
1.0 000 1.0F0. 00
V'gkal SS2RI674
Al GST @ 7% 9717
Total Amount Payable S5 301391
TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR THREE THOUSAND THIRTEEN AND CENTS NINETY ONE ONLY
Q For AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY
ral

I — Hf‘iuorwék of

/ {7 ™
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070572019

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

O 10
Vehicle Detalls

WVehicle No.

Vehicle 1o be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Modeal:

Primary Colaur:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Datea:
Transter Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligihility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years)

OF Paid:

COE Rebats Amaunt:

Total Rebate Amount

The information contained herein s correct as at 07 May 2019

PARFICOE Rabate Enquiry

Singapora NRIC
TO45F

SLGS0D255

Yes

13 May 2019

MISSAN

QASHQAI 1.2 DIGT CVT ABS 2WD SER
Black

2014

HRAZZF08564
SINFEAJ11U1695005
B5.0kW (113 bhpl
$18.48%.00

30 5ep 2014

30 Sap 2014

1]

$13.689.00

Yes
29 5ep 2026
$10.266.00

29 5ep 2026

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW {130bhp)
10

$51.506.00

£37,99%.00

$4B8.265.00

FRLRES s, DR SR LR 0 L L e I EE L A o LA L L 00 e LAt e LIV . 1 . P L g T T



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 5:10 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; meili@almsm.com.sg

Subject: FW. Request to register TP Claim - Our Client's Vehicle SLG 50258 insured under

FWD Insurance against your insured vehicle SJP 1 181B acc on 06/05/2019 [External

Confidential]
Attachments: 5025-Estimate.pdf: 5025-FWD. POF 0 2240 D “45 ’ 7019
Prsore> My h
Lonpac External - Confidential vihicle ﬂu]L lin

Dear Nivitha,

The third party workshop had informed us to appoint Mohd Rasul
for the survey,

Please liaise with them accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: 65) 6296 2706

[_ [ The all (&) lonpac.com.sg
= o B

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties anly

From: melli@almsm.com.sg [ma:ltu:mefli@almsm.:um.r.g]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 11:49 AM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Reguest to register TP Claim - Our Client's Vehicle SLG 50255 Insured under FWD Insurance against your
insured vehicle SJP 11818 acc on 06/05/2019

Dear Motor Claims Team,

We refer to the attachment.

Kindly assist to register our client’s TP claim & arrange for survey on our client’s vehicle soonest as
possible,

Regards,
Meili Tan - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive
#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare



s Eingapare 575721
Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686
emall : meili@almsm.com.sg



Asher Sng !LI(I{Autu)

Fram: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 4:38 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT & PRE-REPAIR SURVEY -YOUR REF: SJP1181B & OUR REF:

TCLGCN.an.50341.19.em - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG5025S & SJP11818 ON 06/05/19
@TIME: 18:50 HRS ALONG SENGKANG EAST DRIVE [External Confidential]

Hi Gerald,

We refer to the above matter.

Third party claimant have changed workshop to repair the vehicle at EM SOLUTION PTE LTD.
We have check with the repairer, they have submitted the case to the solicitor to handle.

In view on above, we will process to submit our report and close case at our end.

Thank Youw

et Regords
Asher Sng | Case Hondler
LEK Aulo Consullants Ple Lid

phone: £841.6031 | emol: gshersng@kkouto.com | fox: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ub Industrial Pork, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 May 2019 11:25 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Anil Kumar <anil@htapartners.com.sg>

Subject: FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT & PRE-REPAIR SURVEY -YOUR REF: SJP1181B & OUR REF:
TCL.GCN.an.50341.19.em - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG5025S & SJP1181B ON 06/05/19 @TIME: 18:50
HRS ALONG SENGKANG EAST DRIVE [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref  : 19/19/19/VP05/021797

Dear Asher,

For your necessary action.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
100 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all « vew | lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Anil Kumar [mnilln:m':i‘tr‘firhlanarmtrs.mm.Eg]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 May, 2019 11:03 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT _Claim_SG; EM Auto

Subject: FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT & PRE-REPAIR SURVEY -YOUR REF: SJP1181B & OUR REF:
TCL.GCN.an.50341.19.em - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG5025S & SJP1181B ON 06/05/19 @TIME: 18:30
HRS ALONG SENGKANG EAST DRIVE [External General]

Without Prejudice
Save As To Cost

Dear Gerald,
We refer to our tele-conversation today 29" May 2019 concerning your email dated 24" May 2019.

As discussed and agreed, our client is agreeable 1o use LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to be the single joint
expert for our client’s vehicle SLG5025S and our client further agree to the SJE’s recommended repair cost
$1.073 .02 with no. of days for repairs to be agreed. As agreed further, we understand that a pre-repair to our
clients’ vehicle already been done and as such you would only require a post-repair inspection to be done for
the said vehicle.

Kindly contact the person-in-charge 1o arrange for the post repair inspection of the vehicle. Please be informed
that the said vehicle can be inspected at: -

Venue : EM SOLUTION PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Autocity
#03-18/19
Singapore 575722
Contact Person : Mr Bernard at H/P: 91018302 ( Important: Kindly contact Mr Bernard, prior to arranging

your appointed surveyor going down to inspect our client’s vehicle for the above matter)

Best regards,

Anil (Secretary)

M/s Hin Tat Augustine & Partners
20 Upper Circular Road
#02-10/12 The Riverwalk



Singapore 058416
Tel : 6533 0212
Direct Fax: 63383536
Fax : 63383536

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com=

Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 10:05 AM

To: Anil Kumar <anil{@htapartners.com.sg=>

Ce: MT Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com=

Subject: RE: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT & PRE-REPAIR SURVEY -YOUR REF: SJP1181B & OUR REF:
TCL.GCN.an.50341.19.em - ACCIDENT [NVOLVING SLGS025S & SIP1181B ON 06/05/19 @TIME: 18:50
HRS ALONG SENGKANG EAST DRIVE [External General]

Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref - 19/19/19/VP05/021797

Dear Anil,

T'he estimate submitted by Ah Lim Motor Co was $2.816.74 and the
appointment of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as Single Joint Expert
was agreed by them 15 May 201 9.

The inspection of the vehicle was conducted on 22 May 2019 and we
attached the photos of your client’s vehicle for your attention.

Based on the initial inspection, the estimate repair amounts 1o $1,073 .02
excluding supplementary parts. If there are supplementary items, a
survey of the vehicle is necessary.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ( vew | lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Anil Kumar [muiIm:anilfdlhta@gnem.cnm.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 23 May, 2019 4:24 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT & PRE-REPAIR SURVEY -YOUR REF: SJP1181B & OUR REF:

- |



TCL.GCN.an.50341,19.em - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG5025S & SJIP1181B ON 06/05/19 @TIME: 18:50
HRS ALONG SENGKANG EAST DRIVE

Without Prejudice

Save As To Cost

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG5025S & SIP1181B ON 06/05/19 @TIME: 18:50 HRS ALONG
SENGKANG EAST DRIVE

We are instructed to notify you of the above-mentioned road traffic accident which involves our client's vehicle
registration number SLG5025S and vehicle registration number SJP1181B driven by your insured at the

material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your
insurers would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do t receive any reply from you within
the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without reference to you.

Best regards,

Anil (Secretary)

M/s Hin Tat Augustine & Partners
20 Upper Circular Road
#02-10/12 The Riverwalk
Singapore 058416

Tel : 6533 0212

Direct Fax: 63383536

Fax : 63383536



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrisl Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6255 4215

Reg. No: 188607T1688R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Exports En Automoblle

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD

Ref : CC4/LPC18008738/R1eb3q2

#17.04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 19gs55 Loe: 19062018 MM"I"H"“HIM
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJP 11818 Veh. Inspected SLG 50255
Policy No. ZMaNVP05/022856 Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. 18/M18M19NVPOS/021787 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 15/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN QASHOAI1.2 c.c 1187
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. SJNFEAJ11U1685005 Colour BLACK
Odometer 60474 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/60 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/80 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 06/05/2019 Inspection Date 22/05/2018
Survey held at AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY
176 SIN MING DRIVE #05-12
SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair I
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




¥
HK"L-

7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6255 4315

DASCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made sclaly for the use and benafil of e Client mamed on the front page of this Repon

Reg Mo 180607198R GST Reg Mo, 19-98507198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 50255
Description of Parts Condition [~ Srats
i P Workshop ()| ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR RH (N) TO REPAIR SEE 1,140.80
LABOUR
1|SET REAR DOOR TAPE-RH (N} NOT NECESSARY 30.00
1|REAR DOOR LOWER GARNISH (N) SCRATCHED 264 .80 264 80
1|REAR FENDER WHEEL ARCH -RH [N) SCRATCHED 483.00 483.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -191.86 -74.78
1,726.74 673.02
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE & INSTALL REAR RH POWER WINDOW  |NOT NECESSARY 90.00
MOTOR & GEAR
TO DISMANTLE THE DAMAGED PARTS .TO ALIGN REAR 500.00 200.00
DOOR RH & TO KNCCK & REPAIR REAR RH AFFECTED
AREAS & TO REFIT LISTED PARTS BACK
SAME.INCLUSIVE OF THE REFAIR OF REAR DOOR RH
TO SPRAY REAR DOOR RH & REAR FENDER RH, 500.00 200.00
1,090.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 2.816.74 1,073.02
|  RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | g | 1,073.02
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19008738/R1eb3q2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automolive Assessor




