Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Kelvyna,

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Friday, 10 May 2019 5:37 PM

Ngian, Kelvyna

SUR

RE: Market value FBC9756D as at 22.8.18

The MV of FBC 9756D is $200-$500(est) as at Aug’18.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 11:54 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Market value FBC9756D as at 22.8.18

Hi Shiau

Will this help?



Your Vehicle FBC9756D Has Been Deregistered

The above-rmentioned vehicle was deregistered on 23 Aug .

20018, You need not submit your wehicle's disposal What You Need To Do:
P . +  Dispose of your vehicle if

documents if it has been reported to the Police to be | youhave not done so.

misging, it is lost through theft/Criminal Breach of Trust |5 Use.  your  PARFACOE

{CBT) or is in the custody of the authorities. 1f the vehicle | rebateis}before it expires:
is recovered and returned to you, yvou should dispose of it = EEGEE';];&PCB o {6

e —

within | month of the vehicle's return. Serap it (including | | oL e i it

the engine and chassis) at an LTA-authorised scrapyard or | feee on vour new car with
submit to LTA documentary proof that the vehicle has been |7 the PARF/COE rebiats(z),
permanently exported aut of Singapore. + Use your COE rebate to

offset the Prevailing Cusa
Premium (POP) when you

We have granted the following rebate(s) to you. ¥ou can necew e CUE of youwr

use the rebate(s) if vou have settled all outstanding matters, SR i
e.g. there are no road tax amears, the vehicle financing is |+ Login tn
settled, etc. W oD g COTL5E
o enter & valid refund bank
) o BCCOURL - T0 - redeive  your
PARF Rebate Amount t NIA ' rebates via GIRO if you are
PARF Rebate Reference No, : NiA . encashing your rebate.
Expiry Date of PARF Rebate : NIA - :
COE Rebate Amount ¢ B4630.00
COE Rebate Reference No, P IS 123 CO000
Expiry Date of COE Rebate ¢ 06 Dec 2019

ou must use the PARF/COE rebate(s) before it expires.

Go to www.onemotoring.com.sg > Digital Services and
search for the services below;

Thanks
Kelvyna
68046059

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, May 10, 2019 9:08 AM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Market value FBC9756D as at 22.8.18

Dear Kelvyna,

Kindly provide us the LTA rebate before renew COE of above motorbike.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 5:45 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Market value FBC9756D as at 22.8.18

Hi team



Can assist to advise the Market value as at 22.8.18

\ehicle Registration No. :FBC 9756 D
Vehicle Type - Motorcycle
Vehicle Make : Yamaha
Vehicle Model : T135
Chassis No. : 9YP300266
Engine No. » 5YP300266
Engine Capacity - 135

Colour s Black

Original Registration Date : 01 September 2008

PARF Rebate Amount s WiA :
PARF Rebate Reference Mo, : NiA L
Expiry Date of PARF Rebate : Wi

COE Rchate Amount ¢ B4 63000

COE Rebate Reference Mo, T 1945 1 23K G000
Expiry Date of COE Rebate . 06 Dec 2019

Thanks & Best Regards,
Kelvyna Ngian
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