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REPAIR FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT, FRONT RH
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID: 4423M

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: 5GZ1199)

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 13 May 2019

Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: LEXUS 15250 AUTO STD
| Primary Culqu r _SiT-fer

Manufacturing Year: 2007

Engine No.: 4GR03605E_2 -

Chassis No.: JTHBK262005046758 !
- Maximum Power Output: 153.0 kW (205 bhp) |
| Open Market Value: $36,637.00 |
| Original Registration Date: 26 Sep 2007 '
| First Registration Date: 26 Senifiﬂ?

Transfer Count: 2
| Actual ARF Paid: $40,301.00 - |

Intended PARF Rebate Details ]

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: y -

PARF Rebate Amount: £0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details .

COE Expiry Date: 255ep 2022 |
! COE Category: E- Open Categhw .I

COE Perfo_dffear:]: § . ) !

PQP Paid: $25,178.00

COE Rebate Amount: $16,953.00 '
. Total Rebate Amount: $16,953.00 |r
. Message |

| Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further rTenewed. The vehicle must be de—ﬁglm;:d__
upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable}, whichever Is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 13 May 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov. sg/lia/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public BeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION _ID=F03... 13/05/2019



FRE'-RE?"&H! INSPECTION REQUEST - 5GZ1198J vs GBE9294) (Ol) on D.O.A,: 08/05/2018

le'ﬁ Mo, Yinrnd

To ‘mumgrnmentsfiauto com’, Admen A (admne-ad@iauto com| .

Ce Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Kaur, Baljil, Abu Kassim, Noor Maress, Arian, Syaziirding, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Asshweenjsathaur
Sant SMA2010 102741 AM

Aftachmenty 'ﬁi.l.ﬂ.nﬂi

Hi,
Please refer 1o the enclosed request from Cheng Hoe Motor Pre Lid,

Claimno  :26478019155G003 5
Case Owner 1 CHIT YAN FOO ' un

If you have any queries/concerns, please let us know. T IU‘-llﬂ W
Kindly pxsist to assign Kenneth Keng as Single Jolrt Expert as requested 'U oud

Thanks & Regards,

¥in Bul, Hor (Viviane)

AlG

Claim Adjuster ||, Singapate FNOL. Claima Operations — Aulo
¥innd Horifiang, com | werw.aig.1g

From: chmotor@singnet.com.sg [malito:chmator@singnet.cam.sg)

Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2019 10:05 AM

To: Hoe, Yinrul

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-Ying; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azian, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Shang Yang; Mithoosingh,
Aashwesnjestkaur; chmoton@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE GBES294] AND SG21199) ON 0B/0S/2019

Dear Sir,
Our selection as below i~

Kenneth Kong LKE Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Pls assist to armnge for survey asap.

Thanks

Ryds

June

Cheng Hoe¢ Motor Pre Lid
Tel ;67556142

Fax : 67557719

From: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Thu, 16 May 2019 00:58:50 -0000

To: chmotori@singnet.com.sg

Ce: Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Kaur, Baljit, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azxlan, Syazairding, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang,
Mithoosingh, Aashweenjectkaur

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE GBE9294) AND SGZ1199] ON 08/05/2019

Without Prejudice

Your Reference : SGZ1199]

Our Reference : 26470191 5506003
Deear SirMadam,

We refer to vour Notice of Accident of even date.

We intend 10 conduct & pre-repair survey of the damage to your chient's/vour customer’s vehicle jomtly with your client/'your motor workshop, We propose
1o use one of the motor surveyars named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert:




Name of Surveyor Company Name

1 ALG In Mouse Surveyor AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pe Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services
Jeffrey Ong Leng Kint Priority Services
Jimmy Lee Pronty Services
EC Looi Automobile Inspection Services Pre Lid
Pang Kinh Keen (Frankic) Formieam Adjusters Pre Lid
Ng You Han Formteam Adjusters Pie Lud
Soon HanXin (Gary) Farmiteamn Adjusters Pie Lid
Chow Bo Xiong Formieam Adjusiers Pie Lid
Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin) Formteam Adjusiers Piz Lid
Kalvin Ang LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
Xing Guo Chang LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Marcus Chua LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
Mohemad Taufikh LEK Auro Consultums Pre Lid
Adrian Ling LEKEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Muohammed Rasul LEKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
Kenneth Kong LKE Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Ploase let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree (o the sppointment of any of these molor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may
select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost af the pre-repair survey carmied oul by the single joint expert.

Thanks & Regards,

Yin Rul, Hor (Viviana)

AlG

Clairn Adjusier ||, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations = Auto
Yinrid Horiaig, com | Eww.aig.eg

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) [mailto;chmotor@singnet.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2019 6:07 PM

To: Md Ishak, Mohd Imran; Chin, Lee-Ying; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Asshweenjestiaur; Chan, Yoke Shi; Kaur, Balfit; Abu Kassim, Noor Maresa;
Azian, Syazairding

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Repalr Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGZ1199)

This message Is from an external sender; be cautions with links and attachments.

Dear Sir,

OUR CLIENT- 5GZ1153)

DOA - B/5/19 @ 7.45am
You

R INSURED : GBE9294)

Kindly provide us of your surveyor listing for the selection on the survey.
Thank you,

Regards

June

Cheng Hoe Motaor Pte Ltd

Tel ;67556142

Fax : 67557719

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information, If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original
and any copics or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might
affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Ine. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
domage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

Tres information in this emall jand any atlachmants ) is confidontal. If you are not the ntended meciplent, you must nol bse or dissaemenats the mformation. If you have
received this emall in eror, pleass Immediatsly notify me by *Reply” command and permanently delsls the orginal and any coplas or printouts thereol. Afthaugh this email
snd any aftachments am belisved 1o be frae of any virs of other defect thal might affect any computer sysiom into which it is received and opened, if is the responsibility of
the recipient to ansure that il is virus fres snd no responsibility is acospled by Amarican Iniemnational Growp, inc. or ita subsidiaries o affillstes sitfer jontly of sevarmbly, for
any loss or damage arising in any way from s usae,
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PAYMENT ADVICE
Your Ref :
Third party Vehicle No. GBE9294)
Claimant Vehicle No. : SGZ1199])

Accident on 08/05/2019  involving vehicle’'sno.  SGZ1199) &  GBE9294)

along/at 097 BUNGKOK CRESCENT CAR PARK

BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S
1} Repair cost S§ 1070.00 Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
2) Lossof Use S$  0.00 Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
(4 days)
3) Hire of Vehicle S$ 350.00 Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
4) LTA Search S$ 0.00 Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Total SS  1420.00
Service Adviser : LKK

Contact No. o 62563561




5| UNI AVE L. #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX (DA5) 62564313

22 AUGUST 2019

PGI INDUSTRIES PTE LTD By Post & By Emall
20 WOODLANDS LINK

#06-03

SINGAPORE 738733

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/AIG19008700/Khb3
YOUR REF :GBE 92944

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 9294J AND SGZ 1199J ALONG 997 BUANGKOK
CRESCENT CARPARK ON 08.05.2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid to deal with the third

party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body RepairerWorkshop acting on behalf of the owner of
SGZ 1199J against your motor insurance policy,

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable
settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD — it any) may be alfected as a
result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject 1o the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cosl and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AlG’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.



S URIAVE L #11-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 08933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

It you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us
al vicalpeh@ilkkauto.com,

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

¢ Alpeh
Handier
DID: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

(Motor Claims Dept)
soles@pgiindustries. com.sq / diamondfangs@live.com

(Email)



Vic (LKKAuto) e ————

From: Vic [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 7:39 PM

To: sales@pgiindustries.com.sg

Ce: diamondfangs@live.com; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF: GBE 9294) ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 9294) AND SGZ 1199) ALONG

997 BUANGKOK CRESCENT CARPARK ON 08.05.2019

F Ly =

- mmewm Consuffonis
as n Pte Lig

S LWL AVE L #01-25 PAYA UBEINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX : (063) 62564315
22 AUGUST 2019

PGI INDUSTRIES PTE LTD By Post & By Email
20 WOODLANDS LINK

#06-03

SINGAPORE 738733

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/AIG19008700/Khb3
YOUR REF : GBE 9254)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 9294) AND SGZ 1199) ALONG 997 BUANGKOK CRESCENT CARPARK ON 08.05.2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of 5GZ 1199) against your
motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given
us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - if any) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy,

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AIG's prior knowledge and
consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.



In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter{s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us at vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Hest Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

LKK = Save bhe Earth Print only when necessery:

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all aitachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any coplas thereof, Thank you,



| A I G] AUTHORISATION TO ACT

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

I, _ ACL Tunneling Pte Ltd (the third party claimant) of __/ Gambas Crescent
#07-13 ARK@Gambas Singapore 757087 (address), owner of SCZH99 (L hicte noh achiy

authorize __ CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to
SGZ1199) that

my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no.

was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 8/5/2019  (date) along _B87 Buangkok

Crescent Carpark (location) involving vehicle no/s GBE9294J (“the accident”).

i
i

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the
workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s

being made in favour of the workshop.
I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without prejudice

and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle's is

concemned.

Dated this __13 (day) of _May (month) 20_12 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
{with chop if applicable) (with chop)



AIG|

RELEASE VOUCHER -
(AIG Asia Pacific - EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)
“Well, N R L {“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we'| have

reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
£51070.00 (Repar Cost), S5350.00 (Loss of Rental), 550.00 (Disbursement), for vehicle no
SGZ1199) that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred 8/5/2019 (date) along

887 Buangkok Crescent Carpark (location) involving vehicle no/s GBF9294.). This is

pursuant to the inspection conducted on 21/52019 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner ACL Tunneling Pte Ltd

{“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no SGZ1199J make the claim as set out in the above

paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his'her behalf in a manner that we/l deem

fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™

We'l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses

suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage

SGZ1199J (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any ¢laim of
“the third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a

without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same

—

({’f,.;; | kec S y

P

Dated this __ 0% _ (day) of ___ O 0BeR (month) ___2019 1;;.;-:1
1

R -
Signed by-appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Bik 1619, Yishun lndosmal Park A #01-374382, Singapore T68761
TEL: 67556142 (V15) FAX: 67557TI9(YIS) Emull: chmotorisingnet.com sg
GST-200001 1SRE  ROE NOE20 1001 | SKE

M/S:  AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

78 SHENTON WAY

#07-16 AIG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120

TEL: 64193000

FAX: 64153727

ATTN: Motor Claim Department

WS Ref: TP-AIG

Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  08/052019
TP Veh Reg No; GBE9294)

Description

To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour &

miscellaneous charges.

(As recommended by your appointed surveyor)

E &% O.E

F'AX INVOICE
NO: CLE190904
Date: 27 Aug 2019
Policy No: 5103759141
Veh Reg No: SGZ1199]
Make/Model:  TOYOTA LEXUS IS250
AUTO 5TD
Job No: JC1600378
PAGE:]
| Cumntiry | List Price Amount
b} S5
1 PC S8 1,000.00 S8 1,000.00
Total S8 1.000.00
Add GST @ % 70.00
Total Amount payahle S8 1,070.00

For Cheng Hoe Maotor Pre Ltd

L

LA N
W

a'u.l:“}"ﬂ ORISED SIGNATURE



PERFECT DRIVING & SERVICE
38 WOODLANDS IND PARK E1
#05-05 SINGAPORE 757700

TEL - 64585278
OPERATING HOURS :

(ROC/GST NO. S53068827L) MONDAY TO SATURDAY
(8AM TO 6PM)
RENTAL AGREEMENT
[Hirers Name |Cimte of Birtn msspory Wne Ne:
el Tuprelirey Pre A r
A ddress . {Occupabon rw-qk.nlmlhh Obtamed Expiry
Arwmﬁ- ~ [Contazt N '
Joint Hirar s/Guarantors Name Toetm o Birtn
C hen ‘{uw Nen L{l‘ﬂﬂ Ns ﬁ"{*“-) g'ﬂl:{t‘r?%
~ [Cecupaton
p.ncqrn?ﬂ» -B-.mnﬁi‘-*bk- (rm;‘.rw-{' ﬂll-@%}
[contac N
?:l"-'f'?:]"
VEHICLENO. <DE 43 Y LU= 12 ¥xdob1e  ImopEL
[FROM ETURN
CHECKOUT * [™ >ios[1q [™ lo:}h0ar~  [Mileage w| E % % % F
CHECK IN P oyloslid ™ | 13:3¢ [Mileage -
MPORTANT NOTES:- T [UNIT]_[RATE (55) [TOTAL (S3)
1) This vehici s resincied 1o SINGAPOHRE use only TE
2) Oy Parsors atove 26 years of ape wih more ihan 2 yasrs driving sxpenencs, SCOUNT
autharised (censed and signing Ihis sgresment may drive the vehick TQ__-
3] The hirer shall b lable to pary the frst S52000 nsurance palicy exsess OTAL
for demage 10 vafucke ps ©88 of samings whils damaged vehicle is Unoer repsir [EXTENSION
4] Third party Lasbilty m e first $2000.00 in any accident involving Third Party Claims

| Hurer i responible for ol parking fines & fmific summon

1 Vehicie should be relumed at the ssma lime & collection except on Saturday
wihasts retuim tma s before 12pm
Hourly exteraion i charged 8t 148 of the dady rawm

| As preventive manEnance pease check water & engine oil daiy

H thmam_‘.mmmmmmwmﬂ
Pets i Tw car A ceaning charge 53100 will be imposed for smaky or dirty vehicke

10) Flease check that you have not iehl sny of your personal balongings in the
wehicle. Our company and stafl will not be responsdble for any loss of Belongings

11) The vehicls is NOT coversd by & molor insiuisnce policy covering personal accicent
Insurmnce for the hine, his passangons or BUnonsed drfver

131 No repacesTeni of vehicls in any accedent

POSIT (refundable) 5%

[CHANGED OVER FROM VEH DATE

1mmmnwwmmm-mmm

r‘

| "r

L'We have read and agres io the lerms and condrions of the rental agresmant abowve and as set oveneat

A

Himﬂ Joini Hirer's) Guaranior's Signalure




PERFECT DRIVING & SERVICE

38 WOODLANDS IND PARK E1 TAX INVOICE NO. : 180098
#05-05, SINGAPORE 757700 GST Reg No. : 530680271
TEL : 64505278
Bill to ACL Tunneﬂlng Pte Lid DATE 24-May-19
SINO. DESCRIPTIONS UNIT RATE |AMOUNTS
1 SDF43Y 3.5 $100.00 350.00
(21/5/19 to 24/5/19)
NETT 327.10
GST (7%) 22.90
E&OE TOTAL 350.00




Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Faatiane

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING =——
Case  |Mobifed Est Submitied | Ad) Assigned [Az) Rt Adj Submitted | s Auth'ed Status
|08 May 2019 BRI sg100000  |$$1,000.00 Ty vor- e
S Bag | e | gon Esimates | | View Aot Cancet Case. |

|[Croated by adjuster]

Insured: PGI INDUSTRIES PTE LTD, Co. Rég. Moo 159401153
e . |ACT TUNNELING PTELTD, Co. Reg. Mo.: 2013244230
Vehicle fleg, | b8/05/2019 07:00 - :59
No.: $GZ1199] Date of LoSE: | 439 Montts and 32 Days From LTA Rag Date (Man Yr)]
Clsim Type: | TP / 26478019155G noch/COVEr | 2100463824 (Comprehensive) I
Wehicle Reg Foficy o
M. GBE9IS4) oy No. i giorse141 |
{ Insaared): [Claimant): ,
1

Repairer: Cheng Hos Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun) Blk 1019 e01-374/362, Yishun Industrial Park A, 768761 Yishun - Ted; 6755 61432

HANEINE | AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Handied by Foo, ChIt Yan] Chityan Foo@aig.com

E:'J'r:ft'i MTUC Incame Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel

Adjuster: | LKK Autw Conwultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561  |Handied by KENNETH KONG] | Final Rpt due 28/05/2018)

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case man |
Thare ane na mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Seorcn Tases | Create Mew Taix | cComplete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Mandler Assigned By Completed On Croated On ~ Done?
No results.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 17/10/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5G21199) (26478019155G)
[GBE9294]]
TP
ACT TUNNELING PTE LTD
May 8 2019 7:00AM
[PGI INDUSTRIES PTE LTD]
Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid

Page 1 of 2

View |View n Broeser | v

Letters/Correspondences I_LE_H!! e
Mo | Fialieed On LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ] Thumbnail | Print
1 |(Draft) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown [ : BT
il [perpsge (V] &
Ko | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbsnall | Print
! |22/08/19 16:34 | Odometer Reading Q| tceaws | &
(@ |22/08/1919:34 | Chassis Number '@ | toadirs | F
3 |2/081515:34 | General View 0| wears | @A
(4 |22/08/1319:30 | General View @ | wadws | B
|5 | 22/08/19 19:34 Ganeral View 0 | et | A
& |23/08015 1904 | General View Q| waewc | B4
7 lz208/19 1932 | General View D | lcadrs | M
& |22/08/1919:34 | General View © | weorc | B
9 | Za/08/19 19:34 Ganeral View 0| wcaawc | BB
10 |Z2/08/19 19:34 | Ganeral View 0| wuws | &
11 |22/08/19 18:34 | General View 0| wews | &
12 | 7omi10 19:34 General View 0| tadws | A
13 |23/06/19 18:34 | General View 0| teepwc | BA
Documentation [i per page _E [}
No | Relabel/Recrder | LK Auto Consultants Pre Lid (HQ) Thimbnall | Print
1 |16/05/19 1524 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 16052019 @ | oea oF

7 |16/05/1% 1524 | TP GIA REPORT © | Loacor

3 |24/05/19 17:02 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF

& |I3/08/1919:33 | LETTER TO 01 Load POF

§ |22/08/19 19:40 | EMAIL TO OL Load POF

6 [17/10/1809:11 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load FOF

7 [17/10/1309:12 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM 0 | e

|8 |17/10/19 09112 Roleass Voucher Lead POF

5 [17/10/19 09:02 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load FOF

10 |1710/1909:12  |LoB ) | Load POF

Mo | Finalized On AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |17/05/19 10:46 | OT GIA report | @ | Load PoF

Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST pesst | save | P |

There are no document checklists configured.

Cur Checkilst Remarks - LEK Aute Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer
Wom . Rareaery gre (e slE uiieid yad Bide T ID s paree

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 17/10/2019
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Preview

Page | of 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: GBE9294J (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA LEXUS 2.5 15250
§GZ1199J (TP veh) (A)

| Date of Accident: | 08/05/2019

Globai Sum Settiement [ < | [ ] Yes | [x] No

Repair Estimate 3 1,976.53

Final Repair Cosl 3 1,070.00

lLoss of Use 5 days at 30.00 per day

Rental (if any) $ 35000| 35 days

LTA !/ GIA Search Fee - 0.00

Others 5 0.00

B

Final Settlement Sum 5 1.420.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X] YES5 [ ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liabllity (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Ne BOLA Scenario No

22

Assessed Liability (*)

(%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA doas not apply.

Remarks

Paymant Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Cheng Hoe Mator Pia Lid

1,420.00

2)

JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

17 Oct
2016

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report! Bill (if any)

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 17/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1sse071888)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@lkkauto com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AIG18008700/KHB302

Date: 17/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Palicy No: 2100463824
Claimant &
Vehicle No : S5GZ1194J Insured Vehicle No : GBES294)
Date of Loss: Daosz018 Mature of Claim: " Claim No: 264780181556
Rl I Fl |
Reg No: 5GZ1199)
Make & Model: TOYOTA LEXUS, 2.5 15250 (A) Engine No 4GRO360502
Reg. Date; 26/09/2007 (Man, Year: 2007) Chassis No: JTHBK262005046758
Colour: Metallic Siver Odometer: 218878 km
Engine Capacity: 2500 cc
Market Value/New Car
Pri NIA
rice
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size: 2255 R17 Rear Tyre Size:; 225/45 R17
Front Left Side; Michelin & mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 6 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above values regresant the remarung fyre freads depih
COSTOFCLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference DIff %
Parts 847 22 503.57 25385 2094
Miscellanaous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaur 1.000.00 B70.00 330.00 33.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 1,847.22 1,263.57 5831.65 31.60
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) 1,000.00
(S%) 1.847.22 1,000.00 B47.22 45 86
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 129.31 70.00 59.31 4587
Nett Amount (5§) 1,976.53 1,070.00 806.53 45.86
+ Car Rental (3.5 x 55100.00/day) (S5) 350.00
MNatt Liability (5%5) 1,420.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 16/05/2018
Date Inspectad: 211052018 Inspected At: Cheng Hoe Mator Ple Ltd (Yishun)
Blk 1019 #01-374/382, Yishun
Industrial Park A
Singapore TE8T761
Estimated Period of Repair 3.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 17/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE. This repor! represents our findings af the lime snd plsce of inspection stated horsin. Sueh inspection has been camied oul fo the bes! of our
knowledge and abilty but any other lisbility under any ofhar circometances fs hereby axprassly archaded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 17/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PariMNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Buckled 706,80 FL *T06.80FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER RH SIDE RETAINER Distoried 6363FL *B3.B3FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER RH FOG LAMP Serviceable 338 20FL *-FL
4 B *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 21.00FL *21.00FL
F=Franchiss part L=LisiitemDisc
Sub Total (5%) 1,129.63 791.43
- List tem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S5§) 282.41 187.86
Total Parts (S$) B47.22 583.57

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 17/10/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellanscus items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repalrer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 REMOVE AND REFIX FRONT BUMPER ASSY LKNOCK New 400.00 250.00
AND REPAIR FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT ,FRONT
RH FENDER AND REALIGN THE SAME
2 PUTTY AND RESPRAY ON FRONT MNew 600.00 420.00
BUMPER .REINFORCEMENT ,FRONT RH FENDER
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,000.00 670.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. -[
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 17/10/2019



