Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May, 2019 9:18 AM

To: 'peter.wang@axa.com.sg'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: C0324193 WP (NR) / Trans-Cab Auto / P1366846 / OD SKH6615P / TP

Attachments: Email to AXA to temporary close SHD 5128S 28.10.15.pdf; LKK Inspection
Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustmentl.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; Preliminary Advice - SHD
5128S.pdf

Your Ref : C0324193
Our Ref : CC3/AXA14022581/Kwa3

Dear Peter

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 6615P AND SHD 5128S ON 27/11/2014 ALONG LOWER DELTA RD

We refer to the above matter

This is a head-to-rear collision.

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.
We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$ 14,170.01 S$ 8,039.81
2. Loss of RENTAL ($150.00 x 3 days ) S$  560.00 S$  450.00 ( Surveyor recommend 3 days)
3. GIA SEARCH S$ 2.00 S$ 2.00

S$ 14,732.01 S$ 8,491.81

Amount of claim at liability 100% S$ 8,491.81

For your approval please.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 17 May, 2019 3:22 PM

To: peter.wang@axa.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: C0324193 WP (NR) / Trans-Cab Auto / P1366846 / OD SKH6615P / TP

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Peter
We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that TP submitted LOD and agree on direct settlement.

As such we will process to settle with TP .

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



