Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 7:28 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Acknowlegement Your ref : SMK5980B  Our ref : SOMOINHHMC/KC *** L KK

REF: CC4/ASM19008661/ga3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident and we are currently pending verification for direct
settlement.

Please provide us the following and arrange for TP survey.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo.

PIR result (if any)

Estimated cost of repair

GIA / police report

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Cecilia at 6749 4274.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2019 9:22 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Cc: KUMAR Shailendra <shailendra.kumar@axa.com.sg>

Subject: SMK5980B & SHD9056P DOA 14.05.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survey our client's car : SMK5980B . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

HP: 92712214



