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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

https:/fvrlita.gov.sg/lla/vri/action/enquire Kepate By FublicHelore,

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Business

Owner |D: 4400C

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GZ13118

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended 21 May 2019

Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: DYNA 150D

Primary Colour: Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2005

Engine No.: 515618700

Chassis No.: JTFUF34Y203011167

Maximum Power .

Output:

Open Market Value: $23,690,00

Original Registration 21 Dec 2005

Date:

First Registration Date: 21 Dec 2005

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,185.00

lofl

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry

Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 20 Dec 2020

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle &
Bus

COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $22.416.00

COE Rebate Amount: $7,077.00

Total Rebate Amount: $7,077.00

Message

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory
lifespan (if applicable) of the vehicle.

The information contained herein Is correct as at 21 May 2019

OK

21/5/2019, 9:16 ar
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We specialise in repaining all kinds of vehicies and pre-inspection senicing
We also undertake accident insurance clalms for our customers

woA B
_SIONG LEE MOTOR

g Company Feg Mo, 10083800

5in Ming AutoCity

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-07 Singapore 575722
Tel: 6457 0410, 6453 1255 Fax: 6552 0692

17 May 2019

ATTN: MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT

ATTN: TAN BROS GAS SUPPLY

H/P: 9105 5622

Dear Sirs /| Madam,

Accident Claim for Vehicle No.GZ 1311 L , Involving Vehicle No.SLH 8441 Z.

Accident on 09 MAY 2019, AT FARLEIGH ROAD (IN FRONT HOUSE NO.36)

With reference to the above vehicle. We hereby submit a list of parts required
to be changed and append below the charges for changing and repairing ;

NO|PARTS REPLACEMENT QTY LIST PRICE
1 |TAILGATE STOPPER PILLAR 1PC $ vl 14523
2 |TAILGATE STOPPER IPC | $ wl - 130.50
3 |TAILGATE SAFETY LOCK IPC |8 h1~ 220.45
4 |REAR SIDE BOARD 1PC > £« 1,600.00
TOTAL LIST PRICE $ & 1613 2,096.18
LESS 20% $ aq L4 (419.24)
TOTAL AMOUNT $ L9, 1,676.94
LABOUR:
1 |LABOUR TO SPRAY PAINT S 28 100.00
2 ILABOUR TO PANEL BEATING S <ed  380.00
LABOUR TO DISMANTLE AND REFIX SIDE BOARD ,
3 ] Joo 200.00
WOOD.
TOTALLABOUR| 8§ +55° 980.00
TOTALAMOUNT| § 14| 9% 2,656.94
LKK Auto Consultants henca nolify . gl
THANK YOU the Repairer of (he following: T4 M)f n G344 "IHI Gf /L;“”f'f-
 To resurvey Delore aRET spray pasbng W
. :; Arpiy Apmaged D] Lng MeSarvy "4( ] “ - ;_‘/ < f?gL
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SIONG LEE MOTOR 5o ndoukire) i bl ey [ Zﬂ“ﬁn
-Su';_hf TaErlniry omi jt O LI I-I'Il’
Mr Tan Leng Huat ssarasiy oo vy Spdmios 10 om st Jauf L.m m‘ G e
Ackrowledned by Recare e, :-‘Iu}
Eagrire. »'J
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- PRE:REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — GZ13118 vs SLHS441Z (O1) on D.O.A. 09/05/2010

From.  Hor, Yol

T, ‘msmigreranisiBibendo con, Admin A (Egmin-aiikkeutn com)

ce Fang, Andy-8Y, Chin Lse-Ying, Kaur, Baljll Ahy Kessir. Nooe Mariisa, Axlsn, Syazaisdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lin Sheng Yang, Mihoosingh, Axkbwesenjoe(ksur
Sent NS00 820:2T7 AM

Anschients: %) 37as 01,20 3738 001!

Hi,

Please refer 1o the enclosed request from CHEONGHOH LAW CORPORATION,
Kindly garry out Policy coverage verification [irst before conducting the pre-repair inspection within 48 hours

If you have any quenes/concemns, please let us know.
Kindly azslst to assign Kenneth Kong s Single Joint Expert ar requerted.

Thaniks & Aegards,

Yin Rul, Hor (Viviane)

AlG

Claim Agjustes I, Singapare FHNOL. Clasns Dperatinns -~ Allo
Moneil Moriaig cors | s 0.5

From: mail@cheonghoh.sa [mallto:mall@cheonghoh.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2019 5:09 PM

To: Hor, Yinrul

Ce: Fang, Andy-5Y; Chin, Les-Ying; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Markesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh,
Aashweenjestkaur

Euhju:l: RE: Ae: PRE-REPAIR INSFECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLHB441Z AND GZ13118 ON 09/05/2019 (Or ref:
LCH.Ig/SMSL-90385.15)

Drcar Sirs.

Our client confirm that you are nominating Kenneth Kong named in the list of surveyors to conduct the pre-repair survey and appointed as
the “Single Joint Expert”.

From: Hor, Yinmul

Sent: Tue, 14 May 2019 08:31:10 <0000

To: Cheonghoh Law

Ce¢: Fong, Andy-SY. Chin, Lee-Ying, Kaur, Baljit, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang,
Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur

Subject: RE: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCTDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLHB441Z AND GZ1311B ON
09052019 (Or ref: LCH.1g/SMSL-90358.19)

Dear Sir'™Madam,

Please confirm that you are nominating Keaneth Kong named in the list of surveyors 1o conduct the pre-repair survey and appointed as the
“Single Joint Expert”

Thanks & Regards,

¥in Rul, Hor (Viilana|
AlG ()
Claim Adjusler |l. Singanore FNOL. Claims Opersilons = Auln \}d \,ﬂ O i

Yinrut HooB s com | s 80,50

Fram: Cheanghoh Law [mailto:mall@cheonghoh.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2019 4:28 PM

To: Hor, Yinrul

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-Ying; Kaur, Ballit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoasingh,
Azshweenjeetkaur

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLHS441Z AND GZ13118 ON 09/05/2019 (Or rel;
LCH.Ilg/SMSL-50388.19)

This message Is from an external sender: be cautious with links and attachments.



Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter and to your email of 13 May 2019.

Our client hereby nominate Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto Censultants Pte Lid named in paragraph 2 of your said emall to conduct
the pre-repair survey of the damages to our client's vehicle arising out of the above menticned accident.

Please be contact our cliant’s workshop, Siong Lee Motor, 160 Sing Ming Drive #02-07 AutoCity Singapore 575722 for tha
survey of GZ 1311 B, (vehicle will b in on Friday - 17 May 2018 @10:30am)

Contact Person : Mr Tan | Ms Kwee Pin
Telephone : 6453 1255

Kindly proceed 1o do the needful,

Thanks & regards
Catherine

CHEONGHOH LAW CORFORATION

Bk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05

Singapore 160053

T: 6337 §700 | F: 6337 3700 | E: mail@cheonghoh.sg

On 14 May 2019, at 4:12 PM, Hor, Yinrul <Yinol Hor@ajg com™ wrote:

<logo jpeg> <lock gif>

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

UEREmEEL. WERIELELE. WIFAHH.

fifamsinwiarunlaaafudanuvidmlady (Rodulu
Tidatwdfuuwmn

0|2 erfoi D UBoHE GAIRIEUCEL I3F Hed
PEF OIS Lot

Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya,
membuka attuchment.

Click here by 2019-05-21 16:12 +08 10 read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More infg

Paglibiner Thes evmdbl upl b8 commimm sez il el mivemicl salels foe e gs sl ap
pllibgssey Messe bl i seindio of voig have s¢oaiood iBds gmmisl (s oo i sospdy dodeie o

Prmerdiviniod Fuerypbsens.  sprynighin [ 2000301 T Frongpeiot. I Al nglise

o] by

TaTaalyl
<SecureMessageAiimi>

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The nformation i this email (and any anachmems) s confidenual, I you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original
and any copics or printouts thereof. Although this emnil and any sttachments are believed to be free of any vinus or other defect that might
affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the reciplent 1o ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affilistes cither jointly or severally. for any loss or
damage anising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

Thae information in this email {and any sttachmenis) is confidential. If you are nof the intended recipiant. you must nol use or disseminate the information. [T you have
recetyed this amall in eror, please immadiataly notity me by Feph” command ang permanently delete the anginal and any copies or printouts therso!. Although this email
and any atachmants ares bolieved 1o be free of any virus or oiter defect thel might affect any computer system inlo which il is received and cpened, il is the responsibility of



Ire recipient io engure thal il s virus free and no responsihilily s scosptad by Ametican intermalionasl Group. Inc. of iis subsidiades or alliliates sither jointly or sevarally. for
any leas of dnmage ansing in sy way from s se

From: Yirrul Hor{aig com

To: mail@cheonghoh.sg

Ce: Ancy-5Y FongEaig.com Lea-Ying Chinaig.com Baljil.Kaun@sig com Nooraresa AbukassimBalg.com Syarairdina AzlanBaig.com yokeshi.chanakg.com
Limiaig com Asshweanjeetaur MihoosinghiSaig com

Subjpct: aigancrypt PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING QUR INSURED VEHICLE SLHE441Z AND GZ13118 ON 0S0S2018

Dwte: Man, 13 May 2019 08.11;38 «0000

Without Prejudice

Your Reference - LCH 1g/SMSL-90368.19
Our Reference  SLHS441Z

Dear Sir/Madam.

We refer 1o your Notice of Accident of even date

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to vour client"s'your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. 'We propose
Lo ube one of the molor surveyors named in the sttached list 1o conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single juint expert:

Name of Surveyor Company Name

AlG In House Surveyor AlG Asin Pacilic Insurance Pte Lid
Lawrence Ny Chun Kee Priority Services

leffrey Ong Leng Kial Priority Services

Jimmy Lee Priority Services

EC Looi Automobile Inspretion Services Pra Lud
Pang Kiah Keen (Frankic) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Ng You Han Formteam Adjusters Pic Lid

Soon HanXin (Gary) Formeam Adjusiers Pre Lud

Chow Bo Xiong Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid

Chua 500 Teck (Benjumin) Formtewn Adjusters Ple Lid
Kalvin Ang LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Xing Guo Qiang LEK Auto Consuliants Pte Lid
Marcus Chua LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Mohamad Taufikh LEK Auto Comhants Ple Ltd
Adnan Ling LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Mohammed Rasul LEK Auo Consuliams Pre Ltd
Kenneth Kong LEK Auto Consuliants Ple Lid

Please let us know within two (2) workimg days whether you agree to the appomtment of any of these motor surveyors as a single jomt expert. You may
select ong or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey camed out by the single joint expert,

Thanks & Regards,

Yin Ridl, Hor [Vivinme)

AlG

Clam Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operatons — Auta
Yool HooSae.com | pew 0.5

From: Cheonghoh Law [malito: mall@cheonghoh.sg]

Sant: Monday, May 13, 2019 3:41 PM

To: Supramaniam, Darshene; Loo, Kar Yong

Cc: Tan, Lily (AlG); Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Lim, Sheng Yang; Md Ishak, Mahd Imran; Chan, Yoke Shi; Supramanizm, Darshene; Chin, Lee-Ying
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: PES for GZ 1311 B accident involving vehicle SLH B441 Z on 9 May 2019 along Farkeigh Road - Infront House No.36 (Our ref:
LCH.Ig/SM51 -50368.19)

This message is from an external sender; be cautions with links and attachments.
Desar Sirs,
We enclosed herewith our letier of PRS and await your urgent reply

Thanks & regards

Catherine

CHEONGHOH LAW CORPORATION
Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-03
Singapore 160053

T: 6337 8700 | F: 6337 3700 | E: mall@cheonghoh.sg



Begin forwarded message:

From: [maming26@singtel.com sg
Suohject: Attached Image
Date: |3 May 2019 g 3:28:16 PM SGT

To: "maili@cheonghoh” <mail@cheonghoh.sg>



51172018 Menmen a-Clams

View Received Message

Trus masl s assocaied with ;

“GE13118 (440068510656
[SLHBa41Z]
™
TAN BROS GAS SUPPLY
Mgy B 2019 11:004M
[Cria LingXian]
Siong Lee Motor

Ritply | Hecly All | Merk @3 Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_5G), «=nt on 16/05/2019 10:37 AM.
To LWK_HG
Subject  No GIA report

Hhi

Plu be advice that na Ol GIA report recelved

Mz find Ol details below for your further actions
Q) name : Chis LingXian

Acaress

3 Farigigh Ave

Sngapore 55T

Thans yaw;

Regurds,
chan yoke &

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
Thers are Mo cocuments

nitps Vsingapore. menmen comiclaims/index cim?usebor=SVCmallAuseaclion=dsp_viewbmode=14inboxid=14832078 Domainld=114100)Id=84 12



B 74 78"

LEIAYVE b, @028 PAY A UREISUUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE JUSSLE TEL @ (065 62563561 FAX @ (D05) 62564515

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19008649/1h3
17 May, 2019

Chia LingXian
34 Farleigh Ave
Singapore 557870

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 1311B AND SLH 84417 ON 09/05/2019 ALONG/
AT FARLEIGH ROAD (INFRONT HOUSE NO.36)

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd has beéen appointed to act on the behall of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location,

Kindly proceed to lodge vour GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The
GIA report can be lodged al any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your
Centificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

Il you have any information to add or any mendments to make, please contact the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premuum & eic
would be affected.

Yours Faithfully,

Al

L]

Jov Irene

Claims

Tel : 6841 2409

Fax: 6741 4108

Emadl @ jovirene @ 1kkauto.com

e Claims Manager
AlG Asia Pacific Inswrance Pre Lid
{Maorar Claims Depr)



Menmen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

(L1

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case  |Notified  |Est Submitted  |AdjAssigned | Adj Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Authed Status
16 May 2018 | 15 May 2039 $$750.00 $5750.00 Panding for Busvey
| _sene | | sy ton txtimarns | | o R0t | Report
| Edit Adj Rpt | [ Cancel Case |

Reference Claim Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
CHIA LINGXIAN, 10: 58620524F

TAN BROS GAS SUPPLY, Co. Heg. No.: 166744000

. |09/05/2019 11:00 - {59
GZ13118 Date of LosS: |1y ooy Manthe and 18 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}]

TP / 44006852065G FoMYEaver | (Comprenensive)

| Palicy Ma.
SLHB4412 (Claimant): 5107823946

Excess:
Siong Lee Motor 160 Sin Ming (HQ) 160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-07 AutoCity, 575722 Sin Ming - Tei:
illﬂ Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Expross) - Tel 65-641%-3000 .. [Handled by Foo, Chit Yan] Chityvan. Foo@alg.com

imucmmmm Co-operative Lid (HQ) - Tel!
Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] ... [Final Rpt due

/LXK Auto
| 27/05/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED B View Al ] cmmac.-mr]

+ AIG_SG (J0/05/2013): Re: No GIA report
|+ AIG_SG (16/05/201%): No GIA report

— =

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— View Al | Search Tasks | Create wew Task | cComptete |
| Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Craated On Done?

[ Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 29/8/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*GZ1311B (44006B52065G)
[SLHB4412Z]
TF
TAN BROS GAS SUPPLY
May 9 2019 11:45AM
[CHIA LINGXIAN]
Siong Lee Motor 160 Sin Ming

Upioad Docummnts | _Uplosd photos | Compose New Loter | upiuad vides | _upioad Audio |

Page | of 2

Video
No_[Finslized On [LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print |
| D4/06/19 11:57 | FROM INSURED 0 | Loearov

Photos/Images Sperpsge  |v] M
(No_|Mielabel/Aeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail_Print
1 |B3/06/1% 08:43 | Odometer Reading 0 | eaws | &
2 |03/06/19 0B:43 | Chassis Number D | woawrs & |
3 |03/06/19 08143 | General View 0| wadwc | A |
4 |03/06/1% 0B:43 | Ganeral View 0 | eaws B
5 |03/06/19 08:43 | General View O | v | B |
& |D1/06/19 08:43 General View - 0 | Load G | =
2 fqﬂﬁfm 08:43 | General View 0| weaws &
8 |03/06/19 08:43 | General View 0 | weaws B
8 |D3/06/19 0B:43 | General View 0| woaws | & |
10 |03/06/19 06:43 | General View 0 | wedrvs | B
11 [03/06/15 08:43 | General View 0 | i | &
12 |03/06/19 06:43 | General View B ceaws | &
13 |03/06/15 08:41 | General View 0 | e | @
14 |03/06/18 08:43 | Genersl View 0 | aaws | A
15 [03/06/19 06:43 | Genersl View B | waows | B4
'u | D3/06/15 DB: 43 General View D | wedwc | A
17 03/06/18 08:43 | Geners! View 0D | s | A
18 00619 08:43 | Genersl View 0| eaws | @
Documentation iperpage V) B4
Llﬂ_;l.lll“fﬂm LKK mmumm:m Thumbmall | Print
1 15/05/1917:59 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 15052019 @ | LosaroF

'1__ 15/05/19 17:59 MOTICE & GIA REPORT 8 Load POF

3 [17/05/1% 09:48 | Mon reporting letter Load POF

4 |22/05/19 09:37 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED ) | Losa FOF
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Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks Ta: L] Handling Insurer
Pinte Ramarks 8 pAYElE unleis yOu Bhow 1L D eI perbes
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KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg ne 1sse0718sm)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-35681 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@ikkauto com;assignmeniz@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CS/AIG1800868409/T18302
Data: 28/0872018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Lid, Palicy No:
LR Ve 23118 Insured Vehicle No:  SLHB441Z
Date of Loss: Da/052018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 440068520656
DESCRIPTION & | IFICATI F VEHI
Reg No GZ1311B
Make & Model: TOYOTA DYNA 1.5T, 3.0 (A) Engine No: 5L5618700
Reg. Date: 21/12/2005 (Man. Year: 2005) Chassis No: JTFUF34Y203011167
Colour: Blue Odomeler. 782207 km
Engine Capacity- 2886 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: NIA
Sum Insured (5§) Market Value/New Car Price
NDITI I
Geanaral Condition: Slearing (Serviceabls). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification; No Pre-accideni Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185 R14 Rear Tyre Size 155 R12
Front Left Side Yokohama 6 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 6 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama & mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 6 mm
The above valtes mpresant e rermaaing (e eads dephh
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 1,676.94 306.94 1,280.00 76.33
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 980,00 5§50.00 430.00 43 B8
Faintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Tolal (S5) 2,656.94 846.94 1,710.00 64.36
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) 750.00
(5%) 265694 750.00 1,906.94 71.77
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 185.89 5250 133.40 71.77
Nett Amount (S§) 2,842.93 B02.50 2,040.43 ™I
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 15/05/2018
Date Inspected: 17052018 Inspected Al Siong Lee Motor 160 Sin Ming (HQ)
180 Sin Ming Drive, #02-07 AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 29/8/2019
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Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Lau Shu Pei

NOTE This report nepresents our findings ar e ime and place of inspection atated heren, Such mapection has been carmed cul fo the best of owr
knowiedpe and ability but any other leblily under any other circumsiances is hereby axpressly srcluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part Mo, Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *TAILGATE STOPPER PILLAR Bant 14523 FL “145.23FL
2 1 ‘TAILGATE STOPPER Cut 130.50 FL *130.50FL
3 1 *TAILGATE SAFETY LOCK Bent 220.45FL 22045FL
4 1 *REAR SIDE BOARD Repair 1,600.00 FL *-FL
FaFranchse parl L=LiatiemDis
Sub Total (S§) 2,096.18 496.18
- List ltem Discount on L [tems 20.00/20.00% (SS§) 419.24 99.24
Total Parts (S$) 1,676.94 396.94
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellansous lHems solected

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR TO SPRAY PAINT MNew 400.00 250.00

2 LABOUR TO PANEL BEATING New 380.00 200.00

3 LABOUR TO DISMANTLE AND REFIX SIDE BOARD WOOD New 200.00 100.00
Gross Labour Cost (S85) 980.00 550.00

[ Repon was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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