Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2019 1:00 PM

To: Admin nht

Cc: Admin A; Chloe

Subject: RE: YP9511C & SGQ 5255B on 14/05/19 //LKK REF:CC4/EGI19008622/Akb3

YOUR REF: SGQ 5255B

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,206.00
2. Loss of Use (8 days x $ 80.00) $ 640.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 7.45

TOTAL | $ 6,853.45

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2019 12:20 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>

Subject: Re: YP9511C & SGQ 5255B on 14/05/19 //LKK REF:CC4/EGI19008622/Akb3

Without Prejudice
Hi Khanchna

So far for our LOD we never breakdown of loss of use amount x no of days and there was no issue for your side till date.
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Please kindly check with your senior or admin team,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax:67417276

On Wed, Jul 17, 2019 at 12:14 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

YOUR REF: SGQ 5255B

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

We refer to the above matter and your LOD dated 8/7/2019.

Please provide us the breakdown for Loss of Use (i.e. no of days x $ amount).

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank you.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



