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Yourrel:  To Be Advised
Crur rel: CCHQBE1 900862 1/K b3

The Motor Cloms Departiment

Mis QBE INSURANCE (INTERNATIONAL) LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,

We reler to the above matter,

Dute:

GXMI9Y

VHE | RISRAN)E

23.05.2019

Please be inlormed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 22.05.2019
at the premises of M/s Siong Lee Motor and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount .58 649176
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 344954
"Check” llems Amount : 5% 138579
Murket Vilue 1 85§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 88
Nett Vilue 5% -

o
Description of Damage: 1 -
The vehicle sustained damages at the Al ___ 18 1§
Front Portion —
Comments/Present Stuius:
Damuges Consistent
Estimated normal peniod forrepmrs: - 4 days

Yours Gaithfully.,

KENNETH KONG
Livensed Appraiser



woF B %
SIONG LEE MOTOR

Sin Ming AutaCity

1]
& w 160 Sin Ming Drive #02-07 Singapore 575722
Tel: 6457 0410, 6453 1255 Fax: 6552 0692

We specialise in repairing all kinds of vehiclas and pre-inspection servicing.
We also undenake accident insurance claims for our customars

Company Rag Mo 10083800

22 May 2019 : Vo7 /4744:!-!?;!
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Elly. §320(
ATTN: ALPHA FUMIGATION SERVICES PTE LTD ’%"% At Ly
H/P: 6465 5787

Cot,

Dear Sirs / Madam,

Accident Claim for Vehicle No.GX 3419 Y , Involving Vehicle No.SLL 3363 G.

Accident on 07 MAY 2019, AT 5 TUKANG INNOVATION GROVE.

With reference to the above vehicle. We hereby submit a list of parts required
to be changed and append below the charges for changing and repairing ;

|HD PARTS REPLACEMENT QTY LIST PRICE
1 [FRONT BUMPER Z-2¢ _ IPC | $ Her 1,341.50{
' 2 |[FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT %% ¢31-Jv IPC | % Z,590.70¢
3 [FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET 2PCS | $ 217 320.10 ¢
5 |[FRONT GRILLE IPC | $ P4.m 52040 ¢
6 _|[FRONT GRILLE BADGE IPC | $ Ae. 38.20 [
7 |HEADLAMP E3HFTel) Yo c/) M4 h 2PCS | $ AL 774 ) 1,380.00 T
8 |[FRONT BONNET I50-% IPC | $ 2  1,201.104
9 [FRONT BONNET HINGES 2PCS | $ 7T 480.20 ¥
10 [FRONT BONNET LOCK IPC | $ /2 250.10
11|FRONT BONNET LOCK PILLAR & 2 120.80
TOTAL LIST PRICE $ 6,252.20
LESS 20%| 7% /5? $ (1,250.44)
TOTAL AMOUNT $ 5,001.76
LABOUR :
1 |LABOUR TO SPRAY PAINT 5 Fop/ 75000
2 |LABOUR TO PANEL BEATING % E5er 700,00
3 [LABOUR TO FOCUS HEADLAMP, ' - L Ze/ 4000
- TOTALLABOUR| $ 1,490.00
TOTAL AMOUNT| $ 6,491.76
THANK YOU o Thied _ '
FROM: |

SIONG LEE MOTOR
Mr Tan Leng Huat



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 8:42 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW:Yr ref: V0021292 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX3419Y & SLL3363G ON 07.05.2019

(Or ref: LCH.lg/SMSL-90367.19)

Best Regards,

$hu Pel| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkauto. com | fax: 6741-4108
Blie 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Lbl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $/408533)

From: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qgbe,com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 8:30 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Yr ref: V0021292 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX3419Y & SLL3363G ON 07.05.2019 (Or ref: LCH.Ig/SMSL-
50367.19)

Our Ref. V0021292

Hi

Please assist to arrange for TP survey on WP basis. FYl our Insured has yet to report.

Thanks & Bast rl‘!_—’:_._rIIE

Joyce Foo

Senior Assistant

Claims Dept/Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapora D48583
+85 64771184 | +65 62246633

Wabsile Linkedin Twwittey

@ QBE \Jol O

From: Cheonghoh Law <mail@cheonghoh.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 5:14 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo B.Ccom>
Subject: Re: Yr ref: V0021292 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX3419Y & SLL3363G ON 07.05.2019 {Or ref: LCH.lg/SMS5L-
90367.19)



Dear Sirs,
We-refer to the above matter and to your email of even date.

Our client hereby nominate LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd named in paragraph 2 of your said email to
conduct the pre-repair survey of the damages to our client’s vehicle arising out of the above mentioned
accident.

Please be contact our client's workshop, Siong Lee Motor, 160 Sing Ming Drive #02-07 AutoCity Singapore
575722 for the survey of GX 3419 Y.

Contact Person :MrTan { Ms Kwee Pin
Telephone 6453 1255

Kindly proceed to do the needful.

Thanks & regards

Catherine

CHEONGHOH LAW CORPORATION

Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05

Singapore 160053

T:6337 8700 | F: 6337 3700 | E: mail@cheonghoh.sg

On 14 May 2019, at 4:12 PM, Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our ref : VO021292

Dear Sirs’Madam

We refer to the above captioned matter

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle. We propose 1o use
one of the motor survevors named in the anached list:

COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pte Lid
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte Lid

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Priority Services

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any
of these motor survevors
FYl Our insured has yet to report the accident.

hamas & Bast Regerd

Joyce Foo

Senior Assistant

Claims Dept/Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower. Singapore 048583
2



+55 64771184 | +65 62246633
™ Website Lirvkadin Twitter

<image001.png>

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you ara not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also deiete this email and destroy any hard coples produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this emall is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: twinauto@singnet.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 15 Movember 2019 2:35 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Ce: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GX3419Y // DOA: 07/05/2019
Dear Shu Pel

We would like to accept the amount @ $3200.00 / 4days .

Thank you,
Regards.

Siong Lee Motor
Tel: 6457 0410

On Fri Nov 15 2019 09:34:24 GMT+08B00 (Singapore Standard Time) Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Original Message ——-—--

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
For COR, L/sum 53,200.00 — 4 repair days.

Please confirm.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms)

| Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com

| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Parck, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL:

6256 2561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-880T1B8-R

Affillated to Federation Internationala Des Experts En Aulomobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD Ref CS/QOBE19008621/Kb3q2
it ous: oz [N
Code: QBE
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLL 3363C Veh. Inspected GX 3416
Policy No. 8-V0021202-MVA Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Vo0212%92 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JOYCE Assign Date 15/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN P/UP c.c 2664
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2004
Chassis No. JN1CHGD22Z0072706 Colour SILVER
Odometer 723817 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General G000
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R14X8 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185 R14XB YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185R14X8 BRIDGESTONE 3 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[185R14X8 BRIDGESTONE 3mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/05/2019 Inspection Date 22/05/2019
Survey held at 160 SIN MING DRIVE #02-07
Repairer SIONG LEE MOTOR
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




Jy ” ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
F-1

-5V 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 19860T198R GST Reg. No. 16-8607196-R Page No. 1 ol 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GX 3419Y

Qty Description of Parts Condition _ Whrlhhup?;}} | &[’:il
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED 1.341 80 682.20
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 589.70 432 80
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET DISTORTED 320.10 320.10
1|FRONT GRILLE MTG CRACKED 520.40 520 40
1|FRONT GRILLE BADGE MECESSARY 3820 38.20
1|HEADLAMP MTGE CRACKED 1.380.00 417 50
1|FRONT BOMNET BENT 1,201.10 B50.40
Z|FRONT BONNET HINGES TC REPAIR SEE 4B0.20
LABOUR
1|FRONT BONNET LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 250.10
LABOUR
1|FRONT BONNET LOCK PILLAR BENT 120.80 120.80
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -£25.22 -338.24
5,626.98 3,044 16
LABOUR
LABOUR TO SPRAY PAINT. 750.00 500.00
LABOUR TO PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR 700.00 450,00
OF FRONT BONNET HINGES AND FRONT BONNET
LOCK
LABOUR TO FOCUS HEADLAMP, 40.00 20.00
1.490.00 a70.00
GRAND TOTAL T.116.98 4,014.16
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS | el | 320000
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) ] - : I . = 1]

Report Ref No. CS/QBE19008621/Kb3q2

Az

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appralsor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report s made solsly Tor the uss snd benefll af Ihe Clian named an tha front page of this Report.




