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NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay(@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email admin@nhtmotorcom  Website: www nhtmotor.com
Tel 6747 9241 Fax 67417276
UEN 201718370K

WEE HOCK SENG SCHOOL BUS SERVICE 14/05/2019
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43 . ,
F Loa K «
Singapore 417883 TT CoAtAL,
w ,

J

Accident date: 07/05/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: CB6841D MITSUBISHI BE639GRMHDEA

CHASSIS: BE639GB00212 3.9M '02
S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1 Front Panel K& & 53,873.00 X
2 1 Front Panel Emblem Logo *zer $76.00 v
3 1 Front Bumper Dhstotind. $1,685.00¢
a 1  Front L/H Head Lamp r&{ fio” $732.007
5 1 Front L/H Head Lamp Top Moulding =+ s~ $123.00 X
6 1 Front L/H Side Lamp (1 $251.00 7
7 1 Front L/H Fender &, ¢ $3,039.00 %
8 1 Front L/H Fender Signal Lamp [k $88.00 7
9 1 Front L/H Fender Moulding s $578-60~ "30{1"'
10 1 Front L/H Fender Body Sticker (Special Nett) ¥, SM I G0
I | freet i Feudt Gl ¥l MNaw 299 154(tw)
(&% Subtotal - $10,925.00
LKK Aulo Consuliants heme e =::.7‘:7£"u": A, 5"0
Labour charges mipdshod ik .
To check Wiring | =7 ren oo, Sm 30
Tuff kote ! wow e AW 51'.’?,90' £90
dadrowiedged by Rugairet /250
Panel beating Sqnature Sl.w 300
Spray painting SL#U/M{ 750
o comore. tends gle 390 230 subtotal:- __ $3,030.00
Total:- $13,955.00
: -*‘J-f‘m 37\"5}{
2.\ -‘-/ S B

1'.9:3{'“:':/5 |



PARF COE Rebate Enguiry

lofl

> Back to OneMotoring

hups

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type

Crawrrer ID:

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.

Vehicle 1o be Exported
Imended Deregistration Date
Viehicle Make:

Vehicle Mogel

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassis No.

Maxiimigm Povwer Output:
Cipen Markst Value

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date
Transfer Court:

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility;

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amoaunt:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Rubate Amaunt

Total Rebate Amount:

Businezs
S180x

CB&B41D

Mo

10May 2019
MITSUBISHI
BEAIPGRMHDEA
White

2001
4034HB2287
BE&IFGEO0212

6453500
1% Jan 2002
1¥ Jan 2002
4

£324700

No

$0.00

000
$0.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 May 2019

OK

vl e gov sg vl action enguirelebaeBy PublicBelore

10

52019, 10:32 am
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto) —

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpaccom>
Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2019 10:07 AM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAUtD)
Cc MT_Clarm_5G; loy lrene (LKEAULS)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKP4D8BG (01 : LPC - TBA} AND CEEEAD (TP
LKK REF - CCB/LPCT19008617/A/b3) on 10.05.2019 [External Confidential]
Attachments: 160520719095402 pdf; SKP40880G.MP4
J r gl - II""‘T""""":"'ir"‘i
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VP05/021783
Dear Shu Pei,

Attached accident report of our insured and video footage
for your attention,

Based on the video footage, we are of the view that liability is
against CB6B41D,

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Ropad, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all 8% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data s for use by authorised extemal parties only

From: Shu Pel (LKKAUtD) [mallto:shupei@ikkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 6:48 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG L1 L1

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Joy [rene (LKKAUtD)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SKP4088G (01 : LPC - TBA) AND CB6841D (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/LPC19008617/A)b3) on 10.05.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle CB 6841D at M/s New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

linclosed for your perusal 1s;
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
{lur case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.
Thank you,

Bt Regonas

Shiu Pel| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone 6366-0055 | emall: thupelEikkasto com | fac 574 1-4 1086
Ak 51. Pays Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue L #02-25 | 5(408933)



Vic (LKKAuto)

— — #
From: Vic (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 10:06 AM
To: Admin nht
Cc Chioe; Admin A Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: FW: CB6841D CLAIMING AGAINST SKP4088G DOA:10.05.19 - LKK REF
CCH/LPC19008617/Ahb3
Attachments: SKP4088G.MP4

Without Prejudice
Dear Sukyi,
we refer further to our below email.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident.

Our Insured was travelling along within its lane when the collision occured. Please refer to the attached video
footage for your reference.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look inte your client’s claim.
We will now close the matter in our end.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(308933)

] i —

¥ RIS oS
RaSRET  ~w Sova the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This &-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibiled, and may be a violation of law, If you believe thal you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Pleasa delete the e-mail and all attachmenits, including any copies thereal, and inform the
sander that you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereal. Thank you

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 7 October, 2019 5:14 PM

To: Admin nht

Cc: Chloe; Admin A; Vic [LKKAuto)

Subject; RE: FW: CBES41D CLAIMING AGAINST SKPA08RG DOA:10.05.19 - LKK REF CC6/LPC19008617/Ahb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sukyi,



We refer to the below emall.

Please find attached copy of our Insured’s video footage as requested.

Rased on the footage, our Insured vehicle was observed to be travelling within its lane when the collision occurred.
Meanwhile, we are pending for further instructions from our principal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408931)

F ISRl .
Ses%lT  ~w Sove the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privilegad material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. |f you belleve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereaf, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 May, 2019 11:18 AM

To: loy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Olivia Lau [LKKAuto); Chloe; Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject; Re: FW: CB6841D CLAIMING AGAINST SKP4088G DOA:10.05.19

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
Hi Joy

Kindly provide us the video tootage of the accident as your client mentioned that his car had an in-car
camcra.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax : 6741 7276



On Fri, May 17, 2019 at 9:20 AM Admin nht <agdmin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Shu Pei
Contents noted with thanks.
Hi Joy

Kindly provide us the video footage of the accident as your client mentioned that his car had an in-car
camera.

Best Regards,
Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Lid
| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay (@ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax : 6741 7276

On Thu, May 16, 2019 at 6:14 PM Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.



Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/LPC19008617/Ajb3 Joy

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Hest Regards,

Shu Peil Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 63660055 | email: ghupeiflkkauto.coim | fx: 67414108

Bik §1, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-15 | 5{408933]

From: Admin nht <adminf@nhimotor.com=

Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2019 4:26 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKK Auto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com=; Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com=
Subject: CB6841D CLAIMING AGAINST SKP4088G DOA:10.05.19

Without Prejudice

Hi Admin Team

Kindly provide us the video footage of the accident as your client mentioned that his car had an in-car
camera,

Best Regards,
Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd



| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay (@ Kaki Bukit S(417883)

Tel : 67479241  Fax : 6741 7276




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 9:06 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKP4088G (O : LPC - TBA) AND CB6841D

(TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC19008617/Ahb3) on 10.05.2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

We concurred with your view based on the video footage.

You may proceed to reject the third party claim.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

TeE:_[_ﬁS} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: 65) 6296 2706
= 3

The all {¥%) lonpac.com.sg

co L Now

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mallto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto,com]

Sent: Monday, 7 October, 2019 5:11 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKP4088G (OI : LPC - TBA) AND CB6841D (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC19008617/Ahb3) on 10,05.2019 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,

We refer to your below email,

Based on the Insured’s video footage, it shows that Insured vehicle was travelling along within its lane.

As such, we would like to reject the TP claim.

For your approval and/or further instruction please.

Thank you.



Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

7 7

Ay S

ZLER3% N Save the Earth- Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use of distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may ba a violation of law. If you belisve that you received this e-mail In emor, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delste the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereol, and infarm tha
sender thal you have delsted the e-mall, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 May, 2019 10:07 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAutD)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKP4088G (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND CB6841D (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC19008617/Ajb3) on 10.05.2019 [External Canfidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VvP05/021783

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached accident report of our insured and video footage
for your attention.

Based on the video footage, we are of the view that liability is
against CB6841D.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TEE_LEE) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all (%) lonpac.com.sg

N MNow i

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 6:48 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKP4088G (OI : LPC - TBA) AND CB6841D (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC15008617/Ajb3) on 10.05.2019



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above maltter.

We have inspected TP vehicle CB 6841D at M/s New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Our case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409 .
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shi Pel| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupel®|kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933]



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX 6256 4315
Reg No 168607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607 198-R

Afflliated to Fadaration Internaticnale Dos Experts En Automobiia

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CCBILPC18008617/Ahb3q2
osencnond counseswaneone sssss ° o= [[IIHNK
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKP 4088G Veh. Inspected CB 6841D
Policy No. Z18VPO5018718 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/19/19NV/P05/021783 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1410572018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI ROSA c.c 3808
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2002
Chassis No. BEB39GB00212 Colour WHITE
Odometer 849999 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NiL
General GOCD
5 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/7T5R17.5 WANLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |21875R17.5 WANLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21575R17.5 WANLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/75R17.5 WANLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/05/2019 Inspection Date 14/05/2018
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 5 Working Days




4
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6258 3581 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg No: 16860T198R GST Reg No 18-860T1968-R Page No..1al 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. CB 6841D
aty ~ Description of Parts Condition | =L oe {:1] {,i
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 3,873.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT PANEL EMBLEM LOGD MECESSARY 76.00 TE.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 1,885.00 1,685.00
1|IFRONT LIH HEAD LAMP NOT NECESSARY T32.00
1|FRONT L/ HEAD LAMP TOP MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 123.00
1|FRONT L/H SIDE LAMP cut 251.00 251.00
1|FRONT L/H FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 3,039.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT L'H FENDER SIGNAL LAMP cuT BB.00 B8.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -525.00
9,887 00 1,575.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT L/H FENDER MOULDING (SN) NECESSARY 578.00 180.00
1|FRONT L'H FENDER BODY STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 480.00 180.00
1|FRONT L'H FENDER GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 200.00 150.00
1,258.00 510.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 30,00
TUFF KOTE 150.00 50.00
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1.400.00 800,00
PANEL AND FRONT L'H FENDER .
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,400.00 750,00
TO REMOVE FENDER GLASS. 380.00 220.00
3,410.00 1,850.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,535.00 3,935.00

Repart Ref No. CCB/LPC18008617/Ahb3g2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCB/LPC19008617/Ahb3q2

% g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE.AMSAE-AM.MATA|

Liconsed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor s made solely for the use snd benefil of the Client named an ine frant page of this Repart.

ragly an. ihe Repor wholly or 0 aet Any Shird party sctng ot realying on this




