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> hack to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
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Wehicle Details

Vehicle No.:
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COE Rebate Amount:
Total Hﬂ_m:l Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 May 2019
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$1.35500

No

$0.00

26 5ep 2027

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$19.531.00
$16.34000
§16,340.00
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 3:.04 PM

To: Rico 60

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD for GBG B674 E *LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008606/Upa3
Without Prejudice

[save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer 1o the above matier.

We propose settlement as follows: -

I, Cost of Repair [w/G5T) 3 2.568.00
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00) $ 300.00
TOTAL | 52.8468.00

Please confirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting (o legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terma/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/infMuence on the lssues of
linbility/damages, either party is not bound, ihereafter, by the negotiation terms/setilement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 9:37 AM

To: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com=>

Ce: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@]lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: LOD for GBG 6674 E *LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008606/Upa3

without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your email.

We will look into the matter and get bock to you.



Hi Khanchna,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewhti@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Enquiry <claims@rico6l.com=>

Sent: Saturday, 25 May 2019 3:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewhi@lkkauto.com>
Subject: LOD for GBG 6674 E

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Attached file as per your pursuant.
Kindly release DV/cheque.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,
Shanelle Lim

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Mobile: +65 9187 8064 Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: enguirvi@inico60.com




In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@ lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 5:31 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@llkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD for GBG 6674 E *LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008606/Upa3

Dear Khanchna,

Thank you for your offer.

Offer accepted. Kindly assist to release DV/Cheque soonest possible.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jin Hai

=]

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims(@rico60.com

From: Khanchna { LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 3:04 PM

To: Rico 60

Ce: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD for GBG 6674 E *LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008606/Upa3

Withoul Prejudice
(save os to cosis)

Deoar Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Rico B0 <claims@rico6(.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 11:39 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Ce: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DV for GBG 6674 E (Our Ref: CC4/AIG19008606/Upa3) (DOA : 13/05/2019)
Attachments: Discharge Voucher.pdf

Dear Khanchna,

Attached file as per vour pursuant.
Kindly release cheque.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
¥vonne Teoh

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 6:20 PM

To: Rico 60

Ce: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD for GBG 6674 E *LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008606/Upa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to cosls)
Dear Jin Hai,

Thank you for the acceplance.

we attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

“Kindly note that this negotintion between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotistion of terms/settlement.



Our Ref.: GBGGETAE

Your Raf: SMK 2724 U

Date: 25/5/2019

ATTN: Motor Claims Department
INS ; AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTO.
Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident Involving: GBGGETAE,SMK 2724 U SIR 3790 U

RICO 60 AUTD SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

PFremier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel; +E5 62E6 6060 | Fax; +65 6286 TOED
Email: enquiry@nicobl.com

Date of Accident: 13/5/2019 @ 15:20HRS

Location: Junction of Geylang Road & Onan Road (Infront Alwadi)

We refer to the above-mentioned accident.

We are claiming as follows:

Cost of Repair: 5 2,568.00
Loss of Rental

(5150/Day x 3 Days): s 450,00
Grand Total: 5 3,018.00

The above-mentioned settlement is in respect for our client of damage pertalning to his/her
motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our client's claim In respect of damages and

consequential loss in relation to his/her personal injuries.

Kindly take note that our office is located at 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit,

#02-24, Singapore 415875,

For any further queries, please kindly contact Shanelle Lim @ 6286 6060/9187 8064, or email to

claims@ricob0.com.

Thank You,

Shanelle Li




["[r Auto
_' o :’.‘t:ru.l.il'mh
A B A B FPla Lig

S1UBE AVE L, AUL-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAN : (D65 A2564315

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19008606/Uipa3
27 MAY 2019

BIS MOTORING PTE LTD
20 BENDEMEER ROAD
#03-13/14

BS BENDEMEER CENTRE
SINGAPORE 339914

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK2724U (AIG) / GBG66T4E / OTHERS ALONG/ AT
JUNC GEYLANG RD & ONAN RD ON 13/05/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the
third party claim against vour policy,

We have received a claim from GBG6674E against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
scttlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the 1ime being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal A1G
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
L

KHANCHNA

Case Handler

IM1: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

cc.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



RICD 50 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Rag. No.: 201807523m

ki Bukit Avapue 4, Pramiar @ Kak! Buklt. #0224
Singapore 415875 | Emall enquiry@ricosd com
Tal: +85 6285 606D | Fax: =65 6285 7060

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

Accident on '-ﬂ{tl'-ﬂﬁ- \5% 3ohay along Tt of syl el L whan g (Totant A

involving vehicles nos. __ CRG LYW E Sk 13k ¢Ip 23a0u

In consideration of Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd., B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
#02-24, Singapore 415875, repairing my/our motor vehicle no. _ GR&LLIVE at my/our
request, |/We, 31 gensulvowr f4 U5 (“the claimant”)

of 219 Surunsy WY % o) Wod -84 ()6woRid
£ the owner of motor vehicle no. _ GRL ((3IuE

(address) bearing NRIC no. L= 1113 154
hareby authorise them to demand cla im, sattle and receive whataver amount settle payable by the

insurance company or third party or commence Iggal proceeding for cost of rapairs, loss of use and
elc. to any of their appointad advocatss to act of mafus in respact of the said accident/claim and all
the amount claimed or sattled shall belong and make payable to tham absolutsly by the insurance
company of th third party. |/We further authorisad them ta give an absolute discharge on myfour
behaif and to sign discharga voucher(s) and any other documents nacassary or incidentals to the

conduct and disposal of my/our above zlaims.
{/\We further agees to fully co-operate snd aend all colirt béarings that are nacessary ta prosacuts
the claims maintained by Rico 50 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. [/We further agree and undertaks to
indemnify them against my/our claim for costs which arise therawith. In the event that my/our claim
I$ unsuccessful, |/we undertake to pay to Rico 60 Auto Services Pte, Ltd. the cost of rapairs of
my/our vehicle, In the event that settiement cheque were to be drawn in my/our favour, t/we
hereby give my/our instruction to clear the said cheque on my/our behalf by presenting the same
for payment directly into Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd, account. Upon clearance of the said cheque,
I/we further autharise Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. and/or their appointed law firm to utiliss the
manies to pay their charges without further reference to me. | confirm that the payment to Rico 60
Auto Services Pte. Ltd. shall amourit to a good discharge of Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. and/or
their appointed law firm's obligation to me In respect of the settlement monies.

g

Dated this __ 13 day of

&= 4.

“The Claimant’s" Signature

Rico 60 Auto Services Pte Ltd

Name: lji]am:"ﬁ a’/*ﬂ_

Name: T3 Corsubent ple U‘J

NRICNo.: _yalll T iSqn




“My execution of this Discharg
Voucher is only for my clair
for property damage and nc

ELEASE VOUCHER Prejudicial to any other claims
- Ex d Pa lai
“We/l, _ RICO 50 AUTO SERVICES PTELTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that

we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed
for 8§ 256800 (Repair Cost), 88 30000 (Loss of ee/Rental), 88 - (Disbursement) for
vehicle no. GBGBS74E _that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 13/05/2019
(date) along JUNC GEYLANG RD & ONAN RD {location)
involving vehicle no/s_ SMK2724y . This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 15/05/2018 (date)
at “the workshop".

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner J2 CONSULTANT PTE LTD

(the third party claimam™) of vehicle no. GBGSGET4E  make the claim as set out in the above
paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his’her behalf in a manner that we/l
deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,

loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”

after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses

suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to
GBGEB74E _ (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject 1o the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Daedthis___ UF (day) of 91 (month) 20_18_ (year)
(i.tfﬂf |

T— w8

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by Yshe workshop™ (with chop)



RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & G5T Reg. No.: 201807823M

B Kakl Buklt Avenue 4

Pramier (@ Kaki Bukil

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6285 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: enquiry@rico80.com

UOB Bank -Currant ;: 371-310-641-3

TAX INVOICE
Invaice No. 1201805769
Invoice Date  : May 25, 2019
AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pta. Lid Vehiclea Mo, : GBGBETAE
Make & Model - TOYOTA DYNA
6418 1000 Chassis No. : JTFAT35Y30K208829
Mileage L.
Terms : Due within 90 days
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY P'f:ﬁ“n";" AMOUNT (SGD)
1 To Carry Out Repair & Respray on Accident 1 2.400.00 2,400.00
Carmespanding to Supply on Spare Parts & Labour
Charges
7% GST S168.00
GRAND TOTAL (INCLUSIVE OF 7% GST) $2,568.00
Amount Paid s0.00
Balance Due $2,568.00

Signature/Company Stamp

I agree to the price as listed above and affirm that the goods are received in good condition,



CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTE LTD

Malling Address: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #03-01 Vicom Inspection Centra

{Seouth Wing), Singapore 415533
Warkshops: 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #0B-40/45/46 Premier@ Kaki Bukit,

Singapore 415875
Co. Aeg'n No.: 201608732N

8ill Te

Lea Wing Hoon
Apt Bk 428 Choa Chu Kang Avenus 4 #09-188
Singapore 2388

Invoice #: E1005030
Date: 23-05-19

1
Ship Ta:

m VEnue

Descriplion Amaunt Job Mo,
Vehicla Aental for peried 14.05.201 to 17.06.2019 $450.00 (GBGISIOR  N-T
(Billing or 3days, x $150.00/per day)
(Vihicle Nn%ﬂlﬂ;j =
Your Qrdar & E15653
Terms: Net 30th aftar GST: $0.00
COMMENT CODE RATE GST SALE AMOUNT  Total Inv Amt | s4s000,
N-T 0% $0.00 $450.00  Amount Applied: $0.00
SR 7% $0,00 $0.00
Balance Due; £450.00
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Merimen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Fastiane

|Adl) Submared

ns Auth'ed

Case | Notfied Est Submitted | Ad) Assigrnd At R Stqus — |
15 May 2019 ;: 1:;"' 019 $$2,400.00  $$2,400.00 m for Survey
i Edit Reg Ean ad) wpt | wa]! ,,..:m | cone |

Claim Details

[[Created by adjuster]

JI CONSULTANT PTE LTD, Co. Reg. MNo.: 201117153R

[13/05/2019 15:00 - :59
|[19 Months and 16 Days From LTA Fieg Date (Man ¥r)]

| 1999984322 (Comprehensive)

GBGG674E
TP / 984106037056

Date of Loss:

Paolicy/Cover
Mote No.:

Policy Mo,
{Claimant):

SMK2724U | BMCPH1B-006535

Excess:
RICD 60 AUTD SERVICES PTE LTD (HQ) 8, KAK] BUKTT AVENUE 4, #0Z-14;, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, 415875 Kaki Buki - Tei:

|

|

AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Lee, Ming-Yao] MingYao.Lee@alg.com |
. e e {

|

EQ Insurance Company Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6223 9431

|

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
'+ AIG_SG (15/05/2015)) Request To Upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS™

Dun Date  Priorlty Type
| Mo resulis.

View All | Seorch Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |
Assigned By Completed On Crested On Dona?

Task Group Subject  Handler

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 12/7/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*GBGGE674E (98410603705G)
[SMK2724U]
T
J2 CONSULTANT PTE LTD
May 13 2019 3:00PM
[BIS MOTORING PTE LTD]
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Page | of 2

Upoad Docurments | _upiced Protes | _Compose Hew Leter | upiosd viseo | _upioss Ausio | View [View in Browser |~ |
Lettars/Correspondances o 1 per page EI & |
Mo | Finalzed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |{Ovam) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown D Edit
Photos/Images [3perpage  [~] TE_J
ho | Relabel/Reorder | LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 150519 1B:31 | Chassis Number 0| wears | & |
1 15/05/19 18:31  Odometer Reading 0 | toadirc | A |
3 190510 1831 | Ganeral View O | weaws | @
4 150519 18:31 | General View o Q| wows B2
5 150519 18:31 | Ganeral View 0D | aaws |
s [15/05/19 18:31 | Genersl View | owwrc | A
7 15/05/19 18:31 | General View 0 | wews | A
B 15/05/1918:31 | General View 0| waews | (A
6 15/05/1% 18:31 | Genersl View ©  easws | B
110 |15/08/19 18:31 General View 0 | wers | (2
111505719 18:31 | General View © | weews | A
112 15/05/19 18:31 | General View © | tos s
113 |15/0S/19 18:31 | General View O ouws | M
14 |15/05/19 18:31 | General View 0  Lsed o ‘_ﬂ?_
15 |[1%/05/19 18:31 | Genaral View 0 | lwows | B
16 |15/05/19 18:31 | General View 0 wedws | B
17 |15/05/19 18:31 | General View D | e | A
18 [15/05/19 18:31 Ganeral View 0 wars | &
19 15/05/10 18:31 | Geners| View D | mews || 4
20 |15/05/19 1831 | General View 0 | wadws | A
21 1505121531 General View @ | ks | B
37 15/05/19 18:31 | General View —— © | waaws | A
23 15/05/19 18:31 Ganeral View ﬁ Load G | B
(24 1%/05/1918:31 | General View 0 | aaes A
25 15/05/19 18:31 | General View 0| eawvs B
6 | 15/05/19 18:31 | General View O wxws | &
127 |15/05/19 18:31 | General View O | oadirc | B
28 |15/05/10 18:31 | General View 0 wwws | &
39 [15/05/19 18:31 | General View O | www | A
30 [15/05/19 16:31 | General View D edws | B
31 |15/05/19 18131 General View D | wetws | A
32 |15/05/19 18:31 | General View D | tzxcivc | B
331505158 18:31 | General View ©  eaws | 9
34 [15/05/15 1831 | General View D  wws

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 12/7/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

|Letters/ Correspondences [1 par page ~] A

Mo | Finalzed On LMK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
| - =]

Immﬂnn 1 per page _m ]

o [Relabsl/Reorder | LXK Aute Consultants Pie Lid (WQ) Thumbnall| Print

[t |15/05/19 14:58 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 15.5.19 Lbag PDF

2 15/05/13 14/58 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP Load PDF

3 15/05/19 14:58 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 15.5.19 O | LoadroF |

4 | 18/U5/19 20119 | TP GIA REPORT Lbad PDF |

5 16/051920:41 TP ESTIMATE-MARKED ) | LoadPoF |

6 27/081911:16 |LETTERTO Ol - s Load POF

7 120719 10:01 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF |

] ll.l'ﬂ?.fl.l 10:01 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM 8 Load PDF

9 10719 10:01 | Release Voucher Loag POF

10 12/07/19 1001 RENTAL RECEIPT © | toscror

."‘“ | Finadired Cn AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Phe. Ltd. (SG) mm:n!

1 116/051911:01 [Q1GIAreport = © | Load FoF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | ernt |

Mimmumﬂm:nnw

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid (HO)

Show Remarks Tar L] Handling Ingurer
Heie: SETEaQks W SrVAN ESTE pDu S | 1 Ol ZAVTE.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 12/7/2019



Preview Page 1 of 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'U'llhl.til No: SMK2724U (Insd veh) Modal: TOYOTA DYNA 150 3.0 D
GBGEET4E (TP veh) SMT (M)

|Date of Accident: | 13/05/2019

Global Sum Settlement | | [ ] Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimale s 15,702.35

Final Repair Cosl i85 2,568.00

Loss of Use s days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) - 30000 3 days

LTA i GIA Search Fee :§ 0.00

Oihers 3 0.00

5
Final Settlement Sum 5 2,868.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindyindicae
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No;

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (").__0____ (%)

* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruciion: Payee's Breakdown
1) |RICO B0 AUTO SERVICES PTELTD -1 2.868.00
2) ' §

12 Jul
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repalir Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 12/7/2019



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regne 198807 188m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 4068833

Page | of 4

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AG18008808/UPAIQZ
Date: 1210772019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid.  Policy Mo 0808594322
Clalmant Vehicle 5pcee7aE Insured Vehicle No :  SMK2724U
Date of Loss: 13052018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 8B410803705G
DESCRIPTION & |DENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GEGEBETAE
Make & Modal: TOYOTA DYNA 150, 3.0 D 5MT (M) Engine No: 1KD2743362
Reg. Dale 27/08/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: JTFAT3SYA0KZ08928
Colour: Silver Odometer: 29815 km
Engine Capacity 2982 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S5%) Market Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF | ATTHET F Y
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceabls). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195 R15 Rear Tyre Size 155 R12 (D)
Front Left Side Bridgeslone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6/6 mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6/6 mm
The above valuas represent the remaining fyre freads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 11,235.09 1,484.22 9,740.87 86.70
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,440.00 1.520.00 1.920.00 55.81
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 14,675.00 3.014.22 11,660.87 T9.46
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,400.00
(S5) 14 675.08 2,400.00 12,275.09 B3.65
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 1,027.28 168.00 850.26 B3.65
Nett Amount (S§) 15,702.35 2,568.00 13,134.35 Bl.65
+ Car Rental (3.0 x 53100.00/day) (5%} 300.00
Nett Liability (S3) 2,868.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignmenl:

Date Inspecied:

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen _...

15/05/2019
15/05/2019 Inspecied At:

PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT

Singapore 415875

RICO 80 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (HQ)
8, KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #02-24,

12/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Perlod of Repair 4.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE This repost rapresents our Fodings of ha Hme and piace of ingpecion staled herein. Such inspection hazs bean carmed ouf fo Me besf of our
knowiegge and ability but any other kabiily under any other circumstances is bareby aspressiy gxclded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 12/7/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
T 1 “TAIL GATE Repair 1.818.20FL "-FL
2 2 “TAIL GATE HOOK (L+R) Mot Necessary 151.80FL *-FL
3 2 *TAIL GATE LOCK [L+R) Repair J42.00FL *-FL
4 2 *TAIL GATE CATCH (L+R) Mot Necessary 457 B0 FL *-FL
5 4 *SET TAIL GATE HINGE Not Necessary 4986 80 FL *-FL
6 1 “ENDP PANEL Benl 9B30DFL *BBS5.10FL
7 2 *ENDP PANEL LOWER BRACKET (L+R) Repalr 330.00FL “.FL
B 2 “ENDP PANEL LOWER BRACKET STOPPER (L+R) Cut 90.00FL  "90.00FL
g 2 “TAIL LAMP (L+R) Cracked 384 40FL *394 40FL
10 1 “SPARE WHEEL BRACKET Mot Necessary 250.85FL *-FL
" o1 *EXHAUST PIPE Repair £98.00FL *-FL
12 2 "EXHAUST MOUNTING Mot Necessary 128.00FL *FL
13 1 *TAIL GATE STICKER {TOKM/H) Necessary 100.00FS  *10.00FS
14 1 “TAIL GATE STICKER (TOYOTA) Necassary TOD.00OFS *14500F5S
% 1 *TAIL GATE STICKER (STA VEHICLE INSPECTION ) Not Necessary 100.00FS *-FS
1B 1 “TAIL GATE STICKER (DYNA) Necessary 300.00FS *60.00FS
7o *END PANEL SEALANT Not Necessary 12000FS *-FS
1B 1 “REAR CARPLATE BRACKET Not Necessary 600.00F5 *-FS
19 1 “REAR LICENCE PLATE Bent 120.00FS *20.00FS
20 1 "SPARE TIRE (BIG) Not Necessary BOO.00FS *-FS
21 1 *SPARE TIRE RIM (BIG) Not Necessary  1,000.00FS *.FS
22 1 *SPARE TIRE (SMALL) Nol Necessary BO0.ODFS -FS
23 1 *SPARE TIRE RIM (SMALL) Not Necessary B00.00FS “F§
24 2 *REVERSE SENSOR BRACKET (L+R) Mot Necessary 600.00F5 *-Fs
25 1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 300.00FS *200.00FS
2B 2 *TAIL LAMP PANEL (L+R) Bent 242 80FL 242 80FL
F=Franchese part. S=5SpcMett Le=Linttam Disc
Sub Total (5%) 1293345  1,B847.30
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25,00/25.00% (S%) 169836 353.08
Total Parts (58) 11,235.08  1,494.22
Report was unsubmitted duning this print-out. i
https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 12/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO RNR ACCIDENT AFFECT AREA New 1,500.00 800.00

2 TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA Mew 1,500.00 600.00

3 TO RUST PROOFING ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA New 200.00 50.00

4 TO RNR REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK FUNCTION New 120.00 50.00

5 TO CHECK WIRING LAYOUT AND TAILLAMP FUNCTION New 120.00 20.00

Gross Labour Cost [S§]) 3.440.00 1.520.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 12/7/2019



