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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

— =iy e e T e e e
From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 5:26 PM
To: Sim, Priscilla-LK; SUR
Subject: RE: OD claim / SJV3805R / 28798313215G

Dear Priscilla

There is an admin fee of $20/- for the below request.
Dear Survey Dept

Please follow up.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 5:14 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: OD claim / SJV3805R / 2879831321SG

Hi Bryan

Kindly assist to apply SCDF fire report for the above claim.
Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



5/15/2019 Fire Report Application

Singapore Government

Integrity - Service - Excellence

SLOF

\&4] The Life Saving Force

Fire Report Application

Your request for the Fire Report has been confirmed and the amount of SGD170.00 will be deducted
from your account. You will receive the report within 8 working days upon completion of
investigations. Please quote the following transaction number when making enquiries.

@ Download Tax Invoice/Receipt

Transaction Number: FR2019051503139

INCIDENT DETAILS
Date and Time
Location of Fire

Fire Involved

REQUESTOR DETAILS

29/04/2019 17:00
BLK 104C DEPOT RD MSCP AT DECK 4B
SJV 3805R

Date/Time: 15/05/2019 14:04

Requestor Type Insurance Companies
Requestor ID Type Foreign International Requestor ID G2706880X
Name of Applicant SHIRLEY HIEW
Company Name LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Company UEN
Company Reference
Number
CONTACT DETAILS
Mode of Collection Email
Main Contact No. 62563561 Office No.
Handphone No. Fax No.
Email Address sur@lkkauto.com
Address Block No. Blk Floor No. 02 Unit No. 25
51
Street Name Ubi Avenue 1
Building Name Paya Ubi Industrial Park Postal Code 408933
PAYMENT DETAILS

Payment Mode
EP Reference No.
PSi Reference No.

Total Fees

Credit/Debit Card
5579005313886378003048
78fd81b0-f3f2-4e28-bcb9-f92215fba8el
SGD170.00

https://eservices1.scdf.gov.sg/sod/fire-report-application/payment-status-credit/3139.do
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91 UBI AVENUE 4
SINGAPORE 408827

TELEPHONE: 6280 0000
GST REG NO: MG-8400000-5

SINGAPORE CIVIL DEFENCE FORCE

TAX INVOICE/RECEIPT

Name : SHIRLEY HIEW

Receipt No :

5579005313886378003048

Address : Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1 Date/Time 15/05/2019 14:04
#02-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park eService ID: FR2019051503139
Singapore 408933
S/No Payment Mode Description Reference No Net Amount GST Gross
(7% GST) Amount
1 Credit Card Fire Report FR2019051503139 170.00 0.00 170.00
Total
Amount 170.00
(SGD)
REMARKS:

Date and Time [29/04/2019 17:00] - Location of Fire [BLK 104C DEPOT RD MSCP AT DECK 4B]

Note: This is a computer generated receipt. No signature is required. Receipt is void if payment is dishonoured.



