Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 1:33 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE3659U [Lonpac Ref:

18/19/19/VC05/021863 ] & SKD1646D ALONG X-JUNCTION OF FORT RD ON 27.5.2019
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Khabnchna,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tei_i_{_ErS} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all {¥8%) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 16 August, 2019 3:34 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE3659U [Lonpac Ref: 18/ 19/19/VC05/021863 ] & SKD1646D ALONG
X-JUNCTION OF FORT RD ON 27.5.2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021863
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC 19009548/ Jka3s2
Dear Sir/Madam,

wWe refer to the above matter.

we have highlighted to your good office on 29/05/2019% of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Our insured driver was proceeding in his lane and alleged that third party had collided into his vehicle on the
left side. Whereas, third party stated in his accident statement that as he was driving, our Insured vehicle
collided into his vehicle on the right side.



We noted that the accident versions are conflicting and there is no supporting documents/evidence fumnished
to us. As such, in absence of the said documents and the conflicting versions, we opine that liability is to be

placed equally between both parties to settle at best terms.

summary to offer to third party repairer "Carz Auto Services Pte Ltd" as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $26,772.07 $ 5.350.00
2. Loss of Use |7 days x $ 80) $ 560.00 $ 420,00 (7 days x $60)
Total | $ 27.332.07 $5.770.00
50% | 3 13.666.04 5 2,885.00
3, LTAS GlA Search Fee } 7.45 5 7.45
Total | § 13,673.4% S 2.5_?%45

**7days recommendation for repair

The above is for your approval.
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 10:28 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD1646D & XE3659U ALONG X-JUNCTION OF FORT RD ON 27.5.2019 [External
Confidential]

Dear Mr. Gerald,
The above matter and e-mail below refers.

We will expedite and seek mandate promptly.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 10:20 AM



To: Khanchna {LKK Auto} <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt _claim@lonpac.com>; jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD1646D & XE3659U ALONG X-JUNCTION OF FORT RD ON 27.5.2019 [External

Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Khanchna,
Kindly look into liability and revert to the third party.

The claim documents were emailed to Mei Kwan 12 July 2019.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Te_l_i__[_ESJ 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

i

il The all {884 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: jeslyn@carzau m.sg [mailto:jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 8 August, 2015 10:10 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: 'alex’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD1646D & XE3659U ALONG X-JUNCTION OF FORT RD ON 27.5.2019

Hi Mr Gerald
Good Morning

| had mail out the document for you on 5 July 2019.
Please sent discharge voucher for us as soon as possible.

Thank You.

With Regards,
Jeslyn Chua
HP: 8322 7418



i
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TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
Address: 1 Defu Lane 6 Singapore 539363 Tel: 6858 5151 Fax: 6858 0B77

Our Ref: TPO13052019 bate: 13.06,2019
Your Ref: YN235U (CC6/LPCIS00B579/HAT)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Claims Department - Executive in eharge

Lenpoc Insurance Bhd

Dear SirdMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX5816Z / YN235U ON 10.05.201%

Refer to the above accident and please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days,

It appears that the accident was caused by your insured. Enclosed documents fo substantiate our client's
property damaged claim as our client had outhorized us to quantify, fo act and to reach settlement within 6
weeks on their behalf: -

O Original Tax-invoice number TPOG612/010 O Vehicle search result
0 SAS O Rental bill - Tnv-18190%32
O Authorization to act O Police report

*Survey under insurance instruction (LKK})

a) Cost of repoir (inclusive G5T) %1,819.00
b) Vehicle Search fees $2.00
€] Rental fees $417.30
d) Administrative charges fo negotiate settlement $100.00
{ Waive if 100% of fer made within acknowledge time frame)
Total $2,338.30

* Driver's injury and ether losses exclude in this claim.
If you are agreeable To the above, please forward dischorge voucher for our client's signature and payment

issued directly te “Tan Lim Moter Pre Lrd" within 28 days.

Yours faithfully,
Patricia Tan / Jofinson Chua
Emsil: pt@1lmeter com s / johnson chuo®1lmoter com 5g



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO “TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

FROM : OWHRER OF VEHICLE NUMBER ;f(}{ 6 5).!'[{5 }
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 1f/ N 2554 ¥

aLone/at__BuvrneMouflt  fload  on__10/08 [1019

I/We hereby authorize you to act on my/our behalf in pursuance of my/our claim for losses
ariging out of the above accident. ’

This letter serves as the AUTHORITY TO ACT

I/We also hereby authorize all ogreed settlement payment be made in favour to TAM LIM
MOTOR PTE LTD.

fame {f-m (1 h'ﬂﬁ WE“QI
i

we S 69326ILA

address_Blorke  370A  Muyegry steed 3V R10-0g Shaagie 531376
o i T

4% b¢ Lig)

Contact

st 1110512019

Signature

“Tha contents of this document appty Lo vahicls
famages only. Al parsonal injurles and
damages afising therefrom ane pattuded [rom
the amalt 2nd appiication ol this document.”™

Owner's / Hirer's signature / RTP
(Company's stamp if applicable)



fJ LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 19/19/19/VC05/021789
DATE : 06 AUGUST 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We. SIA CHEE PENG confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of YN 235U the sum of Singapore Dollar Two Thousand One
Hundred Forty-Two Only ($2.142.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and
discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M's LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether
now or hereafter to become manifest. arising either directly or indirectly from an
accident involving SKX5816Z and YN 235U on 10 May 2019 along Bournemouth
Road.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ HANAKO CONSTRUCTION PTE. LTD (SUKHJINDER SINGH))

against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our

behall in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize vou to pay the above settlement sum directly to TAN LIM
MOTOR PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

Name of vehicle owner Date imbit and applicatian of 1

(e



TAX-INVOICE
NUMRBER: TP0619/010

(Please quate our reference number TPO13052019 for poyment)

Sia Chee Peng

Vehicle No: SKX5B16Z
Model. HOMDA VEZEL 1.5 X

Description

To lump sum repair as recommended by surveyor.

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

MNo. 1 Delu Lane 6 Singapore 539365

Ak g AR TR LE)
TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

Date: 03/06/2019

Amount

$1,700.00
Sub Total $1,700.00
Add7%6ST  $119.00

Total

$1815.00

Mo. 51 Deiu Lane 10 Singapore 538216
Tel ; GBS8 5151 (24 hours) Fax ; 6856 0877
amail@timotor.com.sg www limolor.com.sg
Co. Reg. No.: 199503965M GST Reg. No. : M2-8922054-2
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gt GLOBAL ADVANCE LEASING

g & No. 1 Defu Lane 6, Singapare 539365

Global Advance Leasing T: +65 6100 0425 | enquiry@gal.com.sg | GST Reg No.: 200409785W
Bill T

e TAX INVOICE
Sia Chee Peng Invoice No INV-18190932

C/O: Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 376A Hougang 5t 32 #10-08

Singapore 531376 Involce Date 30 May 2019
531378 Reference SKC1322T7
Description Amaunt

SKC1322T, REF : TPO13052019-5KX58162(5T7351)

ftental from 27/05/2019 to 30/05/2019 390,00

03 days @ 5130.00 per day

Subtotal 390.00
Total GST 27.30
Amount Due 417.30

E;?‘ﬂb E Vj
3 1 MAY 2018

VIIVALE D

No Official Receipts will be issued.This is a computer generated document. No signature required.

PAYMENT METHOD

CREDIT CARD: VISA

Credit Card Convenience Feas apphcable

CHEQUE: All cheques should be crossed and made payable to | GLOBAL ADVANCE LEASING. Please indicate involce number and payer's name
on reverse of chegquee

BANK TRANSFER: LUOB Bank Account Number 208-315-273-9

Payment 15 due on or before the fiest day of rental, Kindly make payment promptly to avold incurring adrmin charges and late payment interest.

é.ﬁ DISCOVER EE: ,?‘?4

e
el ) view and pay enline now

E.&0.E
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seraak B gy

TPors 05 2919

s 2 .
f .".“
3 GLOBAL ADVANCE LEASING ckv By itz
% e Bz Reg. B52935025E .7
Foot, ST Ry Na: 200408785 Agreement: [ 301
- G b- ke S— Mo, | Debu Lang b
biobal Advance Leasing Tel: 6100DRAL a(535315)
i F— — i s PR B — =y P :
ﬂ-hm- Ne :‘;;p\ ikl v Mike & Made! Ti‘?ghnﬁ*“h} Date 7). 3| S 1A [|
Hirer ; Class 2/ 2A/28/3/4/5 | Check Out/ Check In |
Nama . Si4 M pang | pasout 37005/2019
pobos Bl 3TN Roggayy_ Sragh 3> fj0-0f | nmeon _[BIORS  wioa S2f03
o RaEee ) SRERIR e it PETROL ET 14 12 34 F i
CombectPersan oo cooneaoec Tl i e ] i | 30-05-2019 B
Tt Ditwie Cass2/2A/28/3/4/5 | Tmein _[T4ORCS__ kmin {32635 |
e e pow b perRoL ET e w2 34 F el
Address "7 sy Mede of Payment '
e T ) G Cash / Chaque / Company Billing / Credit Card / Dthers
vy DBREUABY ) T s P | ; mw#a EEN T
PassportNRIC ko _ 8 6432 6 1EbA  Wationabty  S'Peegd”? mluue.-'card B e e
Driving Licence Mo o, el .. Driving Exp - Expiry Da!f_:,. = P T T
| Country of ls5u8 ?‘Pﬂ‘.{‘ Expiry Data : Rental Chargaz
: T e e i e S ] o
! Additional Driver Class 2724 /2873745 03 Dayls @5 12000 jday S5 E?E.E
i Name A Vel s VR BE =
Aires ) . Montivs @5 /month 5§
(HP) 1) R (H SUBTOTAL 5§
PassportUNRIC Mo . .. . . Hationatity | COwW @S TRy
Driving Licence No v .. Driving Exp ¥5 | pag a8 N
LN e e I R | el Top Up ¥ L
| Non Walverable Excess | Delivery / Collection fee L R
The Hijer amgawladgns . SJ_E_#}!;_,'QQW- collision damape excess per accident | Mise oo 56 o =)
appliesyy, W N i S
N/ | Misc s
e it oo e perEE o — - A S =
| Collision Damage Walver (COW) | Pre-Payment / Deposit 58 -1
! The Hirer may limit his kability lor any damage arising from colfsion to § by ] Mise (5% )
| pirchasing COW and paying (he specified sum i i .
2 p. VRN | Tolal Due s _ﬂﬁ_?’g
X st o
o L T A ERERR ...____..l_ Charges Subject to Final Audit
Personal Accident Insurance (PAI) | o h
FAl may ba purchased at a premium specified herzin, The Hirer acknowledges that the Rasodanis Basasit
insurance is written by an independent ingurance company and acknowlndges that he has | Deposit 5
rocetver, read and understood (ha policy conditions ralating lo the same. Date of Relund
K |
Ik e B BT — s i i ...—i: Refund Mdugmm1 X S
Special Instructions ;.....,__,_.,H e e L U s b et e s
R  Far Ofticlal Use
| invoice No: 18190922 Date 30/05[2019
| Receipt No Date

Imandtant Nales

1. Raontal Vehizle i5 stricliy Tar Singapare usn andy and may net be driven out of Singapore without psior consent of the owaer

2. Dniy persans auihorised by Global Advance Leasing may dive ihe vehicls,

3 Al parking and Iratlic violations are the resporgibility of the Hirer. An Adminktrative chiange will b levded an day tratlic valations redirectzd.

4. T Hirer shall be Habl foe excess chargos dos any lake relurm at the rase shawn pes our of per day
&, I Ihe gvent of accident, the Hirer shall repost ta the rentsl office immediatety.

W have read and agresd 1o the larms and conditions 85 a1 out on both sides of the agreement and cenify thal the inlormation given 15 fres and comrect. 11 W ogit 10 pay by coedit /
charga card, | agree that all amaunts payable wades (hiz agraement may be biled lo the sama accourt ant ¢ signature here will be desmed to have Been made on he apalicabie credil

cart charge s,

O

X

{Hirer's signature) {Additional Driver's signature}
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Inveice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

. "GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

G Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

’”ﬁ INSURANCE -crone: +656224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Dperating Hours; Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

ST Registration Mo: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Page | of 2

Owr Ref No: GR-19-074725

[ate of Request: 11052019 Your Rel Mo Online Furchase

Tan Lim Mofor Ple Lid

1 Defu Lane 6

Singapore 530365

Dear Sirfadam,

Enguiry Date 11/05/2018

Enguiry By Lam Wel Shang

TP ' -"igle Mo, Y2350

Acci. o Date 1040542018

Enguiry Resuit

‘TP Wehicle Mo. Imgurer Period of insurance ilnsurer Tel MNo.
YM235U Lonpac Insurance Bhd 20003/2018-23/03/2020 | +B5 62507388

Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the onginal repens forwarded lo the cenlre by the mambers of ihe General Insurance Association of Singapore and
we take no responsdility for ther accuracy or cantents and shall be under no liability whalsoever fer any loss or damage arising out of ar in connection with the

repors o thair images.

This is a computer generaled documeant and requires noe signaiure,

hitps:sineanore . merimen.coniclaims/index cfim?fhizehov=MTR kN eeartinn=den asninuinleeti

P

Rl R EY)



[nvhice Page 2 of 2

i,

& GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles #18-00, Si 048580
INSURANCE Fione 65 6224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Dperating Hau_rs: Monday 1o Friday Sam to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ST Registration No: M4D00Y7TI5

TAX INVOICE
Cur Rel No: GR-19-074725
[ate of Requast: 110572019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Fan Lim Motor Pte Lid
i Defu Lane 6
Singapore 539365
Dear Sifhadam,
Enquiry Date 11052019
Enquiry By Lam Wei Shong
TP W="icla Mo ¥ 2350
Acci. 4 Dale 1052098
DESCRIPTION AMDUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amounl 013
Total Amount Due {GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.
This is @ compuler generaled document and reguires no signature.
For GlaRmMC Official use;
Dale.
[%] GIRQ | | Cash [ ] Cheque
Jins:Asinvanore. merimen.com/claims/index. cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuscaction=dsp ceninvindrelid=... 117052019



