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COMPORIDELGKO ENGINEERING PIE LD
REPAIR ESTIMATE"

VEHICLE'SO @ SHD 4183M DATE TX3S200% 11:00
MARE
SMODEL t HYUNDAI SONATA "—_P_-L =K
lgty Parts Description’ Labour | Type | Unit Price Amount
Radiator Grille A $ 282,10
Radiator Grille U Moulding X s 5 10890
Front Bumper Cover 7 $ 53880
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) X %~ S 2240
Front Bumper Bracket (LH) X s 20,10
SUB TOTAL 5 972.30
LESS 20% & 194 46
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 777.84
Front Number Plate  »~— ¢ S 25.00
Front No Plate Trim Cover < 4 3 30,00
S 55.00
Labour Charge 2%
Panel Beating b i
Spray Painting Charge 5 }Wfﬁﬁ’
2=
TOTAL LABOUR S 700,00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5§ 1,53184
. ,"’.
Jeul ottty /
Vg gird
2//?‘ Y,
Ls

This 1 an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle 1s surveved bv o motor Survevor appointed by the msurance company

Page 1 of 1

Nett
Netr



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO @ SHD 4183M

DATE 13/5/2019 11:09

(LR
AXA

MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAI SONATA
iy Parts Description’ Labour Type Unit Price Amaounit
Radiator Grille - 5 282.10
Radiator Grille U Moulding X 5 108.90
Front Bumper Cover  »~ § 53880
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) < 5 22.40
Front Bumper Bracket (LH) X 5 20,10
SURBR TOTAL b 97230
LESS 20%, 5 194.46
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 777.84
Front Number Plate S 25.00
Front No Plate Trim Cover X 5 30.00
$ 55,00
Labour Charge
Panel Beating 5 %
Spray Painting Charge 5 ﬁ‘
TOTAL LABOUR s T00.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5 153284

feullk vttty
,s/r A !iw'[
2V

s
e b

\

N

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by o motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company

Page 1 of 1
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Srazoe Claim Portal

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD (TP - Ml

. Service Request Details

Claim
SOMOINTN

Reference

None & P Lm

Loss Date
12 May 2019 1202 pn

Report Date V.in
13 May 2019 1:40:19 PM

Request Date
13 May 2019

Due Date
21 May 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

L.* = hiriE |.'.|1||'. |[ .ln. i |1|, .J‘l_ rl_.

Vehicle Infarmation

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SHD4183M

nmmp.mmmﬂ,mmmmwmmm:wmummmmmmmumﬂ 15554 2



SMazo9

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP

§ PRI

SONATA

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No.2 ANG MO KID STREET 63, 569111, Singapore

Claim Handler
WANG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
INSD GlA NOT REPORTED

Messages Invoices History Documents

Claim Portal

Assessment

Metrics

MNotes

MlEnu

Mew Messape

hitps:i/vp smartciaims. axa.com sg/daim-portalhtml/index-vendor-service-requests htmi#/service-requests/PserviceRequestNumber=115554



Catherine Chnng (LKK Autu!

From: Lim Kwok Eng <limke@cdge comsg>

Sent: Monday, 13 May, 2019 12:10 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
Ce: Ng Nyuk Phin; Roger How Keen Meng
Subject: SHD4183M with your insured SHD878T
Attachments: img-513120335-0001.pdf

Categories: Raghav

To Officer In Charge

Pls refer attachment

Best Regards

Lim Kwok Eng

Taxi Crash Repairs / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Tel. 6214-8355 / 6214-8156

This messsge and any sliachmants may contain confidential privileged or propristary informstion. If you ame not the intended mclpient. Kindly nolify
us and delete s message and s altachments mmedinialy, ang plesss De advemad that using. copying, distribufing or disciosing any conients
thered is not allowed. Statements pertaining 1o any mittar oulsds our business are not 1o be takan as andorsed by ComfarDelGra Corporatian
Limited or its related companies The commenis/proposals provided are for discussion purposas only and are subject to spprovale. Nathing herein
£hall constitute a binding agreeman! bebwesn e parties. Nailher party shall be bound in any way o any term ar condifion except as agresd in a
WIITEN agreement signed by 1he duly authormed representabives of both parmes

ComfonDeiGro - a Gresn Office certified by the Singspore Environment Council - ls commititad 1o presening the envitanment. We ancourage you
te prind this only if necessary

ComforiDelGro Enginaenng Pte Lid [Registration Mo 1 HO50604EW)




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pel [LEKAuUtS)
Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 10:32 AM
To; claims@transcab com sg
Co transcab_avaclaims @ava-ins.com; Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 87T AND SHD 4183M ON 12/05/2019 ALONG/AT RIVER
VALLEY ROAD
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
15 May 2019
Uranscab Taxi
Singapore
Dear Sir,

OUR REF  : CC4/ASM19008528/K1phb3 // S9MOINTN
YOUR REF :SHD 878T
ACCIDENT

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Ple Ltd to deal with the third party claim against vour policy.

We have recelved a claim from COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD acting on behall of the owner of SHD
4183M against your motor insurance policy.

We lughlight that this accident has not been reported to your insurer, Under the Motor Claims Framework (MCF],
vou are required to report any accident with the acadent vehicle (whether damaged or not) within 24 hours or by
the next working day after the accident. The primary purpose of this reporting is to provide your version of the
accident to AXA. We would appreciate it if vou could urgently file a report at approved reporting centre,

We also wish Lo advise that there is an excess of S85000 /- is attached with Third Party Claims. Please be informed
thit vou shall be liable for the excess following any settlement of the third party claim. The applicability of the
excess is as lollows

1) Any settlement equal to or above the excess, you shall be llable to make the payment of $5000/-; or
2] Any settlement below the excess, you shall be liable for the amount settled.

We shall keep you informed of the third party claim settlement and thereafter kindly let us have the excess
payment in your cheque payahle to "AXA Insurance Pre Ltd". Please indicate your vehicle registration number and
the date of accident on the back of the cheque

Notwithstanding the excess being applied and for received by us for the above subject matter, we expressly reserve
all our rights under the policy to refund the excess payment In the event that there arises any known policy breach
and or exclusion material to coverage.

As Insurers, we shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third



party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10 days from the
date of this letter. You intent must be formally expressed to AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following i{not provided at
our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Paolice report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traific Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or forelgn driving license (If any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and /or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party[s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge
and consent. Il you recelve any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with

this accident, please forward it to us immediately, You may email It to cst@axa.com.sg / chewht@kkauto.com
or deliver It by hand to AXA Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach
of policy terms and conditions you and /or your authorised driver may have committed,

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim({s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
mdemmity upon conclusion of the matter(s),

If vou need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6742 3197 or email us at
chewhiolkkauto.com,

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively,

Thank youw

Bt Spgards

Shu Pei) Adoun

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6I66-0055 | emall: shups B lkkautt com | Tan: 6741-4108
Ak 51, Paya Ul indwstnal Fark, Uby Avenue 1, 80225 | 3(408333)



COMFORIDELLGRO

ENGINEERING
Our Job Ref No 305295041
ComimtDeiGm E Fio Lid
Date 14.05.19 &G Layang Crve ?Wlmﬂ:ﬁm
Fon 6545 B156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LEK Fax
At Mr KALVIN ANG
Vehicle Reg Na SHD4183M CTPL 12.05.19
The survey and estimates of the rapairs of the above-mantioned vehicle are as follows:-
1. The repair job shafl bill to: AXA -— SHDBTET
2 Thi finalzed amount shall be:
(sl  Spare Parts after List discount o
(e}  Labour Charges
Total for Pari-By-Part Repair Cost —
fe.) Lumpsum Repair (If applicabla)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: 20% _ sasooo0
Final Lumpsum Repair cost 85000
X Estimated normal period for repairs; 2 working days
4. We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed If there Is no reply from you within
7 working days
1 Thank you far your assistance. We confirm the estmates and
finalized amoun
Signature e Signature g
Name - LIMKWOKENG Name - oAb
Te  : 62148316 Date 1%/5/14
L
Foax 654668156
‘For Official Use Only
Document Coni
ltam Amount Afteched (Signat E’; Remarks
Yes or Mo
1. Rantal Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paid ND
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fes
5. Medical Fees (on behall
af driver, if applicable)
6 Overrun

- ﬁ'«.f Aﬁ-—# -‘-&-{ 4 s ﬁ;frﬂ/{
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MUTUAL SETTLEMENL FOR MO LOR ACCIDENT

We the undersigned hersby agree to mutually setlle among surselves a motor
(]

accident a2 follows:

DateTime - 13]s[14 05105
Along . P“"ﬂ’ Vﬂl‘dﬂ [ ﬂ{ﬂ"fﬁ Lornie WYl Pd
Involving : D‘“E‘:‘)M_I Eh*)&f”'}T

Neither party will report the accident to the relevant authorities as there are no

persanal injuries involved.

Both purties have agreed to settle this matter amicably as follows:
*Delete (a) or (b) as applicable

*(a) Neither party shall be liable to compensate the other party for any loss or
damages (direct.or indirect) incurred a5 a result of the accideny Each party shall
bear their own repair cost.

*(b) Without admission of lisbility, SHDST78T

(party paying éompensation) hes paid a sum of § 1?3(?4' 62 which
S‘HD‘T’I&E” (owner of vehicle receiving compensation)

hereby acknowledges recsipt in full and final setilement of all damages and costs

incurred and/or 1o be incurred as a result of this accident.

Stg;namrc @53 [!ﬁggé KE"‘L\ Signarure

5 AU AYlame LQQ Cﬁ.mkﬁ' Hrhhff_
ur::m : e LC No - S683779i1
Address :BIK AST 463212  Address -

TG wdest (4] |
Speve LYokl

Vehicle no ggﬂa zgg ) Vehicle no : EHD‘f‘ngM
Contact oo - fl 5 () é rd H - Contact no . ?56‘? ?a’-ﬁ‘i’-—

Date ;j&'*‘ﬁ'—-lﬂ"\ Date - ;g/g/laf‘f

"Thz contants of this documenl apply 1o vehicle
damages only. All p=rsonalinjuries and damages
arising therairam are excludad from the ambit
and e app 'Irr "Ia 1 o this documeant”




sMerz08 Claim Portal

LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD(TP) = Menu

. Pls get TP (CDGE Taxi) company to give consent on private
settlement

Type
© Question

Message
Hi Shu Pel, as spoken please get written consent [company stamp on the settlement form, or a separate
letter from CDGE Taxi).

Reply

hitps.ivp smariclaims. axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmi/index-vendor-service-requests_htmil#/sarvice-requesisiview-message/?serviceRequestiNumbe... 11



MUTUAL SETTLEMENT FORMOTOR ACCIDENI

We the undersigned hereby agree to mutually ssutle among ourselves a motor

accident as follows:

n]s]g 05 :05

Date/Time
Along - Py Vﬂuﬁj b abrev Lovne HI| P
Involving . SiD 4183 M i EHD&:}'&T

Neither party will report the accident to the relevant authorities as there are no

persomal injunies involved.

Both parties have agreed 1o settle this matter amicably as follows:

*Delete (a) or (b) as applicable

*(a) Weither party shall be liable to compensate the other pany for any loss or
damages (direct.or indirect) incurred as a result of the accident Each party shall

bear their own repair cost.

“(b) Without admission of liabili, SHDS78T
(party paying Gompensation) hes paid o sum of § i.?'-'qq"éz which
SHD 1’[33?’? (owner of vehicle receiving compensation)

hereby acknowledges recsipt in full and final settlement of all damages and costs
incurred and/or o be incurred as o result of this accident. (%é(

i
Signanure = (g CRVE WEM( Signature :
Neme ;. 0 G 4 AYfeme . [ee Ci!.unjf Hiee
VCNo IC No :_ S683779i1
Address :QBIK 659 HoF-2 2 Address :
TG st U |
SPoe 4o ATY

Vehicle no gkﬁ] zﬁ i Vehicle no : SHD+|33M
Contact no ; E|ﬁfzéz - Contactne : F6699202

Due ]S —&—2019 Date T e

"Tha contents of this document apply 1o vehm RTDELGRD ENGINEERING PTE LTD
damages anly. All personal injuries and damagss
arising therafrem are excluded from the ambit m

2~d application ef this documeant”
- e R TAN PEI WE|
Manager
Crash Rapalr




VI 74l 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

o ! & 2 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 62586 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg No: 18980718BR GST Reg. No 10-8607198-R

Alflliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Raf CC4/ASM18008528/MK1pb3qg2
ORGP ORE o1 owe: zsasaos [N
ATTN:PETER Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 878T Veh. Inspected SHD 4183M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SOMOTNTN Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 13/05/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI SONATA c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. KMHET41VMCAB24605 Colour BLUE
Odometer 275350 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/80 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/80 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 12/0572019 Inspection Date 13052019
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508869 ~
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




-V

L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 198607188R GST Reg MNo. 19-9607188-R Page Mo.:1 aof 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 4183M
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By [Our Adjusted
orkshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RADIATOR GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 28210 28210
1|RADIATOR GRILLE U MOULDING (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 108.80
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 538.80 538.80
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP(LH) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 22.40
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (LH) (COMNSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 2010
LESS 20% DISCOUNT =194 46 -164.18
7i7.84 856.72
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) (COMNSISTENT) CRACKED 25.00 25.00
1|FRONT NO.PLATE TRIM COVER [SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 30.00
55.00 2500
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING 400.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 300.00 200.00
700.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 153284 1.081.72
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 850.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) Ve

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19008528/K1pb3g2

KALVIN ANG WE! KUN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator

,g«ﬁ
[

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

MBCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES: - This Report is made solsly for the use and benslil of the Climnt named on the oot pege of (his Repont

oo liability
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