Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 10:37 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 63796487165G-003 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV1462Y AND

SDS5680G ON 11/05/2019]

Dear Jia Le

Referring to the above matter.
Please be informed we have repudiated matter to OID & Ol under the terms & conditions of the motor policy.
Please follow up with the necessary (i.e. TP repairer) to re-direct the TP claim to OID & OI.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Friday, January 24, 2020 11:15 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 63796487165G-003 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV1462Y AND SDS5680G ON

11/05/2019]

Hi Jia Le

Following up to my earlier email.

Please request for Ol rental agreement from Policy Holder (Allswell Motor Traders) as well for our consideration.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd



78 Shenton Way #08-16 Smgapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:27t" January to 3" February 2020

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Friday, January 24, 2020 11:03 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 63796487165G-003 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV1462Y AND SDS5680G ON
11/05/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Jia Le

Referring to this mandate request.
Please assist to obtain a clear copy of OID ‘s driving licence and IC.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:27*" January to 3" February 2020

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 05, 2019 4:46 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your ref: 63796487165SG [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV1462Y AND SDS5680G ON

11/05/2019]

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

AlG Ref: 63796487165G
LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19008434/T1da3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 14462(0OI) AND SDS 5680G(TP) ON 11/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance to the
MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he is aware that NCD (if any) would be

aoffected,.
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We seek your approval to offer fo Third Party repairer, “EM-1 AUTO PTE LTD” is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $21,967.36 $11,770.00
2. Loss of Rental (12days x $130)(w/GST) [ $ 1,669.20 $ 1,284.00 (12days x
$100) (w/GST)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 36.45 $ 36.45
Total | $23,673.01 $13,090.45

**16days recommendation for repair + 35un + 3days in traffic compound = 22days.
All the relevant documents had been uploaded in Merimen.

Kindly let us have your mandate in Merimen,

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madam,

Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Monday, 17 February 2020 11:14 AM

Chia Sin Muk

Admin A

RE: LOD - SDS 5680G, your ref, no. SKV1462Y, DOA : 11.05.2019 TP - AIG *** LKK
REF: CC4/AIG19008434/T1da3

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 1462Y & SDS 5680G ON 11/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our principal have repudiated the matter due to the terms & conditions of the

motor policy.

As such, you may forward the claim to our insured and/or driver directly.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: Chia Sin Muk <emlautopteltd @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 5:54 PM
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD - SDS 5680G, your ref, no. SKV1462Y, DOA :11.05.2019 TP - AIG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find the attached LOD.

COR :$11,770.00

LTA :$ 7.45
GIA : % 29.00

LOR : $ 1,669.20 (12 days X $130) include GST



Kindly arrange for settlement.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | 0: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643

Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R
important: This email is confidential and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us immediately; you should not

copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other persan. Thank you



