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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Plesse ropor corrocily the details of the accident fo apaed up the claims process

7. This Form must be complaied by the Policyholdar andlor the Autfonsed Dmeer.

L ilorration provided must be as truthful and sccurats as possible. Any wilfiul misrmpressniaton of witholding of maleral facls moy allow insurance comparnel O
repudinte policy Rability

4 Tha lssun and sccapiancs af ihis Farm by Insurence companies is not an admission af palicy llability an the pant of the naumnce companiss.

£ Ay (alsn reporting may be referred o the Police for Investigation.

B This reporn will be forwanded By 1nae maurers of me GlA Aecords Managoment Centre sstaglished by e Ganaml inurance Associadion of Singapors (GIA) for
archisiing and that cogses al this repart will, lor a lea. be made avallable upen applcation by interesiad pariies

7, By ine iodgemant of this repor o the insurens, you horeby consant 1o the archiving of thees report at the centre and o copses ol fve report baing mads available
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Rapar 11/03/2019 18:55
Data Of Acoident 11/03/2018 11:30
Exact Location Of Accident ALONG CLEMENTI AVE 6
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vahicle Registration Number YP4100M.
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner GOLDBELL LEASING PTELTD
Co Reg No 189001196N
Emall Address NODEMAIL
Maobile Phaone No
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-E4842833
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer MITSUBISHI
Modl FUS0-7.5 D FMBESFM2RDEB (M)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Arg you claiming under your own insurance policy NO
for repair to your vehicle?

Il No, Please stale aclion to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vvanicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
Type Of Coverage THIRD PARTY

Flaal Policy YES

Policy Number D-1809075TMFCY

Cover Nole Numbaor
Driver

Momea of Driver
Passpor Na/FIN
Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gondar

Kobille Number

Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

RAJENDRAN PAULRAJ
G5218902R

05/03/18488

QUTDOOR

D6/11/2015

3 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-87370375

NOEMAIL
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* Insusance Company Name
MNalure Of Damage FRONT PORTION

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver) 1
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TS Claim Portal

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP} =

Re:RE: Obtain TP evidence and PIR | Proceed to Reject

Type
© Question

Message

Meni

Hi, In view of site photos and no further evidence, TP encroached into Insured's lane. Proceed to reject,

Thanks

Reply

hitps:iivp smartciaims. axa com.sg/claim-portalhtmlindex-vendor-sarvice-requests himi#fsarvice-requestaiview-message/ TsarvicaRequastNumba.

in




- Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 2:04 PM

To: Susan Low

Subject: RE: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Our ref : SOMO1GRUMC/LK *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19008415/Uga3

Your Ref: YP 4100M without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/ASM17008415/Uga3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 3445U & YP 4100M ON 11/03/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy ol our insured accident statement for your easy reference.
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We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accident. Your client
encroached info Our Insured lane leading to the collision base on the accident scene photo as attached in
your client report,

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client’s
matter,

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you Is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of lability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should It be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@®[kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESES D
SeERER NS Save the Earth: Print only when necessary:

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 9:59 AM

To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Subject: RE: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Our ref : SOMO1GRUMC/LK *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19008415/ga3

Dear Susan,
As this is a conflicting case, we shall base on the scene photo to review the case,
We have email to AXA to get further instruction.

Thank you

Best Regards,




Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultanis Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Susan Low [mailto:liusbro @ymail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 9:50 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Our ref : S9MO1GRUMC/LK *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19008415/ga3
Our client did not have any In-Car Video clip.

By the way, please assist and arrange to let us have the accident photographs showing the vehicles
involved and/or VVTV/In-car camera video footages of the accident and/or other evidence to support your
client’s claim

Kindly revert
Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
MNo. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kak| Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Tuesday, 28 May 2019, 5:07:33 pm SGT, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CecillaChong @ Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Susan,

Content noted.

Kindly provide us Video Footage / Evidence for our viewing. Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 67494274 | emnil: CectlinChong @lkkouo.com) fx: 6741-4108

Bl 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Susan Low [mailto.liusbro@ymail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 28 May 2019 3:29 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Our ref : SSM01GRUMC/LK *** LKK REF:

CC4/ASM19008415/ga3

Kindly be informed our client driver did not lodged police report for the case as no injuries involved

Therefore no “Final Police Investigation Result” for this case.
Thank

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Tuesday, 28 May 2019, 9:25:21 am SGT, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong & |kkauto.com> wrota:

Without Prejudice




Dear Susan,

We refer to the above matter

The liability Is unclear,

Kindly provide us with evidence and do advice if PIR(if any) is available from your end.

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you s strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of
our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Cecilla Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 8748-4274 | emall: CeciliaChong @ Ikkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

LXK w  Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2018 3:40 PM

To: Susan Low <liusbro @ ymail.com>

Ce: CS A Team <cs-a@ Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@ lkkauto.coms; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
<CeciliaChong @ lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments @ lkkauto, com>

Subject: RE: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Qur ref : SSMO1GRUMG/LK *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19008415/ga3




SAVEASTOCOSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,
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*  PIR result (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact EEEIEEISTEEEEE

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Best Regards.

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | emall: MeiKwan @ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 May, 2019 10:09 AM

To: DHIWAR Namrata <namrata.dhiwar @ axa.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Our ref : SSMO1GRUMC/LK

We did like to chose as follow
Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
Kindly arrange

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Monday, 13 May 2019, 9:31:51 am SGT, DHIWAR MNamrata <namrala.dhiwar @axa.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir, Prejud

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to conduct the joint pre-
repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.




List of our motor surveyors:-
1. Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman/ Chris Ang (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
2. Stan See Chee Seng/ T. Thiyagarajan (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
3. Sebastian Kong Wel Siang (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
4. Ricky Teng/ Eigene Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)
§. Michael Chong/ Elson Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)
6. Simon Ho!/ Mohammed Rasul (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
7. Ma Chin Fook/ Adrian Ling/ Chua Weijie (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
8. Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
8. Philip Phoong/ Victor Seng (A-Pac Adjuster & Surveyors Pte Ltd)

10. AXA in house surveyors

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as
a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair
survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate quotation in order for our
surveyor to complete the pre repair survey

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause of
action, save as to costs and expenses.

Regards,

Mamrata Dhiwar

From: Susan Low [mailto:liusbro@ymail com)]

Sent: Saturday, May 11, 2019 8:43 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor. survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey YP4100M Claims against GBE3845U

Accident on 11/03/2019 Along Clementi Avenue &

Involving YP4100M and GBE3645U



We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims.

We hereby write to request of 3rd party claims pre-repair inspection for our client's vehicle.

Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to our
client's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883 as soon as possible.

Kindly arrange.

Thank you.

Best Regard|

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshap
No, 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6741 1730

Fax: 6744 5746

Date of Survey:-

Name of Authorise Surveyor:-

Surveyor Email:

Remark -

——Disclaimer-——-

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are not the
intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have received this
message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely
those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any ather entity of the AXA
Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

10




Taz019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTELTD (TP - Menu

<« RE: Re:RE: Obtain TP evidence and PIR | Proceed to Reject

Type
© Question

Message
Dear Lynn, Noted. So we shall proceed to submit WP report to your good office as survey has been done.
Thanks - Cecilia 03/07/2019

Ritply

hitps.iivp smanclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portalhimlindex-vendor-service-requests himi#/service-requestsiview-message/TsarviceRequestNumbe... 111



SINGAPORE

Tralfic Pol
POLICE FORCE 10 Ul Averae 3

Singapare 408805
Tel +65 6547 0000
Fan +65 6547 4883
Wi, police. pov.sg

Our Ref : TPNP/21163/2019

Date : 18 AUGUST 2019

RECEIVER

RAJENDRAN PAULRAJ

18 TUAS AVENUE 10 17 AUG 2019

LEVEL 6

SINGAPORE 639142 GBL OPS ADMIN

Dear Sir/Madam

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 3645 U AND YP 4100 M ALONG CLEMENTI
AVENUE 6 ON 11/03/2019 AT ABOUT 11.20AM

| refer to the above accident.
Please be informed that our investigation has not produced any substantive result. However, this
does not preclude further prosecution should new evidence emerge later.

Yours faithfully,

HEAD INVESTIGATION
TRAFFIC POLICE
SINGAPORE POLICE FORCE

This is a computer-generated letter. No signature is required.

A FORCE FOR THE NATION




Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 5:26 PM

To: Susan Low

Subject: RE: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M OQur ref : SOM0O1GRUMC/LK *** LKK REF;
CC4/ASM1900B8415/Uga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Susan,

Our principal has revert back to us on the outcome.

Based on scene photos and Our Insured report of circumstances, under no evidences, TP would have
encroached into Insured's lane. Our princiapl have also spoken to Insured legal partner, they will proceed with
legal summons. Hence, we have our principal’s instruction to maintain rejection.

Thanks

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should It be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong@ [klkauo.e fux: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(4089:43)

F EALS

S22 SETT e the Earthe Prind only when necessary-

From: Susan Low

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 7:45:17 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Acknowlegement Your ref : YP4100M Our ref : S9MO1GRUMC/LK *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19008415/Uga3

We refer to our attachment “Final PIR" for your perusal.

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 £01-01

AutoBay @ Kakl Bukit



y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
I'A. TEL 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-960T198-R
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AXA INSURANCE PTELTD : C4/ASM19008415/Uga3q2

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 .
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 L SRER I||| II|I]I|II|I|II

ATTNILYNN Code . ASM

1.

Insured Veh,  GBE 3845U Veh. Inspected YP 4100M

Policy No. VCA/P2029103 Coverage ($) 0.00

Claim No. SaMO1GRU Excess ($) 0.00

Assign From Assign Date 13/0572018
~ Vehicle Particulars & Condition '

Make & Model MITSUBISHI FUSO FMB5 (M) |c.c 7545

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018

Chassis No. FMB5FMA30139 Colour WHITE

Odometer 157178 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL

General GOOD

R/H Front Tyre [205/80 R22.5 AUSTONE |8 mm

L/H Front Tyre |295/80 R225 AUSTONE |6 mm

R/H Rear Tyre |285/80 R22.5 (D) AUSTONE ' 86 mm -

LUH Rear Tyre [205/80 R22.5 (D) AUSTONE 6/6 mm

> i :-:i 'I_'-_ Lam L
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,

-—
!

Accident Date  11/03/2019 _
Survey held at LIU'S BROTHER AUTD ENGINEERING WORKSHOP

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

13/05/2018

AarKs

AJTHE IHEF‘E WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




REAR LH SAFETY BAR 'CENTRE’ BRACKET SIDE
(CONSISTENT)
REAR LH TAIL LAMP (CONSISTENT)

REAR LH POWERGATE PUMP INNER (CONSISTENT)
REAR LH POWERGATE PUMP OUTER (CONSISTENT)
LESS 50% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
REAR LH SAFETY BAR (CONSISTENT) (SN)
REAR LH SAFETY BAR BRACKET (CONSISTENT) (SN)

REAR LH SAFETY BAR 'CENTRE' BRACKET
(CONSISTENT) (SN)

REAR LH POWERGATE PUMP INNER COVER
(CONSISTENT]) (SN)

REAR LH POWERGATE PUMP OUTER COVER
(CONSISTENT) (SN)

REAR LH POWERGATE WIRE COVER (CONSISTENT)
(SN)

REAR LH POWER GATE SIDE PANEL (CONSISTENT) (SN}

REAR LH PILLAR (CONSISTENT) (SN)
REAR LH POWERGATE OIL (CONSISTENT) (SN)

LABOUR

TO CHECK ALL WIRING & ELECTRICAL COMPONENT
FOR PROPER FUNCTION ,

LABOR FOR PANEL BEATING ,CUT WELD STRAIGHTEN
& REPLACING PARTS ETCS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF REAR LH POWER GATE SIDE PANEL

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TOUCH UP
PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED .

TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ,RESEAL TUFF-CDATING
TREATMENT ON ACCIDENT AREA

NOT NECESSARY

CRACKED
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE

DISTORTED
BENT

BENT
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
TORN

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

DENTED
NOT NECESSARY

MOT NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18008415/Uga3q2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 109607198R GST Reg No. 19-8607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YP 4100M

Page No..1of 2

180.00 -
325.00 325.00
1,650.00
1,650.00
-162.50
3,805.00 162.50
350.00 350.00
180.00 180.00
400.00 400.00
320.00
320.00
250.00 250.00
850.00
400.00 400.00
200.00 =
3270.00 1,580.00
50.00 2000
800.00 600.00
400.00 2B0.00
60.00 -
1,310.00 900.00
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-|IJ Ex J
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19008415/Uga3q2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensod Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Repan is mame salsly far the use and benefit af fhe Clant named an the trenl page of this Repar
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