Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 6 July 2020 10:11 AM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)

Cc: Admin A; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD1130M [AIG] & PC6045B ON 02/02/2018;
BPS/04/18/3001/PT

Attachments: POLICE INVESTIGATION RESULT.pdf

OUR REF: CC4/A1G19008410/Jkb3
Without Prejudice

Dear Ms. Karen,

We refer to the subject matter.

Kindly be informed that the police investigation result(as attached) is against your client (PC6045B — Bus-Plus Services
Pte Ltd).

As such, we have our principal’s instruction to reject the third party claim and that we are unable to look into your
client’s claim.

We will now close the matter in our end.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention
of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should
be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 June 2020 11:09 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
<TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD1130M [AIG] & PC6045B ON 02/02/2018; BPS/04/18/3001/PT



Dear Khanchna,
We do not have a copy of PIR as you requested for.

Thanks,
Karen Chan
Claims Department

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 30, 2020 10:55 AM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD1130M [AIG] & PC6045B ON 02/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We would like to request a copy of police investigation result in order for us to look into the matter.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention
of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should

be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 11:54 AM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD1130M [AIG] & PC6045B ON 02/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



We would like to request a copy of police investigation result in order for us to look into the matter.
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention
of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should
be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 2:07 PM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & TA/Claims & [A/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD1130M [AIG] & PC6045B ON 02/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please ignore our e-mail sent on 16/12/2019.

We would like to request a copy of police investigation result in order for us to look into the matter.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention
of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should

be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




