Zayyer

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 12 February, 2016 5:07 PM

To: Zayyer

Subject: FW: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING
VEHICLES SKB9837C AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

Importance: High

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 February, 2016 11:38 AM

To: 'MTC'

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Vic; Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

Importance: High

1*' REMINDER
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sarah,
We refer to your email below.
Kindly revert acceptance for our closure of this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MTC [mailto:mtc@mega-auto.com.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January, 2016 9:34 AM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

Dear Bevan,

Sorry for our delay.



We still waiting for our client’s respond of your offer SS 1,200.00.
Will update you shortly.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Sarah Chan

Mega Auto Pte Ltd
Tel :9815 0616

Fax : 6455 3290

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January, 2016 9:02 AM

To: MTC

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Vic; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Kindly revert acceptance for our closure of this file.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 January, 2016 2:43 PM

To: 'MTC'

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Vic

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

May we wrap up the matter at a global sum of $1,200.00(all-in)
Kindly revert acceptance for closure of this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MTC [mailto:mtc@mega-auto.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January, 2016 2:54 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

Dear Bevan,

For quickly resolve this matter. We wish to counter offer at global sum S$1,350.00(All In).

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Sarah Chan

Mega Auto Pte Ltd
Tel :9815 0616

Fax : 6455 3290

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January, 2016 2:16 PM

To: MTC

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Vic; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
Kindly revert acceptance for closure of this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 December, 2015 12:39 PM

To: 'MTC'

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Vic

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)



Without Prejudice
Save As to Cost

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to your email below.

We maintain our offer as per our email dated 22/10/2015 unless your client is able to provide us with evidence for
our review.

Kindly re-consider our offer for an amicable settlement

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MTC [mailto:mtc@mega-auto.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 October, 2015 11:45 AM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C
AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

Dear Bevan,

We refer to your email dated 22.10.2015.

We're regret to inform that we are unable to accept.

We have confirmed and verified with our client.

Our client maintains that throughout the time, your insured encroach to our client’s lane.

Also, the scene photo show your insured’s vehicle toward to the right side. So we believe BOLA s15 is applied.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Sarah Chan

Mega Auto Pte Ltd
Tel :9815 0616

Fax : 6455 3290



From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 22 October, 2015 8:59 AM

To: mtc@mega-auto.com.sg

Cc: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Vic; Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

Subject: Your ref: SHA209R ,Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3 (ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C AND
SHA209R ON 06/02/2015)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
“SAVE AS TO COST”

Your ref: SHA209R
Our Ref: CC6/EQI15002608/T1ne3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB9837C AND SHA209R ON 06/02/2015
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair(w/GST) $ 1,530.10
2. Loss of Rental(4days x $95) $ 380.00
3. Loss of Income(4days x $50) $ 200.00
$ 2,110.10

@50% $ 1,055.05

3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 5.35

TOTAL $ 1.060.40

Kindly revert.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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