Su Li (LKK Auto)

From: Annabel Tan <annabel.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 May, 2015 10:32 AM

To: Su Li (LKK Auto); Hansel Ang

Cc: KKLau; Vivian Lau; Thin Thin; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SKB 9837C (Ol : EQI - TBA) & SHA 209R (TP : LKK -
CC6/EQI15002608/T1we3) on 06.02.2015

Attachments: SKB9837C 06022015.pdf

Categories: LSL1

Hi Su Li,

Please refer to attached Ol Report.
Hi Hansel,

Please file for records.

Thank you both

Regards,

Annabel Tan
Assistant Manager, Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

22 Gemmill Lane, Singapore 069257
DID: 6496 9115

Tel: 6223 9433

Fax: 62234190
WWW.eqginsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

WE ARE MOVING!

With effect from 25 May 2015 (Monday), our new address will be:

5 Maxwell Road, #17-00 Tower Block, MND Complex, Singapore 069110
Tel : 6223-9433 ; Fax : 6220-3903

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) [mailto:suli@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, May 15, 2015 4:40 PM

To: Hansel Ang

Cc: KKLau; Vivian Lau; Thin Thin; Annabel Tan; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SKB 9837C (OI : EQI - TBA) & SHA 209R (TP : LKK -
CC6/EQI15002608/T1we3) on 06.02.2015

Dear Hansel,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s accident report as TP’s repairer is keep chasing for the settlement.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: admin-a@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2015 9:52 AM

To: 'hansel.ang@eqinsurance.com.sg'

Cc: KKLau; Vivian Lau; Thin Thin; 'Annabel Tan'; Admin-A (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SKB 9837C (Ol : EQI - TBA) & SHA 209R (TP : LKK - CC6/EQI15002608/T1we3)
on 06.02.2015

Dear Hansel,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s accident report as TP’s repairer is keep chasing for the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: admin-a@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 March, 2015 2:32 PM

To: 'hansel.ang@eqinsurance.com.sg'

Cc: KKLau; Vivian Lau; Thin Thin

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SKB 9837C (Ol : EQI - TBA) & SHA 209R (TP : LKK - CC6/EQI15002608/T1we3)
on 06.02.2015

Dear Hansel,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s accident report as TP’s repairer is keep chasing for the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: admin-a@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-A (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 13 February, 2015 2:30 PM
To: hansel.ang@eginsurance.com.sg




Cc: KKLau; Vivian Lau; Thin Thin

Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SKB 9837C (Ol : EQI - TBA) & SHA 209R (TP : LKK - CC6/EQI15002608/T1we3) on
06.02.2015

Dear Hansel,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHA 209R AT M/S Mega Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report , estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice for your perusal.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID 6841 8625.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: admin-a@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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