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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 8:04 AM

To: Vimmala D/O Raja Singam; SUR
Subject: RE: Enquire on market value- SKT6578A
Dear Mala,

The market value of SKT 6578A is $21K-$23K (Estimated) as at May 2019.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vimmala D/O Raja Singam <vimmala_rajasingam@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Saturday, 11 May 2019 2:58 PM

Subject: Enquire on market value- SKT6578A

Importance: High

Hi,

Please assist to check on the market value.
Attached the PARF/COE rebate details.

Date of accident : 04/05/2019
Regards,
Mala (Ms)

Senior Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2471 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | vimmala_rajasingam@®sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leo

ng Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg §§ S5 W

A Member of B RLTR INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner [D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Modeh:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Please note that the 5-vear COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

Singapore NRIC
5822E

Deny !

SKT6578A

No

06 May 2019
HONDA
CIVIC20LA

Beige

2007
K20Z222501813
JHMFD264075201813
114.0 kW (152 bhp)
$21,829.00

01 Cct 2007

01 Cct 2007

2

$24,012.00

Forfeited

$0.00

30 Sep 2022

B - Car (1601cc & above)
5

$25,178.00

$17.12100

$17,121.00

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable}, whichever is earfier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 May 2019
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