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FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
BLK1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-46,48,50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

VEHICLE NO:SKR T175H

ary PARTICULAR

1PCS BONNET

1PCS FRONT BUMPER /58 347
1PCS FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDEROVS  //#- &)
1PCS FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMPCOVER OIS T/ 1
1PCS FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER MOULDING OVS
2PCS FRONT BUMPER PDC SENSOR O/S @$305.00

1 SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS

1PCS FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT

1PCS FRONT BUMPER SPONGE /4. 33
1PCS FRONT BUMPER LOWER TRAY GARNISH

1PCS FRONT BUMPER RADER SENSOR 3 2§ -f0
1PCS FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER /75 2v
1PCS HEADLAMP ASSY OIS 3342-¥3
1PCS HEADLAMP TOP PANEL O/S

1PCS HEADLAMP INNER LOWER BRACKET O/S

1PCS FRONT GRILLE 11f3. FT
1PCS FRONT FENDER O/S

1PCS FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELD O/S

1 SET FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELD CLIPS O/S

1 PCS FRONT SPORT RIM QS

1PCS HEADLAMP BALLAST SENSOR /S

1PCS FRONT SUPPORT PANEL

1PCS AlIR CON CONDENSER

1PCS FRONT FENDER LOWER CHROME MOULDING O/S

LABOUR CHARGES:

TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING PDC SENSOR

TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING

TO REPROGRAMME & RESET SYSTEM

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page | of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Business

Owner 1D: 5668K

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SKR7175H

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 09 May 2019
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model: E 250 SEDAN (R17)
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: 27492030199463
Chassis No.: WDD2120362B033048
Maximum Power Output: 155.0 kW (207 bhp)
Open Market Value: $46,713.00

Original Registration Date: 03 Mar 2015

First Registration Date: 03 Mar 2015
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $52,399.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Mar 2025

PARF Rebate Amount: $39.299.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 02 Mar 2025

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $75,289.00

COE Rebate Amount: $43,757.00

Total Rebate Amount: $83,056.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 May 2019

OK

https://vrl.la.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereg InputFUNCTION _ID=F03...  08-May-19



Used Mercedes-Benz €250 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page | of 2
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S/a12018 Claim Portal

o. LEK ALITO CONSULTAMTE PTE LTDTH) - Mem

. Service Request Details

Claim
SOMOIMPH <A Medrlug

Reference

None #*

Loss Date
7 May 2019

Report Date
8 May 2019 9:33:18 AM

Request Date
¥ May 2019

Due Date
16 May 2019

Vendar Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Veehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

MNext Step
Agree to perfarm service

Vehicle Information

Incident Viehicle Registration #
SKR7175H

m.ﬂmu.mmmmwﬂmmuuwmmmﬂmwmm 112



g I Claim Portal

MOGE
E 250 SEDAN (R17)

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

SNG YUAN CHOON
BLK 320 JURONG EAST STREET 31, #05-88, 600320, Singapore

GSASSURE@GMAIL.COM

Claim Handler
WANG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Mezsages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

il



Cathérine Chana SLI{I{ Auto)

From: Nancy Lam <nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 11:13 AM

To: VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar

Subject: FW: Acknowledgement Your ref : SKR7175H  Our ref : SIMOIMPHMC/WG
Dear Sir, Without Prejudice

Please assign LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey the car.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Nancy Lam [ma'rltu:nanw.lam@fastechautu,mm.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, May 8, 2019 9:50 AM

To: 'VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar' <shekhar.batham@axa.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement Your ref : SKR7175H Our ref * SIMOIMPHMC/WG

Dear Sir, Without Prejudice

Please arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey the car.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pre Lid
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar [mailto:shekhar.batham@axa.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, May 8, 2019 9:46 AM
To: Nancy Lam <pancy. lam@fastechauto.com.sg>
Subject: Acknowledgement Your ref : SKR7175H Our ref : SAMOIMPHMC/WG

Dear Sir, Without Prejudice

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor warkshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our mator surveyors:-
1. Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman/ Chris Ang {LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
2, Stan See Chee Seng/ T. Thiyagarajan (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
3. Sebastian Kong Wei Siang (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
4. Ricky Teng/ Elgene Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)
5. Michael Chong/ Elson Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)
6. Simon Ho/ Mohammed Rasul (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
7. Ma Chin Fook/ Adrian Ling/ Chua Weijie (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
8. Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
9. Philip Phoong/ Victor Seng (A-Pac Adjuster & Surveyors Pte Ltd)
10. AXA in house surveyors



Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost
of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate
quotation in order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause of
action, save as to costs and expenses,

Repards,
Shekhar Batham

AXA Singnpore
BUSINESS
%34 SERVICES

redefining / services

From: Nancy Lam [malilto:nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, May 07, 2019 4:35 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA 5GP - Motor Survey <motar survey@axa com.sg>
Subject: Request for PRS SKR 7175H

Hi Sir,
My client claiming your insured SMC 915.
Please kindly arrange PRS for SKR 7175H.

Date of accident 07.05.2018.

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE DIRECTIONS
AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, you are require to provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within
2 days of the notice.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

FFastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8320

-----Disclaimer-—--

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee, If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or
opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Singapore - Externals or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and
duly authorized by the said companies.
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14 May, 2019
SNG YUAN CHOON
BLK 320 JURONG EAST STREET 31 #05-88.
Singapore 600320
Dear Sir,
OUR REF : CC4/ASM19008286/Ueb3
YOUR REF :SMC 1S

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 91S & SKR 7175H ON 07/05/2019 ALONG/AT
JURONG EAST CARPARK

We write to inform you that we are the appolinted loss adjuster by your motor insurer,
AXA insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your motor policy.

We refer to the above subject matter. We have received third party claim(s) against
your motor insurance policy.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be atfected as a result
ol the claim against your policy.

We highlight that this accident has not been reported to your insurer. Under the
Motor Claims Framework (MCF), you are required to report any accident with the
accident vehicle (whether damaged or not) within 24 hours or by the next working
day alter the acciden!. The primary purpose ol this reporling Is 1o provide your
version of the accident to AXA. Omission to repart the accident will result in a loss of
your No Claim Discount (NCD) upon renewal of your policy, and will prejudice any
claim(s) by or against you. We would appreciate it if you could urgently file a report
al our approved reporting centre.

The report has 1o be lodged at any of AXA Premium Workshops or reporting centras
{subject to your policy). For the list of AXA Premium Waorkshops conveniently located
throughoul Singapore, please refer to the back ol your Certificate of Insurance ar the
accompanying lolder, or visil hitps//www.axa.com.sg/cusiomer-care/personal/motor

lown identr ing.

Your full co-operation is required. Kindly submit the following when lodging the
report which list is not all inclusive and further document may be required:
« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police
offence and status (if any)
* Dnvers driving license or foreign dnving license (if any)




Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (it any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are 0 keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
slatus of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability
with any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any
compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If you receive
any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection
with this accident. please forward it to us immediately. You may email it 1o
ashersngi@lkkauio. com_or deliver it by hand to 51 Ubi Avenue 1. #01-25 Paya Ubi
ind. Park 5{408933).

You should also IMMEDIATELY forward us by hand any letters or Courts Summons
received from the other party involved in the accident. You should not negotiate,
admit liability or offer payment to them.

We would like to bring to your attention that under Policy Condition, your insurer
shall have full discretion in the process and settlement of the said third party claim
subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under the
policy.

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within
seven (7) days from date of this letter. In accordance with the policy conditions, your
insurer reserve the right to repudiate the said claim to you should you not give proper
notice to us of any occurrence which may give nse to it.

Kindly contact us at 6841 8051 If you have any further enquiries.

Yours sincerely,
Asher Sng
Claim Department

This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.

CC : AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
Motor Claim Department



« 1282020 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} = Menu

< PIs proceed DS with below revised quantum

Type
© Question

Message
Hi Vic, this case Ol reported reversing, while TP reparted Ol cutting lane. Either way Ol is Fully at fault.

COR: 7900 (additional -5% on labour, incl, GST): LOR: $450.00 ($130/day for 5 days for 2000CC); GIA:
£2.00. Sub-total: $8552.00. You may try offering 50/50 first.

Reply

hittps:/ivp.smartclaims.axa. com sg/claim-ponalhimiindex-vendor-service-reguests himi#iservice-requestsiview-message/PserviceRequestNumbe 1
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Company Registration Ne 1T 158R

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
Survey Details:
Date of loss 7-May-19
Date of appointment 10-May-19
Date of survey 9-May-19
Location of survey FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number SKR 7175H
Make and Model MERCEDES BENZ E 250 SEDAN [R17)
Date of registration 3-Mar-15
Excess
Market Value [est) $118,000.00
Parf Rebate (est) S83,056.00
Nett Loss (est) $34,944.00
Repair details:
|initial Estimate _1 5 23,330.07 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts 5 8,379.09
Check items [estimate) 5 -
Labour 5 1,250.00
Total S 9,629.09
Lump Sumlif applicable) S 7,700.00

[Number of days for repair |

PGS H2SAASET AN - RS RS E

Date: 21/01/2020



874 74
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Remarks:

We have not authorized repairs. Conflicting versions. It was reported
by Insured that she was hit at the rear left by TP vehicle while trying
to park at the lot. We had spoken to the Insured Ms Sng and she do
not have any video footoge available. She siad that she already
provided to the reporting centre her photos. TP reported that Insured
vehicle suddenly cut lane. NO EVIDENCE FROM BOTH PARTIES, A
letter was sent out to the Insured. TP LOD IN.

Mandate:

Liability(TP) 50%
Proposed Repair Cost ] 8,239.00 |w/gst
Loss of Use 5 - |no. of days
Loss of Rental 5 1,080.00 |5180 x 6 days
Loss of Income 5 - |no. of days
GIA Search Fees 5 2.00
Others (Medical Bills) 5 -
Sub Total 5 9,321.00

Proposed Toal at 50%| § 4,661.50




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

DATE :19.06.2019
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claim Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SKR 7175H AND SMC 918 ON 07.05.2019

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SKR7175H , which was involved in
the captioned accident with your insured vehicleno:  SMC 918 The vehicle owner has requested and suthorized

us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant. '

1) Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) $ 8,239.00
2) Loss Of Rental L 1,080.00
3) GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
] 9.321.00
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:
a) Final Repair Invoice b) Vehicle Registration Log Card
¢) Rental Agreement/Invoice d) VC & Driving Licence
¢) Insurance Certificate f) GIA Report/ GIA Search

g) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

Kindly lock into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
85 5007 as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you,
Yours faithfully, '
Jason Tang (jason@fastechauto.com.sg)

For Fastech Auto Pte Ltd




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax.Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice : 21067
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way Date: 19.06.2019
#27-01 AXA Tower Vehicle No:  SKR 7175H
Singapore 068811 Make/Model: MERCEDES E250
Accident Deze:  07,05.2019
Attn: Motor Claim Department Claim No : 0519-21067
Reference :
Polley No -
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 58 7,700.00
E.&0.E. Total : S§ 7,700.00
GST@ 7% : 88 539.00

Amount Due - S$ wg.ﬂﬂ

g

Ay

for FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
All Invaices are subjecied to GST
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner IDx:

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicie No.:
Vehicie to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicke Make:

Wehicle Model:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassls No.:
Madmum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Efigibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The Information contained herein is correct as at 07 May 2019

PARFIMNF Rahate Frmiin

Business
5668

SKR7175H
Yes

07 May 2019
MERCEDES BENZ

E 250 SEDAN (R17)
Sliver

2014
27492030199463
WDD21203628033048
155.0kW (207 bhp)
$44713.00

03 Mar 2015

D3 Mar 2015

0

$52.399.00

Yes
02 Mar 2025
$39.299.00

02 Mar 2025

8- Car above 1600cc or 97kW (1306hp)

10

§75.289.00
$43.802.00
583.101.00

mmwnmmmmm FELINL | NS ususuu | |

mm




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Vehicle Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No
SGQS555T

Make / Model
B.MW. / 3181 2.0 AT D/AB 2WD 4DR GAS/D SR DRL

Vehicle Type:
R10 - Private Hire (Self-Drive) Motor Car

Vehicle Attachment 1:
With Sun Roof

Vehicle Scheme :

Normal

Chassis Mo. :
WBAPF72060A794268

Propellant
Petrol

Engine No.:
B2391861N46B20BZ

Motor Mo :

Engine Capacity :
1995 cc

Power Rating .

Maximum Power Output:

100.0 kW (134 bhp)



Maximum Laden Weight :
1910 kg

Unladen Weight :
1390 kg

Year Of Manufacture:

2010

Original Registration Date :
29 Dec 2010

Lifespan Expiry Date :

COE Category .
E - Open Category

Quota Premium :

$76,102.00

COE Expiry Date:
28 Dec 2020

Road Tax Expiry Date :
28 Jun 2020

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date :
28 Dec 2020

Inspection Due Date:
28 Dec 2021

Intended Transfer Date

21 Jan 2020

CO2 Emission:

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised Amount :

-

CO Emission:

HC Emission:

NOx Emission :

PM Emission :



Fees To Be Paid For Transfer

Transfer Fees $25.00
Print oK 2
Save as PDF

Copy as Text



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 19-8507196-R

Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Re! CC4/ASM19008286/Uha3q2

A TOMRINGAPORE 01 owe. sz [

ATTN.PETER Code: ASM

1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SMC 81s8 Veh. Inspected SKR 7175H
Policy No. GA3B45111 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SEMOIMPH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 09/05/2019

2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E250(A) |c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 205
Chassis No. WDD2120362B033048 Colour SILVER
Odometer 277840 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

3. Conditions of Tyres B

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R17 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45 R17 PIRELLI B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45R17 PIRELLI B8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/45R17 PIRELLI & mm

4. Description of Damages : F
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT OfS PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. General Information )
Accident Date  O7/05/2019 Inspection Date 08052019
Survey held at FASTECHAUTO FTE LTD

1 KAK| BUKIT AVENUE B
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

HJIN AECGRD&NCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair 3
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKR 7T175H

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL 68258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 198607188R GST Reg. Wo. 19-9607188-R

- il el el

=l md ok =k =k ok -

—

—

BONNET (CONSISTENT)

FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT)
FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER O/S (CONSISTENT)
FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER O/S (CONSISTENT)

FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER MOULDING O/5
(CONSISTENT)

FRONT BUMPER PDC SENSOR O/S @$305.00
(CONSISTENT)

SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS {CONSISTENT)
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT)

FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (CONSISTENT)

FRONT BUMPER LOWER TRAY GARNISH (CONSISTENT)
FRONT BUMPER RADER SENSOR (CONSISTENT)
FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER (CONSISTENT)
HEADLAMP ASSY O/S (CONSISTENT)

HEADLAMP TOP PANEL O/S (CONSISTENT)

HEADLAMP INNER LOWER BRACKET O/S (CONSISTENT)
FRONT GRILLE (CONSISTENT)
FRONT FENDER O/S (CONSISTENT)

FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELD O/S (CONSISTENT)

SET FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELD CLIPS O/S
(CONSISTENT)

FRONT SPORT RIM O/S (CONSISTENT)

HEADLAMP BALLAST SENSOR O/S (CONSISTENT)
FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CONSISTENT)

AlR CON CONDENSER [CONSISTENT)
FRONT FENDER LOWER CHROME MOULDING /S

(CONSISTENT)

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

DISTORTED
BENT

TORN
NECESSARY

SHORTED

NECESSARY

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

TORN
CRACKED
SHORTED
CRACKED
BROKEN

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

BENT
CRACKED

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

TORN
NECESSARY

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

CRACKED

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19008286/Uha3q2

NOT NECESSARY

810.00

60.00
788.00

366.00
§10.00
450,00
211.00
4,880.00
685.00

295,00
1,183.82
1,051.45

266.50
50.00

1,205.00

315.20
42210

1.245.00
66.00

1.545.85
110.00
320
110.00

305.00

60.00

215.30
510.00
388.50
185.20
338243

285.00
1,183.82

266.50
50.00




_’ L7L” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

edis B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 198607158R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No.2 of 2

LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -831.01

20,430.07 8,379.09
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING . 80.00 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING PDC SENSOR . 80.00 50.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
TO REPROGRAMME & RESET SYSTEM 280.00 80.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 880.00 500.00

PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BONNET FRONT
BUMPER REINFORCEMENT HEADLAMP TOP PANEL
O/S,FRONT SPORT RIM O/S,FRONT FENDER 0O/S AND

FRONT SUPPORT PANEL

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1,500.00{ 600.00
2,900.00| 1,250.00

GRAND TOTAL 23,330.07 9,629.09

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appralser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY T THIRD PARTEES:- This Report s mads solsly for the use and bansfil of the Clismt named an the fronl pags of ihis Repan.
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