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51 UBLAVE 1, 801-235 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 40893} TEL : (65} 62563561 FAN @ (B65) 62564515

Your Ref: D19003058MFSH Date: 15 May 2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19008231/Eqd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLO 6122K .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 10/05/2019 at the premises of M/s N-31 AUTOMOTIVE. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount S8 9.956.64
Revised Estimate Amount :S8%  6.532.40
“Check” Items Amount : 5% - .
Market Value e - ;
LTA Reimbursement Value :S% - .
MNett Value : S% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

Steve
Automotive Assessor



MS‘ Fl rstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited o eq o 1950000060 GST Reg o, M2 00016754

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tel: {B5) 6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

Ulaims. & Motor Underwtiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 ity House Singagore 0ERATT
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 38439
W, mafirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

09-05-2018 Our Ref No. D19003058MFSH
07-05-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDBB42T Third Party Vehicle. SLQ6122K

2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #01-18 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
ZI TING

68420051/ 0 Fax No. 67410510

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE

Att . NIL
LTD ention

MNA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 11:36 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments; SUR

Cc: ‘Sithara'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003058MFSH/
Attachments: CSFCI19008231Eqd3.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLQ 6122K.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: has6-9561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(q08933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 4:15 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12003058MFSH/1

Dear Sithara,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLQ 6122K on 10/05/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan {(Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3501 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 4:05 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
esur{@lkkauto.com=

Ce: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003058MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed to survey on 10/5/2019.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 4:15 PM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'; assignments; SUR

Ce: 'Sithara’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003058MFSH/

Dear Sithara,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLQ 6122K on 10/05/2019.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent; Thursday, 9 May 2019 4:05 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15003058MF5H/1

Dear 5ir / Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed to survey on 10/5/2019.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 3:22 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003058MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

i
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date;
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 May 2019

Company
200G

SLO6122K
Mo

13 May 2019
HONDA

VEZEL 1.5% HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD

Black

2017

LEBS5948488
RU31248471

112.0 kW (150 bhp)
52647200

17 Jul 2017

17 Jul 2017

0

$£5,000.00

Yes
16 Jul 2027
£3.750.00

16 Jul 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$50,110.00

$40,963.00

£44,713.00

PEEEIS s vt r 1 g v, s P w8 BRI & B8 1 VLAY S LA L I BT T TR F ] LT 11 IS R |
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@F-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#11-17 / #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. : +635 6842 0051 Fax No. : +63 6741 0510
E-Mail : salesign51.com.sg

Company Reg. No, : 200616038C

GST Regisration MNo. ; 2006160330

GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Contact ; 66550005 96666053

Repair Code :
Date in :
Vehicle Num. :
Model :
Chassis/Eng# :

S8 10[S], 109
clkk) W e
LIl

MAiaﬁ
x

Sten

ESTIMATE
CLM15224
07/05/2019
SLQ6122K
HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
RU31248471/LEB5948488

Parts and Labour Assesment

Description of part

REAR BUMOER SIDE RETAINERLR  /~  OF

L

REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER

REAR BUMPER
rEu

REAR BUMPER REFLECTORLR 7 wni

/.f’

REAR BUMPER SIDE LR ~/ [Jf
e

REAR END PANEL ANTEMMNA SENSOR

REAR END PANEL #
[K
Py

al

REAR END PANEL BUZZLE SENSOR -~
REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH -

/

REAR EXHAUST CHROME TAIL PIPE
i

REAR EXHAUST RUBBER MOUNTING

REAR EXHAUST GASKET X
MA
REAR EXHAUST siLENCER Box % A/l
REAR FENDER INMER TRIM GARNISH L/R ~ f.lw
REAR FLOOR PANEL COMPARTMENT TRAY GARNISH -

REAR FLOOR PANEL INNER TOP BOARD COVER [ FY

i |

REAR TAILGATE 'HYBRID' EMBLEM /£

REAR TAILGATE -

C

#** This is a computer-generated document which requires no signature. ***

Qv Unit Price Amaount
2 23.00 46.00 /
| 762.70 762.70/
| 250,00 250,00,/
2 141.10 282,20
2 195.00 390.00 7
| 415.60 41560
1 Al 10 6010
1 £5.20 £5.20
| 9% 00 98,00
1 135.00 135.00 /
| 48.30 4830X
2 16.50 33.00
1 517.70 517.70 ¥
2 295.00 590.00 .~
1 48530 48530 /
I 195.00 195.00
| 933,30 953,30 -
! 75.80 75.80

page 1



¢N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17/ #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #(11-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. : +65 6842 0051 Fax No. : +65 6741 0510
E-Mail : salesf@ni|.com.sg

Company Reg. No. : 200616038C

GST Registration MNo. 1 200616038C

GRAB RENTALS FPTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Contact : 66550005 96666053

ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM15224
Date in: 07/05/2019
Vehicle Num. : SLQ6122K
Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Chassis/Eng# : RU31248471/LEB5948488
REAR TAILGATE 'VEZEL' EMBLEM - f‘l'rf:r | 26,20 56.20
REAR TAILGATE HINGES LR % f'.-""l 2 0,00 10000 *
REAR TAILGATE INNER PULL GARNISH .~ (fUl 1 27.50 27.50 /
REAR TAILGATE INNER RUBBER GUIDE STOPPER LR X Al 2 18.50 37.00 X
REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD . "f:‘ F- | 153.40 153.40
REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK (/] I 180.00 180.00
REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK STRIKER 7~ -'II"'.'JEII I 27.50 2750 X
REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNIsH X /N ! 220.00 220,00 ¥
REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH ' Logo evaLem X Ml 1 25.00 ¥ 2500
REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP ([ * | 96.80 96.80 /
REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL  / JILC 2 000 49 Z100.00
REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING it < 2 50.00 100,00 /
REARTAILLAMPLR  ~  [F Zl 474.60 a39.20% /¢ ;;,
Subtotal before discount 5_; ':'Irr \o 74495 80
Percentage discount  20% [ fg g‘;}b{ 1494, 16
Sub-total 1 5,996.64
REAR BUMPER CLIPS - SET A /1§ I 8000 77 §0.00
REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR e 1§ 1 35000 7y, 350.00

==* This is a computer-generated document which reguires no signature. ¥**

page 2



‘@R-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

ki Buki b
Kaki Bukit AutoHul KK Auto Consultants hence noﬂﬁ'

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 the Repa 1
#01-17/ #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27 epairer of the following:

Singapore 417921 Tel No. : +65 6842 0051 Fax No.: +65 6741 0510 'Iﬂ resurvey belore/afier spray painting

E-Mail : salesinSl.com.sg . D‘:' dssplay damaged part(s) during resurvey
Company Reg. No. : 2006160380 * Farts prices are subject to confirmation

GST Registration No. : 200616038C * Third party survey is on a “Without Prajudics™ basis

= No Regal mod lication]s) is alliowed
& Bupplementary dem{s) mus! ba resurveysd

1 subject o final approval from rn:uranE;e C:']F'M
GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD

18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY mmﬂwﬂamr
SINGAPORE 573960 ;::_am.

Contact : 66550005 96666053
ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM15224
Date in: 07/05/2019
Vehicle Num. : SLQ6122K
Model : HONDA VEZEL 1,5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Chassis/Eng# : RU31248471/LEB59484588

REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH CLIPS - SET . fit( ! soo0 107 30.00
REAR FENDER INNER TRIM GARNISH CLIPS LR - SET -~ M€ 2 so.00 15 10000
REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR MAT x AN | 30000 ¥ 300.00
REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS - SET -~~~ 1 soo0 (57 50.00
REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH CLIPS - SET  »~ .rl fU/L ( | 40.00 jE / 40.00
REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT : ,/j I 6000 407/ 60.00
REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS LR - SET 7 woo [S/ ) 60.00
Subtotal before discount _:_. S GI / 1,070,040
Percentage discount  (FMa (.00
Sub-total 2 1.070.00
Parts-total 7,066,064
LABOUR
To remove, reinstall electrical wiring harness, check lighting, and rewire for parking sensor. 20 10000
To remove, reinstall tailgate windscreen J'{ [ 15000
To remove, reinstall roof top trim upholstery, cushion seat, trim gamish, trim liner carpet, (o FR) 140.00 |- @
To re-spray painting on the rear bootlid, rear end panel. rear fender (L/R), spare tyre pancl and rear bumper. 749 4 1,100.00
To remove and change exhaust silencer box with pipe, re-align where necessary consistent to the accident. 0« 100,00
To provide labour, workmanship to change the above damaged bodyparts, repair, re-construct and re-align hody structure, f _J..J /1.100.00
body alignments and damaged consistent to the accident, R
To apply anti-rust chemical on repaired and replaced panel. {1 120,00

*#*= This is a computer-generated document which requires no signature. ***

page 3




@R-51 automaTivE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17/ #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No, : +65 6842 0051 Fax No.: <63 6741 0310
E-Mail : sales@n31.com.sg

Company Reg. No. : 200616038C

GST Registration Mo, - 200616038C

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Contact : 66350005 96666053
ESTIMATE

Repair Code : CLM15224
Date in : 07/05/2019
Vehicle Num. @ SLQ6#122K
Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Chassis/Eng# : RU31248471/LEB5948488

To transfer rear bootlid mechanism lock outer handle reflector Jg  80.00
Labour Total [ L[]~ 28%0.00

IS
Parts & Labour Total 9.956.64

£ *** This is a computer-generated document which requires no signature.***
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI15008231/Eqd3n2
$16.01 CITy HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 Dapeiss SN I”““”"l“‘lml”w
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD B842T Veh. Inspected SLG 122K
Policy No. Coverage (3$) 0.00
Claim No. C19003058MFEH Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 09/05/2019
o Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL c.c 14596
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU31248471 Colour BLACK
Odometer 123851 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 R16 SJHTT 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 SJHTT 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 SJHTT & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 SJHTT & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/05/2019 |Inspection Date 10/05/2019
Survey held at  N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PL
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-17 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

iESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LQ 6122K

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No, 19-9607188-R

Page Mo.:1of 3

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [ Estim B{g}] m‘"‘
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2| REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LR @%23.00 BROKEMN 48.00 46.00
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED T62.7T0 762,70
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER CRUSHED 250.00 250.00
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR L/IR @5141.10 NOT NECESSARY 282 20 -
Z|REAR BUMPER SIDE L/R @%195.00 BROKEM 380.00 320.00
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 41560 41560
1|REAR END PANEL ANTENNA SENSOR BROKEM B0.10 60.10
1|REAR END PAMEL BUZZLE SENSOR BROKEN 85.20 85.20
1|REAR END PAMEL INNER TOP GARNISH CRUSHED 98.00 98.00
1|REAR EXHAUST CHROME TAIL PIPE CuT 135.00 135.00
1|REAR EXHAUST GASKET NOT NECESSARY 48.30 :
2|REAR EXHAUST RUBBER MOUNTING @3%$16.50 NOT NECESSARY 33.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER BOX NOT NECESSARY 517.70 -
?|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM GARNISH LR @3295.00 CRUSHED 590.00 550.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL COMPARTMENT TRAY GARNISH CRUSHED 48530 485.30
1|REAR FLOOR PAMNEL INMER TOP BOARD COVER CRUSHED 195.00 185.00
1|REAR TAILGATE DENTED 953,20 853,30
1|REAR TAILGATE "HYBRID" EMBELEM MECESSARY 75.80 75.80
1|REAR TAILGATE "VEZEL" EMBLEM HWECESSARY 56.20 56.20
2|REAR TAILGATE HINGES LR @%50.00 WOT NECESSARY 100.00 &
1|REAR TAILGATE INMER PULL GARNISH CRUSHED 27.50 27.50
2|REAR TAILGATE INNER RUBBER GUIDE STOPPER /R NOT NECESSARY 37.00 -
@$18.50

1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD BROKEM 153.40 153.40
1|REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK BENT 180.00 180.00
1|REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK STRIKER NOT NECESSARY 27.50 -
1|REAR TAILGATE ODUTER GARMNISH NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
1|REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH "H" LOGO EMBLEM MOT NECESSARY 25.00 -
1|REAR TAILGATE WEATHER STRIP CRUSHED 96.80 96.80
2|REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN INMER SEAL @$50.00 MECESSARY 100.00 B60.00
2|REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING @$50.00 MECESSARY 100.00 100.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19008231/Eqd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 18-8807198-R Page No.:2 of 3
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
oy i Workshop 8)|  (5)
2|REAR TAILLAMP L/IR @%474.60 BROKEN (1 PC 949 20 474 80
ONLY)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,499.16 -1,138.10
5.996.64 4552 40

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN} NECESSARY 80.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) BROKEN 350.00 200.00
1|SET REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SN) |[NECESSARY 30.00 10.00
2|SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM GARNISH CLIPS LR |NECESSARY 100.00 30,00

@$50.00 (SN)
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR MAT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
1|SET REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS (SN}  |NECESSARY 50.00 15.00
1|5ET REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 10.00
1|REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 40.00
2|SET REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS L/R @$30.00 (SN) NECESSARY (1 PC 60.00 15.00

OMLY)
1,070.00 350.00

LABOUR

TO REMOWVE REINSTALL ELECTRICAL WIRING 100.00 30.00

HARNESS, CHECK LIGHTING AND REWIRE FOR PARKING

SENSOR

TO REMOWVE REINSTALL TAILGATE WINDSCREEN. 150.00 100.00

TO REMOVE REINSTALL ROOF TOP TRIM 140.00 60.00

UPHOLSTERY ,CUSHION SEAT, TRIM GARNISH. TRIM

LINER CARPET (TO FR).

TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE REAR BOOTLID REAR 1,100.00 700.00

END PANEL REAR FENDER (L/R),SPARE TYRE PANEL

AND REAR BUMPER.

TO REMOVE AND CHANGE EXHAUST SILENCER BOX 100.00 50.00

WITH PIFE, RE-ALIGN WHERE NECESSARY CONSISTENT

TO THE ACCIDENT.,

TO PROVIDE LABOUR WORKMANSHIP TO CHANGE THE 1.100.00 600.00

ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS, REPAIR RE-CONSTRUCT

AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE BODY ALIGNMENTS

AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.

TO APPLY ANTI-RUST CHEMICAL ON REPAIRED AND 120.00 40.00

REPLACED PANEL.

Report Ref Mo. CS/FCI19008231/Eqgd3n2




TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No, 19-0807188-R Page No.3 of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Conditi
Qty Description of Parts on Workshop (§)) (s)
TO TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM LOCK B0.00 30.00
DUTER HANDLE REFLECTOR.
2,890.00 1,610.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,956.64 6,512.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,200.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18008231/Eqd3n2

KL
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CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLABER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the uss and bansfit of the Clhent named on tha front page of this Report.
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