Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 2:18 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] OUR REF: 5)J8114A YDUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY

ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY [External Confidential]

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Asher,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all 85 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 9:38 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF: S119114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY &
CHECK LIABILITY [External Confidential]

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter

We have highlighted to your good office on 09/05/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accidenl, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 5 15,028.43 $6,855.00

=y



2 Loss of Rental (9days x $100) $ 900.00 $ 800.00 (Bdays x $100)

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $§ 200 § 200
Total | § 15,931.43 $ 7.757.00

**6 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

abov for your le

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Auto Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 4841-6051 | emol: gzherngkauto.com | fax 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ul industrial Park. Ubi Avenus 1. #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 11:39 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>: CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@®Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 5)J9114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY [External
Confidential]

SAVEASTO COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,
Enclosed revert of vehicle: S]] 9114A
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice

Thank you,

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan Ikkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac com>
Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 4:49 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <M eikwan @ kikauto.
Cc: MT_EIaim_SG <mt ;i.!-l Ionpac cams»
Subject: RE: OUR REF: S)J9114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY [External

Confidential]

i }

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel_:__{_ﬁS} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all 8% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authonsed external parties anly.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto) [mailto; Melkwan Elkkauto. com]

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 4:20 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; CS A Team; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 51)9114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY
[External Confidential]

SAVEAS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 19/29/19/VC10/021767
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19008218/pa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action,

Our case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,



Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: Meikwana |kkoyto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 12:15 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <go aldpoh@ianpac com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <t cidim@lonpac com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 5J19114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY [External
Confidential]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: asygnments Flidauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{4080373)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mallto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com)]

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 10:52 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <t clhim@longac.com>

Subject: FW: OUR REF: S119114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY [External
Confidential)

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC10/021767
Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as arranged.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



[ — ] E The all 8% lonpac.com.sg

=—FN.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties anly

From: CYSAUTO [mallto.cysauto Zsingnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 10:25 AM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: W_Uaim_SG; sSyrsikkauto.com

Subject: RE: OUR REF: S1J9114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY
[External General]

Dear Mr Gerald Poh. WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We would like request Mr Bryvan Ang to survey this car. Thanks

Dear Ms Veron,

Kindly arrange TP survey at 38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 $(757700). Thanks

Warm regards,
Ms Tee Wee Sin

v CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 5(757700)
Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096

Email: cysauto@singnet.com sg
From: GERALD POH
WEE BIN [malito:geraldpoh@lonpac. com]
Sent: Thursday, May 09, 2019 10:10 A
To: CYSAUTO <cysauto@singnet.com sg>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mit | IE_'_-E'E]:-_n_._:r_-'_r'.:-

Subject: RE: OUR REF: S19114A YOUR INSURED: XE4AB76M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY |External
General]

Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref 1 19/29/19/VC10/021767
Dear Wee Sin,

Please see attached and revert,

Best Regards



Gerald Pah

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65 6296 2706

The all 8%} lonpac com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: CYSAUTO [mailto;cysauto@singnet.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 9:53 AM
To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: OUR REF: 51J9114A YOUR INSURED: XE4676M - KINDLY ARRANGE TP SURVEY & CHECK LIABILITY

Our Ref: S119]14A
Your Insured: XE4676M WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs’ Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ9114A AND XE4676M ALONG PIE TOWARDS VHANGI ON 06 MAY
2019

Attached herewith estimate, GLA report and scene photos for your attention. Kindly arrange TP survey at 38
Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 S(757700) and let us have vour list of 10 motor surveyors. Thanks

Dear officer in charge,
Kindly check liability for this claim. Thanks and look forward for your reply.

Warm regards,
Ms Tee Wee Sin
.v‘ CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PT ELTD

38 Woodlands Industrial Park £1 #07-17 5(757700)
Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096

Emall: cysauto@singnet com.sg

I'his email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus sofiware.

WWW.ave.com



CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD

38 Woodlands Industrial Park East 1
#07-17 Admiralty Industrial Park
Singapore 757700
Tel: 62192098 (3 lines) Fax: 62192096
E-mail address: cysauto@singnet.comsg

Our Ref: SII9114A
Your Ref: 19/29/19/VC10/021767

23 May 2019

IMMEDIATE ATTENTION
Lonpac Insurance Berhad BY EMAIL ONLY
300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Attn: Mr. Gerald Poh Wee Bin, Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ9114A AND XE4676M ALONG PIE TOWARDS
CHANGI ON 06 MAY 2019

We act for Mr Yap Kok Seng, the owner of vehicle registration no. SJI9114A.

We are instructed by the abovenamed to claim damages against you in connection with a
road traffic accident on 06 May 2019 at 7:25pm along PIE towards Changi involving our
client's vehicle registration number SJJ9114A and vehicle registration number XE4676M
driven by your insured /insured’s authorized driver at the material time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured /insured’s authorized driver
negligence driving and/or management of your vehicle. As a result of the accident, our
client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, particulars
of which are as follows:

Cost of Repairs $ 6.955.00
Rental Charges (9daysXS$100) §  900.00
GIA/ LTA Search Fees 5 2.00

TOTAL § 7.857.00



Our Ref : SII9114A

-2

Your Ref : 19/29/19/VC10/021767

Date :

23 May 2019

We enclose herewith a copy each of the following documents for your attention:

2

CYS Automobile Services Pte Ltd’s Performance Invoice no, TP6022 for the sum
of $$6.955.00:

 CYS Car Rental Pte Ltd’s Rental Agreement no 4071 for the sum of $£900.00; and
3.

GIA/ LTA report on vehicle no XE4676M dated 06 May 2019 with tax invoice for
the sum of $2.00:

Please acknowledge receipt and let us have your reply within Seven days (7) days of your
receipt of this letter.

Ydul. -
CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD

Sincerely

Tee Wee Sin
Secretary



RE ACC[DEIHT INVOLVING VEHICLE Nﬂ STIGNA ane ¥ E Y6 enn
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I/ we, Tap  Yor  Sowd NRICNo 2Tuadivyut 3
of (Address) B FTL scdiendy & 12 303-10 G4 T
owner of motor vehicle No. SRECIILT. hzreby Euthunzed

CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD to repairs of the said vehicle forthwith
and act for me with respect to my third party claim.

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/ s being made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/ owner/
insurers of the other vehicles is concerned.

| authorize you to sign all discharge voucher/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
connection with the above claim in my absence.

| authorize the workshop to appoint such a firm of solicitors on my behalf as the
workshop shall deem fit for the purpose of the third party/owner insurer claim.

Dated this i

! "-} |
g LA F s g
| ; ices Pte Ltd
Owner Sign.ﬁ'fure ENEM0R: - mrrgﬁ
. ’ E mE T At s1riagl Prark
Name : VAT ol vy H;mti':-:]i S

el B2 B B [Unesy Fas: 3210 20



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 19/19/19/VC10/021767
DATE : IR JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

'We, YAP KOK SENG confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner XE 4676M the sum of Singapore Dollars SEVEN
THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED AND FIFTY SEVEN ONLY. ($7,757.00) in full
and final satisfaction, hquidanon and dischurge of all propeny losses competent (o
mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property
losses sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter 1o become manifest, anising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving. $J1 9114A on 06/05/2019 along/at
PIE TOWARDS CHANGL

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (SAB LOGISTICS PTE LTD
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) ugainst all eluims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you 1o pay the above settlement sum directly o M/s CYS
AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and withowt prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured's recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

MNamie of vehicle owner/Date



# A R OE IR 7 LN &G R 2 A
CYS Automobile Services Pte Ltd

ROC Reg. No ADS041/2001E GST Reg. NO 20-0105041-E

‘T
—

P. Invoice TP 6022

MIS YAP KOK SENG POLICY NO - THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
BLK 853 WOODLANDS ST. 83 OUR REF - TP 6022
#03-124 SINGAPORE 730853 VECHICLE NO cSJJ9114 A
MAKE/MODEL - MERCEDES C230
DATE OF ACCIDENT ; 6-May-19
SURVEY BY DATE : 23-May-19
AGREED TO REPAIR THE ABOVE VEHICLE AT LUMP SUM BASIC AT 8% 6,500.00
GST 7% 455.00
S 6,955.00

SIN DOLLARS: SIX THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED AND FIFTY-FIVE ONLY

YOURS Fﬁl‘lTiFULLY, |

| 'JJ

T . ' 3
CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTELTD

38 Woodlands |ndustrial Park East 1 #07-17 Admiralty Industrial Park Singapore 757700
Tel: 6219 2098 (3 Lines) Fax: 6219 2096 E-mall: cysauto@singnet.com.sg



CYS CAR RENTAL PTE LTD

38 Woodlands industrial Park Enst 1
#07-10 Admiraity Industrial Park Singapore 757700
TEL: 6287 0750 HIP- 8163 0101
BUSINESS REG. N0 20120588 TK

no: 4071
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5712019

GENERAL

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Cur Ref Na: GR-19-071934
Date of Request: 07052019

CY'S Automobile Services Pte Lid
38 Woodlands Industrial Park East 1
#07-17, Admiralty Industrial Park

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

GST Registration No; M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Your Raf Mo: Onling Purchase

Singapore 757700

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 07/M5/2019

uiry By LIM XING SU, ESTHER

TP Vehicle Na. KE4BTEM

Accident Date 08/05/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Peariod of Insurance Insurer Tal. No.
XE4676M Lonpac Insurance Bhd 29/01/2019-28/01/2020 +B5 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the cantre by the members of the Ganeral Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no sespansibliity fur their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoaver for any loss or damage arising oul of

of in connection with the reports or thair iImages

. is a computer generated documeant and requires no signatura.

hitrs- M alamme. omsndclaimalindss ofm Hussbny=MTRsasA fuseaction=dsn  asninvindrefid=21388238CFID=524585068 CFTOKEN=3441abd 112



572018 Irrviice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
ENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE #oe -5 6224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to S5pm
GST Registration Na: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-19-071934
Date of Requast: 07/056/2019 Your Ref Na: Online Purchase
C¥YS Automoblle Services Pte Lid
38 Woodlands Industrial Park East 1
#0717, Admiralty Industrial Park
Singapore 757700
Dear SirfMadam,
quiry Date 07/05/2019
iuiw By LIM XING S5U, ESTHER
TP \Vehicle Na. HEABTEM
Accident Dale 08/05/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Tatal Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

Far GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[%] GIRD [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

hitos s oiarmc.oro.saiclaimsfindex. ofm Husabox=MTRsasAfuseaction=dso oaninvip&refid=21388234CFI0=524585068CFTOKEN=3441ah9,.. 272



