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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 July, 2019 4:55 PM

To: ezel.t@vermogen-group.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: (LOD) Accident involving SLL9042P & GX6725T ( Your Insured ) on 07/05/2019 

Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021770 [External General] LKK REF CC6/LPC19008215/Eha3

Attachments: doc05180520190618151501.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Ezel, 

 

We refer to the below email. 

 

Please be informed that we are currently preparing to seek for mandate approval. 

 

We will expedite and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: ezel.t@vermogen-group.com [mailto:ezel.t@vermogen-group.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 3:24 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

<chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Minoko Chan' <minoko@vermogen-group.com>; 'Glorioso Eric Paul Patambang' <eric.g@vermogen-

group.com>; 'Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon' <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; 'Edmond Lim' <edmond@vermogen-

group.com>; 'Yira Rahman' <yira@vermogen-group.com>; 'Vermogen Ace' <ace@vermogen-group.com>; 'Luis Tan' 

<luis@vermogen-group.com>; 'Pila Ng' <pila@vermogen-group.com>; 'Vmg admin' <vmg@vermogen-group.com> 

Subject: (LOD) Accident involving SLL9042P & GX6725T ( Your Insured ) on 07/05/2019 Our Ref: 

18/19/19/VC05/021770 [External General] 

 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Officer In-Charge, 
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Please find attached LOD with all relevant documents for your review. 

  

Kindly check and revert to us as soon as possible. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Ezel Tejano 

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd  

Operation Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 

Tel: 6904  4596 

Fax: 6694 4929 

 

Mailing Address: 

1 Bukit Batok Crescent #04-54 

Wcega Plaza Singapore 658064  

 

From: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>  

Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2019 10:22 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>; Glorioso Eric Paul Patambang <eric.g@vermogen-group.com>; 

Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; Tejano Exequiel Dawal <ezel.t@vermogen-

group.com>; Edmond Lim <edmond@vermogen-group.com>; Yira Rahman <yira@vermogen-group.com>; 

Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Accident involving SLL9042P & GX6725T ( Your Insured ) on 07/05/2019 - PLEASE ARRANGE TP SURVEY 

Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021770 [External General] 

 

Hi sir / mdm, 

 

Please refer to below attach email.  

 

Kindly arrange your surveyor for the PRS matter. 

 

Thanks & regards, 

Pila  

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 

Date: Wed, May 8, 2019 at 5:03 PM 

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLL9042P & GX6725T ( Your Insured ) on 07/05/2019 - PLEASE ARRANGE TP SURVEY 

Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021770 [External General] 

To: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>, MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Cc: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>, Glorioso Eric Paul Patambang <eric.g@vermogen-group.com>, 

Tejano Exequiel Dawal <ezel.t@vermogen-group.com>, Edmond Lim <edmond@vermogen-group.com>, Yira 

Rahman <yira@vermogen-group.com>, Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>, Vermogen Ace 

<ace@vermogen-group.com> 

 

Lonpac External - General 

  

Without Prejudice 
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Save as to Costs 

 

Dear Pila 

  

Our Insured has not reported the accident. 

  

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability. 

 
Dear Nivitha 

 

FYA 

  

Regards, 

Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

  

From: Pila Ng [mailto:pila@vermogen-group.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 2:46 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN 

Cc: Minoko Chan; Glorioso Eric Paul Patambang; Tejano Exequiel Dawal; Edmond Lim; Yira Rahman; Baldoz Juan 
Paulo Bongon; Vermogen Ace 

Subject: Accident involving SLL9042P & GX6725T ( Your Insured ) on 07/05/2019 - PLEASE ARRANGE TP SURVEY 

  

Dear officer in-charge, 

  

Refer to above attachment kindly arrange our client's vehicle for pre-repair survey at Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd here 
at 6 Benoi Sector. 
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*VEHICLE IN WORKSHOP* 

Beside, we would like to check for the liability on this matter. 

Kindly check & revert to us as soon as possible. 

Thanks & regards, 

Pila 

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd 

1 Bukit Batok Crescent 

#05-23 Wcega Plaza 

Singapore 658064 

Tel: 6358 3031 

Fax: 6694 4929 


