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!’ !’ l")‘ Apto

Cofsiitants

Bdm mam  Peld Company Registration No. 199607198

51 UBLAYE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE JUKULY TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAN @ (068, 62364513

Your ref: D1900302 IMESH

Our Ref: CS/FCI19008208/R1vd3 Date : 10/5/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SJF 24095

We thank you for your instruction on 9/5/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned

9/5/2019 at the premises of M/s DING AUTO PTE LTD
and have the following Lo report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5%9,172.69
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5§%3,174.52
"Check" Items Amount 1 S%
Market Value 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%
Mett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
n/s rear poriton

Commenis/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Cofeq Mo 1350001060 G587 Reg o M2-00016T6-9
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tek (65) 6222 2311 Fax: [65) 6222 3547

Claims & Metor Undemvwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road FLE-0L City House Singapore DBB877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: [B5) 6507 3845
wiww, matirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
08-05-2019 QOur Ref No. D19003021MFSH
07-05-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCT093A Third Party Vehicle. SJF24055

BLOCK 10 #01-20 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST.SEC C
YOU JING FENG

0/ 97335832 Fax No. 0
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA, Fax No. 68416315

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

DING AUTO PTELTD Attention. NIL
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 12:29 PM

To: kenneth ding; ‘jingfeng’; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; 'Dd hashim'; SUR
Subject: RE: SJF 2409S-DOA: 7/5/2019

Dear Kenneth.

MNoted with thanks.
Dear DD,

Kindly issue LOD directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: kenneth ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 12:15 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; 'kenneth ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'jingfeng'
<jingfeng @dingauto.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: SJF 24095-D0OA: 7/5/2019

Dear Veron,

We agreed and accept your offer.
Dear DD,

Please help to issue LOD to Veron.
Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: \f’efun Chen {LKKAutn;;} [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, June 10, 2019 11:22 AM
To: kenneth ding; 'jingfeng’; Rasul {LKKAuto)

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; 'Dd hashim'
Subject: RE: SJF 24095-DOA: 7/5/2019



Dear Kenneth
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $2850 (@ 5 working days.
Rear door LH lock our price is $439

Parts $2627.35 (less 10%) =$2304.62
SN-$35

Labour-$1170

Total $3569.62 (less 20%)=%2855.69

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

FPhone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4215

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: kenneth ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 8 June 2019 2:05 PM

To: 'kenneth ding' <Kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'jingfeng’ <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>
Subject: RE: SIF 24095-D0OA: 7/5/2019

Dear Veron,
Good day to you.
We would like to follow up on our offer for this case as my customer is chasing after us to close case.

Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: kenneth ding [mailto:Kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg]
Sent: Thursday, June 6, 2019 9:59 AM

To: 'jingfeng'; 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'; 'Rasul (LKKAuto)'
Cc: 'ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'
Subject: RE: SJF 24095-DOA: 7/5/2019

Dear Veron,

Good day to you.



We would like to follow up on the finalize amount for this case so that we can issue LOD and close this case as soon
" as possible.

Thank you so much.
Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding

HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: jingfeng [mailto:jingfeng@dingauto.sg]
Sent: Monday, June 3, 2019 10:30 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); 'Rasul (LKKAuto)'

Ce: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMO TIVE,COM.SG; Dd hashim; Kenneth Ding
Subject: Re: SIF 24095-DOA: 7/5/2019

Dear Veron

Please check the attach estimate

Kindly confirm the finalize amount @2955.44
THanks

Jing Feng

On 28/05/2019 17:16, jingfeng wrote:
Dear Rasul

Kindly check finalize amount as below

Total Repair - 06 Days
Lump Sum Repair

LABOUR = $1370.00

SIN = $35.00

PARTS AFTER AAA -10% =$2489.30
TOTAL (L+S+P) = $3894.30 -20% Lump Sum
FINALIZE AMOUNT =83115.44

Thank You

Jing Feng

On 23/05/2019 17:04, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) wrote:

3



Dear Jing Feng,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Virus-free. www.avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 5:53 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: 'Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMEMT - D19003021MFESH/T, SJF 24095
Attachments: SJF 24095 PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear SirfMadam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJF 24098
Date of survey: 9/5/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent; Friday, 10 May 2019 8:34 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003021MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S(4n8933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 5:14 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM




Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003021MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Repards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
, WWW.aVE.COMm



5M0/2019 PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Onwner 1D Type: Singapore MRIC
Owner 1D: 5883H

Vehicle No.: SIF24095
Wehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 10 May 2019
Vehicle Make: AUDI

Vehicle Model: A4 1.8T FS| MU CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD 4DR
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine No.: CABO13854
Chassis Mo, WAUZZZBKO8AD30612
Maximum Power Output: 118.0 kW (158 bhp)
Open Market Value: $34,235.00

Original Registration Date: 23 May 2008

First Registration Date; 23 May 2008
Transfer Count: 3

Actual ARF Paid: $34,235.00

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

COE Expiry Date: 22 May 2023

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $19,356.00

COE Rebate Amount: $15,609.00

Total Rebate Amount: $15,5609.00
Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE
expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is ear lier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 May 2019

75,6V
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£arz01e

> Back to OneMotoring

Transfer Fee Enguiny

Enquire Transfer Fee
Vehicle Details
Vehicle Mo : SIF24095
Wehicle Tvpe P10 - Passenger Motor Car
Wehicle Attachment 1: Mo Attachment
Vehicle Scheme : Marmal
Wehicle Make : AUDI
Vehicle Model : A4 1BT FSIMU CVT ABS DVAIRBAG 2WD 4DR
Chassis No.: WaLIZZZ8K0BA030612
Fropellant : Petraol
Engine Mo.: CABO13854
Engine Capacity 17%8cc
Maximum Power Output 1180 kw {158 bhp)
Maximum Laden Weight : 2000 kg
Unladen Weight : 1450 kg
Year Of Manufacture : 2008
Oiriginal Registration Date : 23 May 2008
Lifespan Expiry Date:
COE Category': E - Open Category
PQP Pald £19,356.00
COE Expiry Date - 22 May 2023
Road Tax Expiry Date : 22 May 2019
Inspection Due Date ; 22 May 2020
Intended Transfer Date : 0% pay 2019
CO2 Emission : =
CO Emission: -
HC Emission ; -
MOx Emission ; =
Ph Emissian -

The current road tax expiry is 22 May 2019, You may renew the road Lax from 23 Feb 2019 with all pre-requisite(s) fulfilled. If the road Lax is
renewed after 22 May 2019, late renewal fee(s) will be imposed. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable to check on the late fee(s) payable.

Road tax, including Over Payment (if any], of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership s being transferred,
Amount Payable (From 23 May 2019 to 22 Nov 2019)

Amount Before G5T G5T Amount Amount After G5T
(5%) (5%) (5%)
Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 25.00
Sub Total : 2500
Mett Road Tax Amount (After 586.00 584.00
Offsetting Owver Payment) :
Total Amount Payable : 611.00
Arnount Payable (From 23 May 2019 to 22 May 2020)
Amount Before GST GST Amount Amount After GST
(5%) (5%} (55)
Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 25.00
Sub Total : 25.00
Mett Road Tax Amount (After 1,172.00 - 1,172.00
Offsetting Over Payment) :
Total Amount Payable : 1,197.00
Message

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upen COE expiry or when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable], whichewver is earlier.
You may print this page for reference.

OK Print
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DING AUTO PTE LTD

| Vehicle:|SJF24095

Blk 10, #01-20 !
Sin Ming Industrical Est. Sec C | Model:|AUDI A4 ]
Singapore 575645 | Chassis: | J
Tel: 6452 1208
Fax: 6452 0614
|
| SURVEYORS
" DESCRIPION l ary LisT pisc PRICE | iaRkiNG
¢ .
1 |REARDOORLHS a4 i IS 1,999.50 10% 5 1,599.60 | (4G5.55 |
2 |REAR DOOR LHS HINGE LOWER S VL 1[5 288.96 10% s 231.17
3 |REAR DOOR LHS RUBBER BEADING Ast 1|8 188.85 10% g 169.97
[ 4 |[REAR DOOR LH WINDOW REGULATOR X $¥% 18 400.75 10% $ 360.68
| & |REAR DOOR LH WINDOW MOTOR S»orve 1|3 600.33 10% 5 540,30
& |ROCKER PANEL LHS r¢‘;~‘f’ i]5 1,990.55 10% [ 1,791.50
7 |REAR FENDER LHS n#r 18 1,777.21 10% 5 1,599.49
] 105 $ =
9 10% $ .
10 10% 5 -
11 10% 5 -
TOTAL: | § 6,292.69 | €521 SW
| SURVEYOR
SPECIAL NETT ary PRICE | marone |
12 |REAR FENDER LH5 SEALANT AN 1 5 35.00 | !
13 [REAR DOOR LHS TRIM CLIP neL 1 $ 35.00 | ;
14 | REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT ~ K~ 1 $ 60.00 | |
15| 5 - |
[ SPECIAL NETT| & 130.00 |
SURVEYOR
LAROUR PRk MARKING
16 |STARIGHTEN AND PANEL BEAT ON ACCIDENT AREAS $ 1 ; Souv
17 [CHECK WIRING 3 150,00 | X AN
18 |RUSH PROOFING 3 15000 e Lo
19 |R&R REAR DOOR COMPONENTS 5 18000 [
20 |R&R REAR WINDSCREEN 3 150.00 5 7 an
21 |REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT $ 12000 &/
22 [SPRAY PAINTING FRONT DOOR LH ,REAR DOOR LH , REAR FENDER LH ,ROCKER PANEL LH 5 l,aao‘ﬁa _SSo |
TOTAL:| § 2,750.00
PARTS 5 5,292.69
Y LABOUR 5 2,750.00
2\\"\ SPECIAL NETT $ 130.00 ,
T, ; !
@\ \ TOTAL $ 9,172.69
- GST 7% ) 642.09 |
i FINAL TOTAL 5 9,814.78 |
<@ ol Sk

(_
wl_
Fﬂu; Quvicot¥
S
el
&1[04"1 € {L’W‘w)

Raswasy <l

o, (31.77



DING AUTO PTELTD

* Mo lllegal modificatianjs) [s atiowed
& Suppememary llem(s) must be resurveyed ~nd

Acknowlednad by Repairer
Signatuie;
[Cate:

a Third parly survay [s on a "Without Prejudice” basis

iz sutject to final approval from Insurance Comipany

SL{SWP
ﬁlnflﬁ Q(L’U\‘L')
‘Ewﬂ,uﬁ $fpr gV

Bik 10, #01-20 Il Vehicle:[5IF24095 = |
Sin Ming Industrical Est. Sec C | Maodel:|ALDI A4 ]
Singapore 575645 [ Chassis:| |
Tal: 6452 1208
Fax: 6452 0614
SURVEYORS |
o] PRICE
NO ' DESCRIPION ary LIST Isc SAARKIIG
1 |REARDOORLHS  heds" 1 (3 1,999.50 10% £ 1,599.60
2 |REAR DDOR LHS HINGE LOWER _ 7~8V ] 288.96 10% $ 23117 ]
"3 |REAR DOOR LHS RUBBER BEADING As& ~ e 188.85 105 5 169.97
4 |REAR DODR LH WINDOW REGULATOR X 1|5 400.75 10% 5 360.68
& |REAR DOOR LH WINDOW MOTOR s 1|4 £00.33 10% 5 540.30
6 |ROCKER PANEL LHS r:f»-'." 115 1,990.55 10% § 1,791.50
7 |REAR FENDER LHS r‘_,ﬁp..‘r' 115 1,777.1 10% ] 1,599.49
8 10% $ -
L ; 10% $ =
3 Tt |57 10% s
11 2 10% 3 -
TOTAL: | § 65,202.59
SURVEYOR |
IAL NETT
SPEC ary PRICE MATRING
12 |REAR FENDER LHS SEALANT ey 1 5 35.00
13 [REAR DOOR LHS TRIM CLIP neaL -~ -4 $ 35.00 ]
14 |REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT . . 1 5 60.00
15 Tolal m 5 -
SPECIAL NETT| § 130.00
SURVEYOR
LABOU
R PRICE MARKING
16 |STARIGHTEN AND PANEL BEAT ON ACCIDENT AREAS 5 . o
17 | CHECK WIRING 5 7 150.00
12 |RUSH PROOFING 5 |
19 |R&R REAR DOOR COMPONENTS S5 5 % o
20 |R&R REAR WINDSCREEN ﬂm G 150.00 | 5%
},?:1 REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT s ] 12000 | S
W
dis o iim‘f PAINTING FRONT DOOR LH ,REAR DOOR LH , REAR FENDER LH ,ROCKER PANEL LH 5 ;,owﬁﬁ | £SO |
F i : TOTAL:| & 2,750.00
PARTS 5 5,292.69
LABOUR - § 2,750.00
SPECIAL NETT 5 130.00
TOTAL 5 917268
GST 7% 5 £42.09
LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify FINAL TOTAL $ 9,814.78
the Repairer of the following: (_ St
= To rasurvey batoregTefspray painting
& To display damaged part[s) during rasurvey
= Paris prices ara subject lo conlirmation J"f qﬁb “’U; gl
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

59 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No, 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH9008208/R1vd3n2
395.01 Oty HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 ol i Mmm”mmmm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC T033A Veh. Inspected SJF 24005
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19003021MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 09/05/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI A4 1.8T FS C.C 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No, WAUZZZBK0BAD20612 Colour GREY
Odometer 146286 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/80 R16 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 DUNLOP B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/05/2019 |Inapaction Date 09/05/2019
Survey held at  DING AUTO PTE LTD
BLE 10 #01-20 SIN MING IND EST SEC C SINGAPORE 575645
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTLNMTED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJF 24085

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807193-R

Page No.:1 of 2

: Do timate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition wE:rtliﬁhhh ol e
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR LHS BENT 1,999 50 1.988.50
1|REAR DOOR LHS HINGE LOWER SERVICEABLE 2B8.96 -
1|REAR DOOR LHS RUBBER BEADING NECESSARY 188.85 188.85
1|REAR DOOR LH WINDOW REGULATOR SERVICEABLE 400.75
1|REAR DOOR LH WINDOW MOTOR SERVICEABLE 600.33 -
1|ROCKER PANEL LHS TO REPAIR SEE 1,990.55 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER LHS TO REPAIR SEE 17021 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR LH LOCK (ADDITIONAL) JAMMED 798.70 439.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -804 58 262.73
7.241.27 2 364 62
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR FENDER LHS SEALANT (SN) WOT NECESSARY 35.00 -
1|REAR DOOR LHS TRIM CLIF (SN) WECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY G60.00 -
130.00 35.00
LABOUR
STRAIGHTEN AND PAMEL BEAT ON ACCIDENT 1,000.00 500.00
AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF ROCKER PANEL
LHS AND REAR FENDER LHS.
CHECK WIRING NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
RUSH PROOFING 150.00 60.00
R&R REAR DOOR COMPOMNENTS. 180.00 B50.00
R&R REAR WINDSCREEM NOT NECESSARY 150.00 B
REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
SPRAY PAINTING FRONT DOOCR LH REAR DOOR 1.000.00 550.00
LH REAR FENDER LH ROCKER PAMEL LH.
2.750.00 1,170.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,121.27 3,569.62

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18008208/R 1vd3n2
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Page No.:2 of 2
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,850.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FCI19008208/R 1vd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $35,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $15,609.00=NETT VALUE: $19,391.00

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made sobely for the use and benefit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Repon.




