Jux Irene !LKI(Al.n:u!

From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 412 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202097/C02/6-SLM2216X - Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving SLM2216X and SHCE0B6C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119008189/K1ja3) on
07/05/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear loy,

Please proceed as per your advice & recommendation.

Thank you.

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapare 079909
DID: (65) 63896174 | F: (B5) 6224 7174 /16224 7478

W: www sg cntaipingcom | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & 1"#i#& Taiping SG

Dusclanmar: This e-mad and any files transmilted with if s intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential informalion. Any
urauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of s message. either in whole or pavtial, s prohibiled i you are not the inlended recipent, please
notify the sender immediately. Fiease delole the e-maill and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 1:55 PM

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CT
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202097/C02/6-5LM2216X - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLM2216X (01 : CTI
- TBA) and SHCBOBGC (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119008189/K1ja3) on 07/05/2019

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the subject.

Our insured is cutting lane causing a chain collision (video attached).
Liability is not in our favour.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
Cost of Repairs 5 8,939.60 (per estimate) $ 2,782.00 GST included




- Loss of Rental $ 597.06 ($99.51 x 6 days) S§ 597.06(599.51x6)
LTA Search Fee S 2.00 S 7.49
TOTAL $9,538.66 $ 3,381.06

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.

The above summary is subject for your approval to offer.

Thank you,

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | emaill: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.if you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 1:43 PM

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@|kkauto.com>

Ce: C5 A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202097/C02/6-5LM2216X - Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SLM2216X (O1 : CTI
- TBA) and SHCBO86C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119008189/K1ja3) on 07/05/2019

Dear Sirs,
TP video attached for your records.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
Is strictly forbidden,

From: Ong Chin Kiat ilto:chinkiat.ong @sg.cntaipi

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 4:29 PM

To: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

<Joylrene@I|kkauto.com>




Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202097/C02/6-SLM2216X - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLM2216X (01 : CTI
- TBA) and SHC6086C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119008189/K1ja3) on 07/05/2019

Dear Mel Kwan,
Please find attached our insured’s GIA repart.

Thank you.

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079808
DID. (65) 63896174 | F, (B5)6224 7174 /16224 7478

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook comi/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: i "8 Taiping SG

Disclatrmar: This e-madl and any Mes transmitted with i is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential infarmation. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or disseminalion of this message. either in whole or partial, is prohibited If you are not the intended recipient, plesse
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of i thereaffer,

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 1:16 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Elaine Cheong; Ong Chin Kiat; CS A Team; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLM2216X (01 : CT1 - TBA) and SHCG086C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI19008189/K1ja3) on 07/05/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 6086C at M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd - Changi on a WP basis
and TP repairer purposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice
) Towing

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408¢33)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www. symanteccloud. com




To :L [":'(

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG: 200707743D GST REG: 200707743D

Our Ref: SHCA086C/SR
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

23 May 2019 (By Email Only)

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleal Tower

Singapore (179909

Dear Sir'Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHCo086C / SLM2216X / GBFS527TE ALONG
RANGOON ROAD ON 07.05.2019

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd. the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHC6086C, 1o claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that vou are the insurers of vehicle number; SLM2216X at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr. Seow Tze Wang, Steven.

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured's Vehicle Number: SLM2216X, our client's vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair (Incl. GST) $ 2.782.00
(2) Loss of Rental - 6 Days @$99.51 per day $ 597.06
(3) GIA Search fee % 2.00

3 3.381.06

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

(1) GIA report / police report & sketch plan of SHC6086C

(2) Driver’s UC and Driving License

(3) Final repair bill

(4) Vehicle Registration card, Certificate of Insurance, Certification Letter
(5) Check In/Out Voucher

(6) GIA search

(7) Scene video



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446671 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG: 200707743D GST REG: 200707743D

Our Ref: SHC6086C/SR

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have vour
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims. please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
pavment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd™.

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days. we will have no
alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalfto commence proceedings
against you without further notice to vou.

..ft

[
Yours faithfully, (

\ -"I:_'(/JKF:C\-_ J|
\/ LY
( ),i '

Claims Department — Shafawati Md Rabu

Email: shafawati. mbu@premiertaxi.com
DID: 64100946
NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replyving

cie. Client — Premier Taxis Pte Ltd



) UBLAVE [, #1-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62363361 FAX - (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTIY008189/K1ja3

19 JUNE 2019

KAN TAT SENG

BLOCK 305 SHUNFU ROAD
#10-97

SINGAPORE 570305

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 2216X AND SHC 6086C ON 07/05/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down
against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the

Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faighfully,

DID: 6841 2096
AX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com

C.C China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

/We. PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant”) of 23 CHANGI SOUTH
AVENUE 2 #03-02 SINGAPORE 486443 {address). owner of SHC 6086C (vehicle no.)
hereby authonze PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™)
to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use
i(“claim”) for my vehicle no. SHC 6086C that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on 07/05/2019 (date) along RANGOON ROAD (location) involving vehicle nofs
SLM 2216X (“the accident™).

I/'We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to

settlemen of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop™.

I/We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudice and withour adnussion of hability basis  insofar us  the

driver/ownerfinsurers of the other vehicle/s is concemed.

10 e

Dated this (day) of (month) 2019 (year)
: 4 L T I,,-._:- [,. (.-
= ®) [
.Lm_;x_ f:-:- 1 h i
) _l_j.- A
Signed by “the third party claimam™ Signed by “the workshop”

(with chop 1f applicable) (with chop)



Thif Setdement exciv
bodily Injuries
tbove sai g accident and
o1.cperry dareq- o'y

MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

des any

st

Policy Ho : DMPCSH3026891502 Claim Mo ¢ SNM1SD202087/202/€
Claimant : FREMIER TAXIS FIE LTD

Rmoune 1 5§3,3681.06
SINGAFORE DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED EIGHTY ONE
AND CENTS SIX ONLY.

I/W= sgree o accept the above mentioned amount te be paild te mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injurises [/ damages
sustained by me/us through an azcident invelving

Claimant Vehicle No. SHC &0BEC
Inaured Vehicle Ho. HiM 2216

i
Cate of Loma 1 07.05.200%
Place of Accident 1 RANGOOH ROAD

IH CONSICERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agres absolutely to
dischargs CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD, and/or

Insured Name 1 KAN TAT SENG
Driver Hams : KAN TAT SENG

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the sald accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHIMA TAIPING INSURAMCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID.

ansing out of 1) ,

{1) General Damages 55
{2} Cost of Repair/Excess 55 2,782.00
{3} Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 55 597.08
{4) SIA/Palice Reports/
Investigation Fesulta/Search Fses 55 2.00
{5) Medical Reports/Expenses 5%
{16} EBusvey Feea/F.T. Fees 55
{7} Ceoat including Disbursement 25
TOTAL @ @ = o o % & o o & & & s+ « 4=88 3,381.06
/5 x
[f l&) o 2
Claimant Hame : 1&*-'\%/{" Ay KEIC Mo i SO0304G 354
\;;‘_{_:‘,1 7

Signature H Date 1

Y,



&

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD

PREMIER

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES

PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02
SINGAPORE 486443

TAX INVOICE

DATE
PAGE

OFFICE 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01.02 S{485443)
TEL B543G570 /65436688 FAX EX141511
CO. REG NO.: 2007077430 GSET REG NO. 2007077430

22-May-2018

ITEM  |Description Qry U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA 2,600.00
REGN NO: SHC 608& C
&)
TOTAL LUMPSUM REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR 2,600.00
GST @ 7% 182.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,782.00

for Premier Automotive Serices Pta Ltg

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




PREMIER

TAXIS

15 May 2019
To Whom It May Concern

Dear SirrMadam

CERTIFICATION LETTER

This letter serves to inform thet Seow Tze Wang. Steven (Xiso Zhiwang) of NRIC
Number S8023595Z is a registered driver of SHCG6086C. Seow Tze Wang. Steven (Xino
Zhiwang) is paying daily rental rate of $99.51 (Inclusive of GST).

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 8880,
Thank you,

Yours sincerely

-

Chir’ Bee Lian (Ms)
Assistant Vice President
Taxis Administration

Prepared By, Hamnah

PREMIER TAXIS FTELTD

13 Changl Souik Avenue 1

a0

Simgnpare 486443

Teleplvone: +65 6214 BEBN Fax: 465 6214 0330

wow premiisetngienim
Ca Reg Na. 2003049751



REPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES/NO

@P MIER e

CHECK IN /| OUT VOUCHER
, PVERS NAME SR TR \Wowey

W s BRITIIL Moo g 5 s8R S
TAOREGNNO. g 4 Sﬂ'g G C|wake/mo0RL R,

pRes\0_ 19 mvﬁr 730517 b z’m
EILOMETRES IN me
ETalel] AR

DATE / TIME TOWED IN TD WORKSHOP

(w0 TR TR T # oA
NO ;
DATE / TRWAE CALL 70 DRAVER FOR VERCLE COLLECTION
Oy kY WO R
| ACKNOWELDGE AMD CONFIRM THAT | HAVE EXAMINED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AND
THAT THE SAME |5 IN GOOO CONQITION AND TO MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESPECT

TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES / ITEMS LIST ABOVE THIS VOUCHER IS USED N
COMJUNCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT,

CHECK IN CHECK ouT

|
., anll

mu% cHECKETHOUT B
(PREMIER DRISED WORKSHOP) (PREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOR)
EERVICE | REFAIRS DONE DRAVER'S REMARKS

O SERVICING O OTHERS

3 T/BELT

O ARCON SYSTEM O AGCIDENT: DATE / TIME of ACCIDENT:
0 TuRBO M SETHRT] ' TR
O BRAKE BYSTEM

O CLUTCH SYSTEM "f‘ﬂ\\\}\)

O BuLe

O UNDER CARRIAGE

O CPF

0O BATTERY

YES




S82019 Involca

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffies #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: M4 0010 Fax: +55r:224 0030
ASSODCIATION Oparating Hours: Monday lo Friday Sam 1o Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRe GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-072441
Date of Request: 0B/0S/2019 Your Rel No. Online Purchase

Premier Automolive Services Pla Lid
23 Changi South Ava 2

#01-02

Singapore 486443

Dear SinMadam,

Enguiry Drate 08/05/2018

Foquiry By GOH WEE DEK
' Vahicle No. SLM2216X

Accident Date 07/05/2018

Enguiry Resull

TP Vehicle No. Insures |Perind of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SLM2216X China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pie. Lid. 23/03/2019-22/03/2020 6380 8111
Thank You,

The images provided 10 you ene taken from the ariginal reports forwarded o the centre by ihe members of the Genera| Insurance Association of
Singapore ahd we taks no responsibilily for thelr accurscy or contents and shall be under no liabiity whatsosvar for any loss or damage arising out of
ar in connaction with 1ha regorts or their impgas.

[ 3is a computor generated documanl and requires no signature,

Hitpe:iwww.plarme.org sglciaimaindex cimMusabox=MTRsasffuseaction=dsp_geninvipSralid=213098088CFID=5250411 BACFTOKEN=aS4661a... 12



52019 Irwvolce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Frone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: 85 8224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours; Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm
GS5T Reglstration Mo: MAD0DD1TT3S

RECORDOS MAMAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
O Ref No: GR-19-072441
Date of Reguest: 0R/052019 Your Ref Na: Online Purchase
Premier Automolive Sarvices Ple Lid
23 Changl South Ava 2
#01-02
Singapore 486443
Dezar Skr/Madam,
Enquiry Date 08/052018
Frguiry By GOH WEE DEK
[ Vahicle No. SLM2216X
Accident Dates Q7052018
DESCRIPTION AMOLUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Tolal Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a compuler generatad document and requires no signatura.

For GIARMC Ofiicial use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chogue

hiltps i glrme. g sgicimima/index clm7lusebox=MTRaashfuseaclion=dap_geninvipfrefid=2139808ACFID=525041188CFTOKEN=a048810... 212



