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- SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD
Block 3018A, Ubi Road 1, #01-24-26, Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardoci@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E  GST No: 19-9502604-E

9/%/

SM/SLI7462)/1905064
08" May 2019
The Manager _?/ P { .
Motor Claim Z’l‘// /» ! 7 .
India International Insurance Pre Ltd
64 Cecil Street w’/ f// 7
#04/05 10B Building
Singapore 049711
303/- 20
Date of Accident 07" May 2019 f' /;’ _j’"ZL
Location Holland Road
Third Party Claim Vehicle No SGH 1179L
Repair Cost For Vehicle No SLJ 7462 ) Toyota Harrier
Estimate Supply of Parts & Labours
No. Particulars Price Amounts
1 Rear bumper fascia v0 [ae 138150  § 1.381.50—
2 Rear bumper clips VL \set 00§ 3800
3 Rensbumper lower lip D1 58630 S 58630~
4 Rear bumper lower lip reflector L&RH A1 2 5410 $ 108.20 gf,
5 Rear bumper sponge /20 13710 § 13710
6  Rear bumper side retainer L&RH A¥ly 9080 § 18160
7 Rear boot cover w/strip AL 38730 5 38730.X
8  Rear boot cover emblem (Harrier) Vi | 72.10 $§ 7210
$ 2.892.10
Less 25% _ § 72302
§ 2,169.08
9 Rear bumper reverse sensor (s/nett) fM | 33000 § 38000 XO2f -
$ 2,549,08
Va2 1y
-
Y
13 &




g SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 3018A. Ubi Road 1, #01-24-26, Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardoci@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E  GST No: 19-9502604-E

SM/SLIT462)/1905064

08" May 2019

Balance b/f $2,549.08

Cut out, renew, knocking & welding rear boot cover, rear end panel, remove & install $ B80.00 m_?
all damage parns & re-align body 5
Remove & install rear bumper sensor s 8000 L

Spray painting on damage parts (pearl paint) § 128000 /9O
Check all lighting afier repairs $ 3500 2o
Labour Charge $ 2.,930.00

Total Amount $ 5.479.08

GST will be reflected in the final bills,

Notes : -Please inform us within 14 days, from the date of this letter, in the event that the owner/driver is
in breach of its policy with your company, failing which we shall hold your company liable for all costs
of repairs. loss of use and storage.




S21/2019

>Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebale Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID: a

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QPPaid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
4922G

SLI7462)

No

21 May 2019
TOYQOTA

HARRIER PREMIUM 2.0 CVT
White

2016

3ZRB898980
Z5U600090835
111.0kW (148 bhp)
$32,725.00

23 Dec 2016

23 Dec 2016

0

$32,815.00

Yes
22 Dec 2026
$24,611.00

22 Dec 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$46,229.00

$35,069.00

$59,680.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 May 2019

MRSV A gov l-g!lm.'vrll:nuwaﬂqwmﬂhmu]rrunr:u:lmmmmgmpm FPUMNG | N _ IS UIusuud ) |



‘ Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@lii.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 9:13 AM
To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd: ‘'sur@lkkauto.com’; admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc Lalitha Krishnan - |l
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SUT462) AND SGH1179L ON 07/05/2019 AT HOLLAND
ROAD
Attachments: 0463_001.pdf; SLI7462) (1).jpg; SLIT462) (2)jpg
Dear Sir / Mdm,
Pleasa conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLJ7462) and let us have your report urgently.
p- Tt
This claim will be handled by Ms Lalitha.
Tinw ., (0-0' A m
*Kindly upioad this survey request emall o merimen.
Thank You, v
Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
(€] [nDIA
P InTERNATIONAL

InsurancE

ftiNGAFOLTE

Sprving e Fegtus wnis [ 887
64 Cecil Streat; #05 - 108 Building

Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: 09 May, 2019 9:16 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il emotorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LJ7462] AND SGH1179L ON 07/05/2019 AT HOLLAND ROAD

Without Prejudice
Dear Gabriel,
Please assign LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey the vehicle SLJ7462).

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Motor Claim - I1I [malto:motorclaim@ili.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 9:01 AM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLI7462) AND SGH1179L ON 07/05/2019 AT HOLLAND ROAD

1



. Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We propose using one of the following motor surveyors;

=« Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Autoprobe Consultants

VP Appraisal

Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd
Infiniti Appraisal Service

JP Knights Adjusters

LBS Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Priority Services

RT Appraisal

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

» Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

E = & =

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

% von
® — I.N'I'ERNJ\TIDH&L

InsuranCE
fI NG ATORI
Serving the pageen since 1067

B4 Cecll Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: 09 May, 2019 9:08 AM

To: Motor Claim - |l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLI7462] AND SGH1179L ON 07/05/2019 AT HOLLAND ROAD
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam

Please refer to our email dated 0B™ May 2019.

Attached estimate, GIA report and photos for your perusal.

Our client SU74621 is claiming against your insured SGH1179L

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the above claim and also check for us the liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Irene



_6747-2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mallto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 4:47 PM

To: motorclaim@iil.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ7462) AND SGH1179L ON 07/05/2019 AT HOLLAND ROAD

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam

Please refer to the above matter,

Attached estimate, GIA report and photos for your perusal.

Our client SLI7462] Is claiming against your insured SGH1179L.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the above claim and also check for us the liability as soon as possible.
Thanks & Regards

Irena
6747 2112

From: cardoc@singnet.com.sg [mailto:cardoc@sinanet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 3:23 PM
To: CARDOC

Subject: Attached Image

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWw.avg.com

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed 1o have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

3



_ intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

. Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

~ orany modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delaved or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



BN72019 Menman a-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated with |

*SLJ7462J (MC2019/2140)
[SGH1179L]
L

YANG YOUQING
May 7 2018 5:00PM
[JAMALUDIN BIN JAMION]
Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 24/07/2019 16:43 PM.
To LKK_HG

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3551.44) - SLJT462J - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Approved:3551.44:Please revert on quantum

hittps://singapore. meriman cam/clalms/index, cfm fusebox=5VCmall&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=576464608CFTOKEN=6047de 1760484 105-20. .

1




SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 3018A, Ubi Road |, #01-24-26, Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardoci@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E  GGST No: 19-9502604-E

SM/SLIT462)/1905064

23" May 2019 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

The Manager

Motor Claim Dept.

India International Insurance Pre Lid
64 Cecil Street

#04/05 10B Building

Singapore 04971 |

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLJ 7462 J AND SGH 1179 L ON 07" MAY 2019
AT 1700 HRS AT HOLLAND ROAD

Dear Sirs.
We refer to the above matter.
Our Client Yang YouQing the registered owner of SLJ 7462 J.

You are the insurer of motor vehicle no. SGH 1179 L, which was involved in the above accident.
Please be informed that the collision was caused by the negligent owner/driver of the motor vehicle no.
SGH 1179 L. in consequence of which our client has suffered damages and consequential loss.

Attached a few documents for your reference:

a) Repair cost bill

by GIA report & LTA search

c)  Anauthorisation letter from the owner (SLJ 7462 1)

We are cloiming as follows: -

LTA search S5 8.00
Repair cost S§ 3.243.44
Loss of use S$ 300,00

S8 355144

Dollar: Three Thousand Five Hundred Fifty One And Cems Forty Four Only.

Kindly let us know whether you are prepare to settle the claim within the next ten (10) days
from the date herewith .

Please remit the cheque in favour to “Specialists Motor Pre Ltd"” as soon as possible.
Thank you,
‘r’uur.v} faithfull y.

Kﬂl‘gl {;33

\



ACCID IWGL'VING
g wiad #d°Te; 13 oy 2019 ar
'F.?I-'u h'\j &7 o .Ff-l-'Lplr ﬁ(_'d:_-..-l'f
1/we_ Y “?ﬁ-ﬂt}' (NRIC NO) I-"‘fﬂr:-'-’-*f of

Ly palilice Onive Hfo- 1 Shofpece cvdded

the owner / driver of Vehicle No. __ <{J il J hereby authorise your
esteern company poansyyi  mihr pE (s

as my repairer for my .Dmmged Vehicle involved in the above accident and to
claim ageinst the negligent party and /or insurance company.

I/ We hereby agreed to be bound by the following:-

1. You are authorised to use my /our name to claim against the negligent
party and /or insurance company pertaining to the sbove accident including any
other incidental losses. All payments / settlement monies shall be made in
favour of your company M/S -‘4”“-‘“-3P il ph ad

2. All documents receive by me from third party or insurance company
will be sent to your office for follow-up action.

i Any offer of settlements by the insurer and / or negligent party will
be accepted only with your concurrence and approval.

4, 1/We agree to sign/execute the Discharge Receipt within 7 working days of
issue of notice, by post, electronic mail, social media or 1ext messaging, by your company.,

5. If I/We fail to sign/execute the Discharge Notice after 7 working days from the
Issue of notice, I/We hereby authorise your company’s authorised representative 1o sign
and execute the said Discharge Receipt on my/our behalf.

6. Throughout the process of claim, 1/ We will be obligated to assist and
to provide your company with accurate and correct information.

T. 1/ We agree that 1/ We shall pay to your company all cost/expenses/
damages incurred or suffered hy you as a result of the unsuccessful recovery
of the claims for the full repair cost and any other incidental cost/expenses
by you on my /our behalf.

8. [/ We warrant and undertake that all information and statement
provided by me fus to you are true and accurate.

Thanking you in anticipation.

Yours faithfully

)

Date : !”cP ol J*”?
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANTE PTE LTD

s, Mg Mae 1HOUTTIE | 65T, Heg P, MZAMVTANDNG-X
i | Ceoil $ireet | B0 | #05 | K- ] 106 Iilaling | Singapare 49711

e (0%) BT bl sl

Fan

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MC20182140
Claimant Raf 5.1 T463)

Wilel)

|5 HZIAANTA Wiohsite wwwlil onim.ag

EPECIALISTE MOTOR PTELTD ("the workshop™) hereby corfinn that well have resched en agreement

with tha anpoinied Surveyor of India Intemanonal Insurance Fie Lid LK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD {rarne
of Surveyor) with respecl lo the amount claimed for §§ 3aso00 Eﬂ:_ﬂm1#.*—-ﬁ
e ——————— |l (D ELLTATT mmﬂm:pdpmmlumumﬁdwﬂmwmd

on TGS

Well confirm thal well arefam authorized by N8 OWNEr YANG YOLIOIMNG

(dmte) al _HOLLAND HDAD

(location) involving vehicle no. M‘EMME
yehicle), This s pursuant to the inspection conducled on ampoe  (dale) at the workshop”.

ek

("the third party

claimant™ of vehicle no. SLiTazs o make the plnim as £el oul in Ihe @bove paragraph and well have tull authority to sellle
numuarmrnmrb-mnmammmmmwmﬂhmmmMnrmumWwwmm
party claimant®,

Well further confimn that well will indemnify India Intemational Insurance Pte Lid for all damages, pas and/or expense thal
muulnrmmlmmmmmﬂﬂmmumwmrmmmwmn
hl'tha'dmmagirmmehnnu!uwmnmmmluﬂuuﬂpmmummmnmmm«lm

of use pursuant to the damage to _SLJ T4

{vehicle no,) as @ resull of the accident.

Wel confirm thal the agreemont reached above Js in fdl and finel setiement of all claims of The third party clalmard®
Wﬂlnlhnﬂﬂﬂﬂhlhﬂhﬂ?ﬁ:ﬂmbmaﬂﬂm:ﬂm prejudice and without admission of Kability

Dasis.

This agreemeant is subject o the application of Singapare law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive junadiction over any

dispule arising out of the same.
We/l suthorize you 1o pay the total amount of 5% 3.400.00 to SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD
'“] A -..-.'.F ‘-'-i
Dated this ... day of . R
A -
CLAIMANT: =t JC\J{ o) WITNESS:
'.n"' - .I. .I
Signature: z Slgnatire:
Signed by ‘the workshop” (with chop)
Mame: dre Tieg Name:
— S Pl g -~
f [
Address: Llc duidh, hi £y Address: 51 LIt AVE 1, PAYA LIBIINDUSTRIAL PARK
aoj- sy oot SyedHf
— #02-25 SINGAPORE 408833
Habonality Nalionaiity
Ciooupalion Oecupation




SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD
Block 3018A. Ubi Road 1, #01-24-26, Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardoc@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E GST No: 19-9502604-E

SM/SLIT462)/1905064

23" May 2019 TAX INVOICE
The Manager

Motor Claim Department

India International Insurance Ple Lid

64 Cecil Strect

#04/05 10B Building

Singapore 049711

Date of Accident 07™ May 2019

Location Holland Rooad

Third Party Claim Vehicle No SGH 1179 L

Repuir Cost For Vehicle No SLJ 7462 ] Toyota Harrier

Supply of Parts & Labours
No. Particulars Oty Price Amounts
1 Rear bumper fascia 1 1,381.50 $ 1,381.50
2 Rear bumper clips Isct 38.00 § 3800
3 Rear bumper lower lip I 58630 § 58630
4 Rear bumper sponge 1 137.10 § 13710
5 Rear boot cover emblem (Harrier) | 72.10 $ 7210
g 2,215.00
Less 25% § 55375
$ 1,661.25
&  Rear bumper reverse sensor (8/nett) | 200,00 §  200.00
$ 1,861.25
Labour Charges :- Amounts
Cut out, renew, knocking & welding rear boot cover, rear end panel, remove & install § 400.00
all damage parts & re-align body
Remove & install rear bumper sensor § 5000
Spray painting on damage parts (pearl paint) $ 700,00
Check all lighting after repairs PTE LTD § 2000
- - 'l . e ———
SFECIF\LISTS MOTOQ $ 3.031.25
Add 7% GST  § 21219
Total Amount sraesisnnnn g 32434

&/ Dollars - Three Thousand Two Hundred Forty Three And Cents Forty Four Only.



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

3 048580
INSURANCE Frone +65 6524 0010 Far- 66 6224
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°! registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Refl Na: GR-18-072482

Dale of Request: D8/05/2018 Your Ref Nao: Online Purchase

Specialiste Motor Ple Ltd

Elk 3018A Ubi Road 1

#01-24/25126

Singapare 408711

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 0BO&2019

Enquiry By Irene Ting Yen Hul

TP Vehicle No. SGH1178L

Accidenl Date O7/05/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SGH117T8L India International Insurance Pta Lid 30/052018-29/052018 63476100
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the membars of the Genaral Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoaver for any
loss or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports or their images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https:/singapore. menmen.com/claims/index. cfm?fusebox=MTR sas& fuseaction=dsn NRINSIMY




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Dirett Settlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case  |Noliffied | Est Submitted  |Ad) Assigned | Adj Aot [Ad) Submitted  |[Ins Auth'ed | Status
|19 2012019 Ponay oIS ge3031.25 | s83,031.25 ey for Survey
ki ﬁ:ﬂllll:glw o Eﬂimlml Hilml.mm] W“‘_t

Main Referance

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS o [Created by adjuster]
Ineured;  JAMALUDIN BIN JAMION, ID: 51532459

[Main 3
| Clamant: \*MIII YOUQING. 1D: S27145922G

[Vehicle Reg 070572019 17:00 - :59
INa:: 'su7462) Date of Loss: |12 Months and 34 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man vr)]

Claim Tyoe: | TP / MC2019/2140 Palicy/Caver | 407155

Note No.:

Palicy Na,

| [Claimant):
o .-Em:
Specialists Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) Bik 3018A Ut Road 1, #01-24/25/76, 408711 Ubi - Tel: 6747 2112
India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 83476100 ... [Handled by Laliths Krigshnan - 8347 §135%]

SGH11TEL 508711 23a42-02

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Wiew All I Composa Case Man I

. e EG-[HNHHH} Alprt - Mj ‘Mandate Mm MHLH} = SLIT461] - Claim HWandier: Lalitha Wri...
le 111_SG (14/05/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (§$0.00) - SLI7462] - Claim Handier: Laliths Krishn. ..

iew Al | Search Tasis | Croate tiew Task | compiete |
Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Complated On Created On Dane?
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Claim Documents

*50L37462] (MC2019/2140)
[SGH1179L]
TP
YANG YOUQING
May 7 2019 5:00PM
[JAMALUDIN BIN JAMION]
Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

‘Photos/Images peroage L) M |
Mo |Melabel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (H) B Thumbmail | Print
1 |24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View D | eaws | 4
2 |24/07/19 16:03 | Genersl View O | asws | A
3 240710 16:03 | Genersl View © | toaaws | 2
la zilfuml 16:01 | General View ) | Loaaies | BA
5 124/07/19 16:01 | General View D | adwes | A
& 24/07/19 16:03 | General View O | mdws | A
7 (AM07/19 16:03 | General View a O | airs | 4
B 24/07/19 16:03 | Geners] View - O | Lwwc | & |
§ 2407719 16:01 | General View 0 | oasiec | A
10 |24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View © | wacws | B4
11 | 24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View 0 | waaws | A
112 |24/07/19 16:03 | General View 0 | Lodiec | (A
13 24/07/12 1603 | General View O | s | B3
|14 |24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View 0 | s | A
|15 24/07/19 16:03 | General View 0 | osdirc | 4
16 |24/07/19 16:01 | General View 0 | weaws | B
(17 24/07/18 16:02 | General View O  eaws | B4
1B 34/07/19 1603 | General View © | weawG | A
19 |24/07/19 16:03 | Genersl View 0 | edrc | 4
féu_lzcru?rla 16:03 | General View 0 | weors | &
21 (24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View 0 | toaaws | 4
22 |24/07/19 16:03 | General View - - € | Lsdws | B
123 (24/07/1916:03 | General View o 0 | wedwc | @A
|14 _lwn:'m 16:03 | General View 0 | Leaws | A
25 |24/07/19 16:03 | General View ) | oadis | A
(26 [24/07/19 16:03 | General View ) | loadec | A
27 24/87/1916:03 | General View 0 | aaws | A
28 | 24/07/1916:03 | Geners! View © | waows | &
29 34/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View O | woews | B
30 24/07/13 16:03 | General View g Losa 3G | B
31 [24/07/1916:03 General View 0 | wows | 4
32 |24/07/19 16:03 General View € | iosd G &
133 24/07/19 16:03 | General View O | e | A
34 24/07/19 16:03 | General View 0 | Laewc | A
35 |24/07/19 16:03 | General View 0 | weiws |
36 |24/07/19 16:03 Genaral View a toaa G | R
37 24/07/19 16:03 | General View O | wdws | A
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Page 2 of 2

‘Photos/Images (3 per page ﬂ 2 |
to  Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
38 [24/07/19 16:00 | General View Load G | |4 |
3% 24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View O | wars | B J
A0 24/D7/19 16:03 | General View 0 arwrs B
4l 24/07/19 16:03 | Genaral View O | loors @A |
(2 134707719 16:03 | Genersl View O  lsdws B
43 24/07/19 16:03 | General View © wows M
44 24/07/19 16:03 | General View 0 | tasdws | @J
45 24/07/19 16:03 General View 0 | wears | W
|46 24/0771% 16:03 | General View 0 | Loeairo [ |
47 24/07/19 16103 | General View O | wows | M
48 | 24/07/18 16:03 | General View 0 lows &
49 (24/07/19 16102 | General Viaw 0 | wwaws | &
50| 24/07/1916:03 | General View 0 | weaws | B4
Documentation iperpage V] A
0 Welabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 09/05/19 14125 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 111 0D 09.05.19 Load POF

3 09/05/16 1425 TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT Load POF

3 22/05/19 18:58 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED 0 | Loed FoF

4 22/07/16 11:00  WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

5 22/07/1911:00 |LOD - Load AOF
& 130/0B/19 10:19 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
—
7 30/08/19 10:15 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load PP
'8 [30/08/19 10:19 | GIA SEARCH Loag FOF
1yu_1rm:un Cin India International Insurance Pte Lid (HG) Thumbinail | Print
1 10/05/18 08:13 | Singapere Accident Statement | @ | Losd Po#

Documents Checklist

[There are no document chacklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (W)

R e I e
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1essoriser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@/kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No:  CC4/IINS0081TAUGA302

Date: 30/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlernational Insurance Ple Lid Policy No: M487155
pramant Vehiow sLoymo) Insured Vehicle No :  SGH1178L
Date of Loss: 071052019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MC2018/2140
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLJT462)
Make & Modeal TOYOTA HARRIER, 2.0 PREMIUM CVT (A) Engine No: 3ZRBA9B9B0
Reg. Date 231272016 (Man, Year: 2018) Chassis No Z5UB00020835
Colour: White Odomeater 48858 km
Engine Capacity: 1986 cc
Market Value/New Car Prica:  N/A
Sum Insured (S8} Market Value/New Car Price
MNDITI F I E
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable), Yes Footbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification Mo Pre-accident Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fromt Tyre Size: 235/55 R13 Rear Tyre Size: 235/55 R18
Front Left Side: Bridgestona 7 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 7 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 7 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestong 7 mm
Thie above values represenl the memaining fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS o ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 2,548.07 1,861.25 687.82 26.98
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.275.00 1.170.00 1.105.00 48 57
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S$) 4,824.07 3,031.25 1,792.82 37.16
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%5) 33768 21219 125 49 3716
Neatt Amount (S§) 5161.75 3,243 .44 1.918.31 37.16
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5585.00/day) (55) 255.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 2.00
Nett Liability (S58) 3,500.44
Global Sum Settiement (55) 3,430.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 09/05/2019
Date Inspected; 21/05/2019 Inspected Al Specialists Motor Pte Lid (HQ)
Bik 3018A Ubi Road 1, #01-24/25/26
Singapore 408711
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 30/8/2019
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE This report regresents our findwgs af the fime snd place of mapection stated horem. Such inspoction has been carmoed oul fo the best of aar
Anawledge and abilly but any other lntility urder any other cirumatances is haraby sxprasaly excluded
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

'Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 22 Jul 2018)

Parts: M1-SUV TOYOTA HARRIER 2.0 PREMIUM CVT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

|Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)
|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no prini-code for SLJ7462.J)

Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimale pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

|Further Info: llems/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No, Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Dented / Deformed  1.381.50FL *1.381.50FL
2 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 38.00FL  *38.00FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER LIP Dented 586.30FL *586.30FL
4 2 "REAR BUMPER LOWER LIP REFLECTOR L&RH  Nol Necessary 108.20FL " FL
5 1 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Tom 137.10FL  *137.10FL
8 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER L&RH Nol Necessary 181.60FL ~-FL
7 1 *REAR BOOT COVER W/STRIP Nol Necessary 387.30FL ~FL
8 1 *REAR BOOT COVER EMBLEM (HARRIER) Necessary 7210FL  *7210FL
g8 1 *REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 3B0.00FS *200.00FS

F=Franchise part S=Spchett L=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 3,272.10  2,415.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S$) 723.03 §53.75

Total Parts (55) 2,549.07 1,861.25

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 30/8/2019




Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thete are no new miscellaneous Hems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 CUT OUT ,RENEW KNOCKING & WELDING REAR BOOT New 880.00 400.00
COVER ,REAR END PANEL.REMOVE & INSTALL ALL
DAMAGE PARTS & RE-ALIGN BODY
2 REMOVE & INSTALL REAR BUMPER SENSOR New 80.00 50.00
3 SPRAY PAINTING ON DAMAGE PARTS (PEARL PAINT) New 1.280.00 700.00
4 CHECK ALL LIGHTING AFTER REPAIRS New 35.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 2,275.00 1.170.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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