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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg o sssorier)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Erom: LKK Auto Consulitants Pie Lid
AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #07-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attr: Date: 0B May 2018
Preliminary Advice
Vehicla No : SKD160TY Accident Date : 30/04/2019
Make . AUDI A4 Policy No. - 1800018301
Assignment Date : 0B/05/2019 Excess : 5%0.00
Date of Inspection  : 08/05/2019 Est. Duration of Repair 1 4.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES FTE LTD - ALEXANDRA (HQ)
281 ALEXANDRA PTELTD, LEVEL B2
SINGAPORE 158938

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front o/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 18,023.00
Revised Amount 5% 9.871.00
Check Items (Estimated) 85 500.00
Total 58 10,371.00
Lump Sum Repair 55

Total Loss Conslderation

Mew for Old Value 5%
Pra-Acciden! Value 55 200,000.00
COE |/ PARF Rebate 8% 71.058.00
Salvage Value S%
Margin for Repair 53 128,942.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle |s repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation,

{ ) The vehicie is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invile tender for the wreck.

( ) Other comments
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From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 4:00 PM
To: Claims: SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKD 1507 Y
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKD 1507Y (Excess 5800/-).

if there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained befare repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay® kkauto com | fax. 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 10:13 AM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKD 1507 ¥

Dear All,

The excess is 5800

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pe Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: denisetay@®|kkauto.com | fax 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 11:19 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
di@lkkauto.com>




View Received Message

This mail s associated with
“SKD1507Y (41827541215G)
oD
Apr 30 2019 B:00AM

[HAY HUI HUI MARILYN]
premium Adtomabiles Pte Ltd - Alexandra

Raply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | _Print Message | Deiete Message | Forward | J——

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. {Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 14/05/2019 15:48 PM.

Te LEE_HOQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5%$9871.00) - SKD1507Y - Claim Handler: Gan, Hunchung

llpprmﬁ:%?:.m:ﬂe-m:pa:tm to be done for damage check and :uﬁplnmmtu_n r_bnrns / labour,

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Mame of Policyholder 1 HAY HLUI HUI MARILYN Vehicle No. ; SKDASOTY
Period of Insurance + 20 Feh 2018 To 18 Feb 2020 Policy Ma. 1 1800018301
Engine Mo, : CWK OTa541 Endorsameant No.
Chassis No. 1 WALIZZZFSTHAN 6341 lssued Date ;01 Mar 2015
Make/Mpoe| ALDI AS Sporiback 2 OTFS! S Tronic |Design)
Engine Capecity/Tonnage . 1.884.00 CC Sum Insured | Market Value First Year of Registration 2018
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapare 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6B841 1183
Emall: Nora khal@premiumauto.com.sg £ claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accldent Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : BB411183

Reference :  PA/OD/SB9/2019/DY/TF
Date :  DB-May-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name

Ms. Hay Hul Hul Marilyn

Address 31 Tampines Street 86
#l12-33
Singapore 528572
Telephone HP +65 96899755
Type of Claim Own Damage Claims
Policy No. 1900018301
Vehicle No SKD 1507 Y
Model Code A5 SPORTBACK 2.0 TFsl
Model / Year 20-02-19
Engine No CVK 074541
Chassis No WALIZZZF57KAD16341
Mileage
Date In
Liability
Excess Cost -
Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date 30-Apr-19
Place of Accident Alrport Road

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
tha Repairer of the lollowing:
= To resurvey belore'sfer Spray pastvg
» To dizplay damagsd part{s] during resurvery
= Pars prices ane ubject 1o conlkimation
= Thurd party surey @ on 0 “Wishout Prejutos” bass
* o ilegal mosiECation 1) i akowwd
* Supplemenary e} Mot b esurveyed gl
i subyect 10 firal approval brom |rurence Compansy

Acancmssned ty Fepars
Sgratur:
Dumos:




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
Estima Charges for Accide
S/n Nature of Jobs

KD 1507 Y

Estimated
Charges

To remove and transfer front wire harness for
headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor,
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.

To dismantle and renew front bumper, rhs front
fender and rhs headlight. Re-organise crash
management components. Reinstall all parts
removed.

To respray front bumper and rhs front fender.

To carry out diagnostic check.

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

S/N $  480.00

jSo
$  2,800.00
Mo
S 2,000.00

S/IN S 192.00

S 5,472.00




. Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax
ident Vehi D 1507
S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER s 2,073.00 £
2 FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT PARTS 5 368.00 ¥
3 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH s 56.00 ¥
4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH s 431.00 *
5 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH 5 3300 |
6 FRONT BUMPER SENSOR 1 S 231.00 % ’
7 FRONT BUMPER SENSOR SEAL RING s 12.00 X
B FRONT FENDER - RH 3 968.00 £
9 FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS s 48.00 ¥ (
10  FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH S £8.00 ¥
11 FRONT FENDER BRACKET - RH 5 32.00 £ |
12 FRONT FENDER POP RIVET S 15.00 X v
13 FRONT FENDER BRACE - RH S 107.00 A
14  FRONT WHEEL SPOILER - RH TBC
1S FRONT WHEEL SPOILER TRIM - RH 3 3300 % §
16  FRONT FENDER STONE CHIP GUARD s 46.00 },n
17  FRONT FENDER CORNER CHROME TRIM - RH 5 145.00 0~
18 HEADLIGHT - RH 5 7,204.00 tof —
19 HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER- RH S 181.00 X A0
20  SUNDIRES 5 500.00 'h’ W
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 12,551.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 5,472.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 18,023.00

All charges are not inclusive of G5T.

Legend: Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1. Singapore 408690
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

Tr\}"‘ 11514
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fv ' p bt adiise
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This estimate Is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall infarm you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant
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Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd P
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408655 I_l\jﬁ
Tel: (65) 6366 2323 Fax: (65) 6841 1183 ‘N\
Supplementary Estimate 1
CST Reg No. 19-9902271-W
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. | PA/0D/0589/2019/DY/TF
78 Shenton Way Date 3-Jun-19
#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor Glory Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages lofl
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No SKD 1507 Y
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No AS SPORTBACK 2.0 TFSI
Quantity Description Unit Price | Amount
Parts
1 Front bumper top cover (a2 5 116.00 — 4™
2 sign "caution” sticker } $ 13,00 — '
3 Air-cond sticker 3 700 =~ ' "
4 Bracketlock carrier C(nclced - $ 12500 <
5 Bonnet impact protection center D.¢. 5 25:00 o HS
g 286.00
LABORS
1 To repair and respray bonnet. 5 1,600.00 )
TOTAL S 1,886.00

For Bremium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature
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Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408899
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Email: Nora_khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop : Ubl Road 1

Contact No + 6368 2323

Fax No +  BB411183

Reference +  PAOD/OSBR2019/DY/TF
Date :  8-May-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name ¢ Ms. Hay Hui Hul Marilyn
Address : 31 Tampines Streel 86
#12-33
Singapore 528572
Telephone :  HP +B5 06896755
Type of Claim 1 Own Damage Claims
Policy No. : 1800018301
Vehicle No . SKD 1507 Y
Model Code : A5 SPORTBACK 20 TFSI
Model / Year 200272019
Engine No T CVK 074541
Chassis No + WAUZZZFSTKAD16341
Mileage :
Date In
Liability
Excess Cost r -
Estimated By +  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date :  30-Apr-19

Place of Accident *  Ajrport Road



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408692
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SKD 1507 Y

Estimated
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges

To remove and transfer front wire hamess for
1 headlights, homs, outside temperature sensor, SIN § 480.00 5 480.00
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.

To dismantle and renew front bumper, rhs front fender
2 and rhs headlight Re-organise crash management 5 2,800.00 5 750.00
components. Reinstall all parts removed.

3 To respray front bumper and rhs front fender S 2,000.00 s 1,100.00
5 Supplementary s 1,600.00 s 600.00
6 To carry out diagnostic check. SIN § 192.00 $ 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES . | 7,072.00 5 3,122.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Rean No. SKD 1507 Y
Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER 5 2.073.00
2 FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT PARTS 5 368.00
3 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH - 56.00
4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH ] 431.00
5 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH 5 33.00
B FRONT BUMPER SENSOR S 231.00
7 FRONT BUMPER SENSOR SEAL RING 5 12.00
B FRONT FENDER - RH -] 968.00
9 FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS 5 48.00
10 FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH - 68.00
1 FRONT FENDER BRACKET - RH § 32.00
12 FRONT FENDER POP RIVET $ 15.00
13 FRONT FENDER BRACE - RH ] 107.00
14 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER - RH TBC
15 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER TRIM - RH s 33.00
16 FRONT FENDER STOMNE CHIP GUARD 5 45.00
17 FRONT FENDER CORNER CHROME TRIM - RH s 145.00 7 115.60
18 HEADLIGHT - RH 3 7,204.00 5 5,.763.20
18 HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER- RH 5 181.00
20  SUPPLEMENTARY s 286.00 § 227.04
21 SUNDIRES s 500.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 12,837.00 § 6,105.84
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 7,072.00 $ 3,122.00
GRAND TOTAL s 19,909.00 s 9,227.84

All charges are not inclusive of GST

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved. Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel . (B5) B358 2323 Fax : (65) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Rag No. 19-9802271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/ODIDSBY201DYITF
78 Shenton Way Date 3-Jun-19
#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor Glory Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages 1 of 1
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept  Regn No SKD 1507 ¥
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No A5 SPORTBACK 2.0 TFSI
Quantity | Description | UnitPrice  Amount |
Parts
1 Front bumper top cover S 116,00 $ 92.40
2 Sign "caution” sticker s 13.00  § 0.76
3 Air-cond sticker 5 700! § 512
4 Bracket lock carrier 5 125.00 § 100.00
5 Bonnel impact protection center 5 2500 S 19.76
$ 286.00 3 227.04
LABORS
1 To repair and respray bonnel 5 160000 S§ 600.00
TOTAL $ 188600 § 600.00

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks :

L

Please Note 1 This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel.6768 9828 for appointment

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Norah Khai
78 Shenton Way 6768 991 1
#07-16 AIG Building 841 1183
Singapore 079120 Nora khai@ premiumauto.com.sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
Yr Ref: SKD 1507 Y PA/OD/O589/2019/NH

14" JAN 2020
Dear Sir,

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SKD 1507 Y, Audi A5 SB 2.0 TFSI S-TRONIC.

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SKD 1507 Y, claimant,
Ms. Hay Hui Hui, Marilyn, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85014742 — 88 9.017.79.
2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 9911,

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Norah Khai
Claims Dept

Encl
AIG-SKD 1507 Y

from

Telephone +85-
Telatax  «85-
EMail

Our department
Our Ref

Your Ref

Date

foial pages

Pramium Automobiles Ple Lu
Showroom

8 Leng Kes Road

Singapore 159080
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (B5) 68471 3732

Sarvice & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408699
Telephone (65) 68336 2323
Telefax  (65) 684 11183



Premium Automobiles

Telefax
Norsh Khai trom
-mﬂtmhln a768 0828 seph e
#07-16 AIG 66411183  Towhe o8
Singspore 079120 u_"""
Muotor Claims Body Repait -lu—"l”
Yr Ref: SKD 1507 Y i O
P 1WGW  Ow hel
7 June 2019 Uwx
RE:  CLAIM - OWNER'S SATISFACTION/DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Premiem Autsmobees s L
Make & Model 3 Audi AS SPORTBACK 2.0 TFS1 § Lang Kes Rowd
[ . . Singagcte 159000
Vehicle Chassis No. :  WAUZZZFSTKA016341 Twiaphons (63) 8556 1111
Vehicle Regn Ne. SKD 1507 Y o
-y " Sarace & Pars Castres
Vehicle Mileage ~ :  S676KM 28 Ubi Road 1
Vehicle Owmer : Ms. Hay Hul Hui, Marilyn Tolephane (6] €304 2323

Certificate No : 1900018301
Own Damuge Excess $356.00 (lochmive THGST)

Accident Date 3 30/042019

Place 1 Airport Road
Ranale ot + s 301 49
WIP No. : s

Repairer's Name T Premium Automobiles Pic Lid

I/We centify that the vehicle has been fully repaired 60 my entire satisfaction
mufﬂn ﬁﬂ#muhhﬁmﬁ:’&apqumu;:ﬁ




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Audi Cantre Singapore Alpxandra Service Centre Ubi Service Centre Customer Service
281 Amsardrs Aosd 281 Manarirs Mond S5 Uk Foad 1 Saryite dpooimrend 5368 73
Singapons 1 F200R Engapas | 5FE38 Srgapors 40865 24-peur lireandoen Sarvice SE2S 173
Mlain Tabephone S836 2723 Mam Telephone £388 2523 M Tmophone BI8E 7133 Emmil CLBIDTS AN MLITEAT GO Ry
Main Talefas 8471 3733 Win Taiofen 8475 1023 Mmin Tesedan 6841 1183
INS TAX INVOICE
Page 1 14:19 Compeny HReg. No. 199502271W
GST Reg. No. 159902Z271W
AIT ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD : . 0147837 Account a0008 - 01
TR LA CEE Invoice No: 83014742 IT ]
AIC BUILDING
78 EHL‘QT".‘-I:I WhY Date L3/01/2020 AIG ABIA BACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
§OT-1E MOTOR CLAIM DEPT
SINGAPORE 079120 079120 1507 e kL
g * £ Order : sEDISOTY 78 SHENTON WAY
#0T-18
Term i0 SINGAPORE 078120
Regn No: seniso?y (v ¢0844) Regn Date: 20/02/201% Mileage: 14179 WIP No.: 52381
Model: A> SPORTBACE 2.0 TFS§I 5 tronic Chassis: WAUZZZIFSTEADIEI4I Engine: cve 074541 Dept: u
You have been assisted by -- UB-Teny Foong 13
Details Qty Linit Price Amount
o EXC M: EBBE -800.00 1.00 -800.00
Insurance Ewesss/Liability
BODYWORY M 460.00 1.00 480.00
10 REMOVE AND TRAMSFER FRONT WIRE
HARNESS FOR HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, OUTSICE
TEMPERATURE SENSOR, HEADLIGHT WASHER ASEY
AKD FHONT PARKING AID.
s BODYWORK M 750,00 1.00 750.00
T0 DISHMANTLE AND RENEW RHS HEADLIGHT.
TO REFAIR HHS FRONT FENDER.REORGANISE
CRASH MANAGEMENT COHBONENTS.REINSTALL
ALL PRETS REMOVED
g SODYWORK H: 1100.00 1.00 1, 100,00
TO RESPHAY FEONT BUMPER AMD HHS FROMT FEMDER
] BODYNORE M: 182.00 1.00 182.00
TO CAREY OUT DIAGKOSTIC CHECE
H BODYWORE H: 600.00 1-00 &00.00
TO REPAIE AND RESPHAY BOMMET
X AEWEAYIE02A PUE |SE)THIM Less (204 1.00 144.50 115.60
b4 AEWGESE1TTIE |SE) HERDLIGHT Less 0204 1.00 1204, 00 L, 763,20
by ABWEROTOELS COVER (LAST) Less 0204 1.00 115.50 §2.40
X ABEQOLDSZ0C FLATE Lean 020% 1.00 12.2 8.76
® ABWDO10515A STICEER Less D204 .00 §.40 5.12
= ABWEBOTTT BAACKET [LAST) Less 0208 1.00 125.00 100,04
X ABWERZ23124 FROTECTION Lass 020% 1.00 24.70 18.78
Farta 6,.105.84 Suhb- 21,
Labour 0.00 ATORO R e 2
Sunlet 3.122.00 F S
Menus 0.a0 [=f " 7% GST YER-33
Lubricant 6.00 é& -
O V) Grand Total 901773
".‘- —= 1 ' ol
Received by For & on behalf of

Premium Automobiles Pre Lid
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.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified | Ext Submitted Ad| Assignes Ad) Rpt Adj Submittes Ins Auth'ed Statuw
; 08 May 2019 | o e §$9,227.84  |549,227.84 Panding for Survey
= £t fuag | £ A 2pe | eait esumates | """P‘I Cancel Case |

Clatm Detalls

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

lnisuted. HAY HUI HUI MARILYN, 1D: S7619613F, Tel +6556689755
Vehicle “T30/04/2019 D800 - :59
Mo o3 sMD1S07Y Date of Loss: EI: Manths snd 10 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
| Ciaim Type: |OD / 418275412156 rosey/caver | 1600018301 (Comprahensive)
Excess: S$800.00
Repairer: | Premium Automobiles Pte Lid - Alexandra (HQ) 281 Alesandra Ple Lid, Level B2, 159018 Alexandra - Tel: 63682213

Handiing | \yg Asin Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 . [Handled by Gan, Hunchung] Hunchung, Ganalg com

Lsurer;
Adiust LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (MQ) - Tei: 6356-3561 . [Handled by MOMHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMTD] ... [Final Rpt due
i 1?.{1]&1[! 19]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Ml |  Compase Case muil |

* AlG_SG_EXPRESS [14/05/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$8871.00) - SKD1507Y - Clalm Handler: Gan, Hunchu...
 AlG_SG_ENPRESS [LA05/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SKD150TY - Clalm Handler: Gan, Hunchung

ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS: view Al | Searcr Tasks | Croate New Task | Complete |

Dua Date PFriarity Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dona
Mo results.

https://singapore. menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 17/1/2020
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Claim Documents

*SKD1507Y (41827541215G)
=]
Apr 30 2019 B:00AM
[HAY HUI HUI MARILYN]
Premium Automaobiles Pte Ltd - Alexandra

Video [1 per page E]'_ﬁT
Na | Finaliged On AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (SG) Thumbnail |Print
1 |15/05/19 09:39 m‘ mn:un, Clmmmmni: WAY AL LT ALY @ | Losd M
Assessment Reports [Tperpage [~] B
Mo |Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
L |DB/05/19 18.26 | Adjuster Immediate Advics [ B
Photos/ Images [perpege V]| W
No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnail | Print
1 |13/05/1% 14:46 | Genersl View 8| biws | A
2 |13/05/19 14:46 | General View @ | uws | M |
3 [13/05/19 14:46 | General View © | woaws | W
4 |13/05/19 14:45 | General View @ | wadwc | A
5 |13/05/1% 14145 | General View B wadrc | A
& | 13/051514:45 | General View Q| tsedws | B
7 |13/0518 1448 | Genersl View @ | waaws | A
B 10519 14:48 | General View @ | wacws | A
(8 |1305/19 1446 | General View O e | A
10 |13/05/19 14:46 | General View @O weewe | A
1 |13/05/19 14:46 | General View @ | s | B
12 |13/05/19 14:46 | Ganeral View Q| oows | B
17 |11/05/19 14:46 | General View Q| ceowe | &
14 | 1/05/10 14:48 | Ganeral View 0| oadirc | A
15 |13/05/19 14:46 | General View @ | lcaarc | A
16 |13/05/19 14:46 | Ganeral View @ | twdips | B
17 |13/05/19 14:46 | Ganeral View 8| sars | B
10 |105/19 1446 | General View @0 | s | &
19 |19/05/10 14:46 | Ganeral View @ i |
Documentation 1 per poge E &
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbinall | Print
1 |D8/0S/19 18:15 | ESTIMATE Load POF

¥ | D9/05/19 09:29 Cartificate of Insurance Load POF

k | 09/05/19 09:29 Driver's Driving License ! Load POF

4 |09/05/18 09:32 | Police Report Load POF

5 08/05/19 09:32 Singapare Accident Statement Load POF

6 | 30/05/19 11:35 amended gia report Load POF

7 17701730 08:456 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF

B |17/01/20 08:48 DISCHARGE VOUCHER 0 | Load PoF

5 |17/01/20 0A:46 SUPPLEMENTARY PART q Load po¥ |

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST seset | Save | et
There are no document checkhsts configured.,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 17/1/2020
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- :

Show Remarks Te: [ Handling Insurer
SohE AL &N Pl o e you Bhae T in othes pETiEE
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregNa 168e071asm)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel; 6258-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Our File No: CC3/AIG18008109/T1TD3Q2
AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #07-18
Singapore 079120 Date: 17/01/2020
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: HAY HUI HUI MARILYN Policy No: 1800018301
Date of Loss: 30/04/2019 Nature of Claim: 0D Claim No: 418275412156
DESCRIPTION
Reg No: SKD1507Y
Make & Model: AUDI A4, 2.0 TFSI QU S-TRONIC {A) Engine No: CVKD74541
Reg. Date: 20/0272018 (Man. Year. 2018) Chassis No: WAUZZZFSTKAD18341
Colour Black Odometar, 4187 km
Engine Capacity, 1984 cc
Market Value/New Car  $5200,000.00
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): ¥es Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fromt Tyre Size: 245/40 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 245/40 R18
Froni Left Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Lefi Side: Micheiin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Right Side Michelin 8 mm
The abows values represant the remainmg [ imads deoth
;EGDBT OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Paris 12,837.00 6,105.84 6,731.18 52 44
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 7,072.00 3,122.00 3,850.00 55.85
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 19,909.00 9,227.84 10,681.16 53.65
- Excess (5%) BOO.00 B00.00 0.00 0.00
(S%) 15,108.00 B427.84 10,681.18 55.90
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 1.337.63 589.95 T4T 68 55.80
Natt Amount (S§) 20,446.63 9,017.79 11,428.84 55.90
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 08/05/2019
Date Inspected. DB/05/2018 Inspected Al Premium Automobiles Pte Lid -
Alexandra (HQ)
281 Alexandra Ple Lid, Level B2
Singapore 159938
Estimaled Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: DENISE TAY KWEE CHENG

NOTE: This neport represenits our fndings af the tme and place of inspection stated hemin. Such inspection has beon carmad ouf o he best of our
knowledpe and ability buf any other lability under any other circumstances iz hereby expressly exchidied.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 17/1/2020
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Page 3 of 4

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repair 2.073.00FS *.FS
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT PARTS Not Necessary 368 00FS *.FS
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE -RH Noil Necessary S5B.00FS ~FS
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE -RH Mot Necessary 431.00FS “FS
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION -RH Nol Necessary 33.00FS *Fs
8 1 *FRONT BUMPER SENSOR Mot Necessary 231.00F5 “FS
7T 01 *FRONT BUMPER SENSOR SEAL RING Not Necessary 12.00FS *.F§5
B 1 *FRONT FENDER -RH Repair 968.00FS “F5
8 1 *FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS Mot Necessary 48.00F5 “.FS
0 1 *FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT -RH Mot Necessary 6B.00FS *.FS
11 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACKET -RH Not Necessary 32.00FS *F§
12 1 *FRONT FENDER POP RIVET Noi Necessary 15.00FS *F5
13 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACE -RH Not Necessary 107.00FS ~FS
14 1 *FRONT WHEEL SPOILER -RH (NPA) Not Necessary 0.00FS “FS
15 1 *FRONT WHEEL SPOILER TRIM -RH Mot Necessary 33.00FS “FS
8 1 *FRONT FENDER STONE CHIP GUARD Not Necessary 48 00 FS *.FS
iT o1 *FRONT FENDER CORNER CHROME TRIM -RH  Necassary 14500F5 *11560FS
18 1 *HEADLIGHT -RH Cut 7.204 00FS5 *5783.20FS
19 1 *HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER -RH Mol Necessary 181.00FS *FS§
20 1 *SUNDRIES Nol Necessary 500.00FS *FS
21 1 *FRONT BUMPER TOP COVER Cracked 116.00FS  *9240FS
2 1 *SIGN CAUTION STICKER Necessary 13.00FS *476FS
23 1 *AIR-COND STICKER MNecessary 7.00FS *5.12F5
24 1 *"BRACKET LOCK CARRIER Cracked 12500FS *100.00FS
25 1 *BONNET IMPACT PROTECTION CENTER Damaged 2500FS “19.76F5

F=Franchise pan. S=SpcNet

Total Parts (S§) 12,837.00

6,105.84

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https:/singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 17/1/2020
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellanecus items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS New 480.00 480,00
FOR HEADLIGHTS ,HORNS ,OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
SENSOR,HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY AND FRONT
PARKING AID
2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER ,RHS MNew 2,800.00 750.00
FRONT FENDER AND RHS HEADLIGHT .RE-ORGANISE
CRASH MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS .REINSTALL ALL
PARTS REMOVED
1 TORESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND RHS FRONT FENDER  New 2,000.00 1.100.00
4  TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK New 192.00 192 00
5  TO REPAIR AND RESPRAY BONNET New 1,600.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost [S§) 7.072.00 3.122.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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