Vic (LKKAuto)
e ey

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 September, 2019 4:43 PM

To: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SKS1702X_invoice.pdf; SKS1702X_report.pdf; SKS1702X_rental_invoice.pdf;

SLV5035)_ins_search.pdf

Your Ref:
Our Ref : SKS 1702 X

12 September 2019

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

AIG Building, (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
78 Shenton Way TO: Any Personal Injury
#07-16 Claims)

Singapore 079120

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5 ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

As proposed by our Single Joint Expert, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD, of Cost of Repair at $7,750, we are
pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SKS
1702 X & SLV 5035 J on 7 May 2019. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as
stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$7,750.00
Cost of Rental :$ 1,080.00
LTA Search 1 $  7.45
Total: : $8,837.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SKS 1702 X, the Singapore Accident Statement of SKS
1702 X, rental invoice and LTA Search, for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now
operating from the following address:



37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2019 4:41 PM

To: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>; Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit
<Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina
<Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang
<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref;
Our Ref: SKS 1702 X

7 May 2019

INCOME Centre PROPERTY CLAIM

76 Bras Basah Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
NTUC Income Centre TO: Any Personal Injury
Singapore 189557 Claims)

Attn: Claims Department ViaEmail

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Thank you so much for your reply dated 7 May 2019. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your
selection of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint Expert.

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to instruct LKK Auto
Consultants Pte Ltd (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged vehicle
at our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 9 May 2019 (Thursday), 1700H so that we can
commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of the vehicle to our
client.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.



Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2019 2:48 PM

To: 'asiamotorsports@hotmail.com'

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY; Chin, Lee-Ying; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim,
Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLV5035J AND SKS1702X ON
07/05/2019

AlG <

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
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Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya,
membuka attachment.

Click here by 2019-05-14 14:49 +08 to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info

Disclaimer: This email and 1ts content are confidential and intended solely for the use of the
addressee. Please notfy the sender if you have received this email in error or simply delete it.

Secured by Prootpoint Encryption, Copyright © 2009-2017 Prootpoint, Inc. All rights

reserved.



ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD

Specialiss in salen of now & reconditioned bikes
mmgmzoosamw
CLAIRE LAW MUN SEE INVOICE NO: 2017/C146
S8608677H
DATE: 11/09/2019
VEHICLE NO: SKS 1702 X
MAKE : VOLVO ENGINE NO : D4162T3091344
MODEL : V40 D2 A/T ABS CHASSIS NO : YVIMV845BF2218691
D/AIRBAG 2WD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

Adjusted total lump sum repair costs S$7,750.00

Total amount payable $$7,750.00

V'S

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd




WINWIN RENTA CAR PTE LTD

Invoice

LIU YIZONG Invoice No :WPLIN0003155
38 JALAN JORAN Invoice Date :16/5/2019
S(809100) Due Date :16/5/2019

VHA No 13753

Referral ID  :1001
Description : Amount
Rental for 9 Day/s @ $120 per Day $ 1,080.00
Vehicle No . SLC4697E

Vehicle Description /____Mazdaj_.,l DA

Rental Penoch // 7“ b, ‘07]05/2019 s to, 15/05/2019

\‘x
o
(\)\.,._.f A \ \
\Total Amount Pa able 1,080.00

N
/\\

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #06-04 Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875
Tel: 6315 8479 H/P: 9833 0807
UEN: 201505115E



oo TR LT -7 3 & 1.7 <
WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD
VHANe: 3753

'8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #06-04 Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875

Tel: 6315 8479 H/P; 9833 0807 Invoice No: WP LIN 3 /L5
UEN: 201505115E VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT Hirer's Vehicle No : '
HIRER'S PARTICULARS Vehicle No: < L.~ 4 (- T “Replace Veh No:.
Name: (as inI/C)LM Yjzon(, o —= T :
: eageOut: ¢/ . ¢ Mileage Out;
- S i 5‘{ QL g 3 H Make & Model; ’Auto;Ma
Address (Resy 30 J4LAN JORAN S 509 100 | Make & Model, 2 il T
Out : Date 7f5 /Qf""ff] Time:
Name & Address of Employer: HIRE / PERIOD EXPIRY Time:
E S S e 7
Sl R NON-WAIVER EXCESS=$ /.

Singapore Driving Licence No: CHARGES

Issue Date: Date of Birth: ! &/ (e Daily c7 @ [ 20 perday #/ 050 |

Tel: (O) (R) HP: Weekly @3 per week
Name: (asin 1/C)
Hours @3% per hour
NRIC / FIN No:
Address (RBS): Extension @3
Delivery/Collection Service
Occupation: __- Drivi :
e g g SUB-TOTAL $
Singapore Driving Licence No:
Issue Date: DateofBith— | PETROL LEVEL
Tel: () (R): H/P: Out| E |1/8|1/4|3/8]1/2]5/8 34 |7/8|(F7
VEHICLE CHECK LIST : In | E [1/8|1/4|3/8|1/2|5/83/4 |7/8|(F)
@ Fuel
p o}
@ E Traffic / Parking Fines
58
B TOTAL CHARGES $
ow
E
s B
w == 2
= O P e
32 @ !
a G
2« Hirer’s Signature Ji_\l\f’
MISSING / FAULTY ACCESSORIES / PARTS '
REMARKS : :
s Additional Driver's Signature

| have read and agree to the terms and condition on both sides of the agreement. If | have presented a charge/credit card for payment. | agree that
all amounts payable under this agreement and for parking and traffic infringements may be billed to that account and my signature above will be
considered to have been made on the charge/credit card voucher. All information | have given WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD in connection
with this agreement is true. ]

*IMPORTANT

1. VEHICLE IS STRICTLY PROHIBITED FOR *HIRE FOR REWARDS" USAGE SUCH AS UBER/ GRABCAR / GRABSHARE ETC.

2. ONLY PERSON ABOVE 23 YEARS OF AGE WITH MORE THAN 2 YEARS DRIVING EXPERIENCE, AUTHORISED,LICENSED AND SIGNING THIS AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE THE VEHICLE.
3. ALL PARKING AND TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE HIRER. AN ADMINISTRATIVE CHARGE WILL BE LEVIED ON ANY TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS REDIREGTED.
4. THE HIRER SHALL BE LIABLE FOR EXCESS CHARGES FOR ANY LATE RETURN AT THE RATE SHOWN PER HOUR OR PER DAY. INCLUSIVE OF CDW AND/OR PA! WHERE APPLICABLE.
5. IN CASE OF AGCIDENT. THE HIRER SHALL REPORT TO RENTAL OFFICE IMMEDIATELY. IF THERE IS BODILY INJURIES. A POLICE REPORT MUST BE MADE WITHIN 24 HOURS.
8. VEHICLE IS STRICTLY FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY. AND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGAPORE WITHOUT PRIOR CONSENT OF THE COMPANY WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD,

RETURN OF VEHIGLE. THE HIRER / DRIVER iS REQUIRED TO SIGN IN THE COLUMN “ SIGNATURE OF HIRER / DRIVER " FAILING WHICH THE DAY AND TIME INSERTED BELOW SHALL DEEMED
TO BE THE DAY AND TIME THE VEHICLE IS RETURNED TO WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR FTE LTD AND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPTED AS CONCLUSIVE EVIDENCE OF THE SAME AND SHALL
NOT BE CHALLENGED OR QUESTIONED ON ANY ACCOUNT WHATSOEVER.

DATEIN | TIMEIN |MILEAGE | CHECKED BY REMARKS [@
h“u‘ I . >
(5] < [ 2000 SORLY’ 4 i

SIGNATURE OF HIRER/DRIVER

K



O

Land TranspartRﬁuthority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006528-2

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-190507-001555
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N ' Item Description/
'Business Transaction Referance
No.
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLV5035J
As at 07 May 2019/07:30:00

Print Date/Time :

Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enqguiry - SLV5035J
Enquiry Fee
20190507123450029223

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By

Amount
Before

SRT )

7.00

7.00
7.00

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
20190507123506747 (internet Banking)

Total

Cash Change

Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

07 May 2019/ 12:36:00
07 May 2019/ 12:35:59
GST  Amount

Amount After GST
(8$) (s$)
0.49 7.49
0.49 749
049 7.49
0.04

745

745

745

0.00

745

0.00

Please ensure that 'é'l_l";:;é'lﬁl_@nts to theAuthonty are good .and_p_rbni;_iﬁﬁ settled By"iﬁe paymén_t_ servl"ce-'i
i provider / financial Institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee !



