Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October, 2019 3:36 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: (Second Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY
2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - LKK REF CC4/AIG19008098/Gha3

Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have our principal’s
mandate and we offer a global sum of $8,400.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us together with the Authorization
to Act Letter duly signed by the owner for our principal to process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 12 October, 2019 1:58 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: (Second Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT - LKK REF CC4/AIG19008098/Gha3



Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are pending for mandate approval from our principal.
We will follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 11 October, 2019 5:20 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: (Second Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and call for a direct settlement.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586



Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports @hotmail.com

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 1:05 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: (Gentle Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are still in the midst of preparing mandate for our principal’s approval.
We will expedite and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F EFE” =

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 26 September, 2019 12:43 PM
To: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)




Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Here is a gentle reminder on the abovementioned accident and call for a direct settlement.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports @hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 12, 2019 4:43 PM

To: 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Your Ref:
Our Ref : SKS 1702 X

12 September 2019

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

AIG Building, (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
78 Shenton Way TO: Any Personal Injury
#07-16 Claims)

Singapore 079120

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,



#02-25
Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

As proposed by our Single Joint Expert, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD, of Cost of Repair at $7,750, we are
pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SKS
1702 X & SLV 5035 J on 7 May 2019. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as
stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$7,750.00
Cost of Rental :$ 1,080.00
LTA Search :$  7.45
Total: : $8,837.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SKS 1702 X, the Singapore Accident Statement of SKS
1702 X, rental invoice and LTA Search, for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1%t June 2019, we have shifted to and are now
operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2019 4:41 PM

To: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>; Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit
<Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina
<Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang
<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>




Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SKS 1702 X

7 May 2019

INCOME Centre PROPERTY CLAIM

76 Bras Basah Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
NTUC Income Centre TO: Any Personal Injury
Singapore 189557 Claims)

Attn: Claims Department ViaEmail

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 1702 X & SLV 5035 J ON 7 MAY 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Thank you so much for your reply dated 7 May 2019. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your
selection of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint Expert.

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to instruct LKK Auto
Consultants Pte Ltd (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged vehicle
at our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 9 May 2019 (Thursday), 1700H so that we can
commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of the vehicle to our
client.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2019 2:48 PM

To: 'asiamotorsports@hotmail.com’

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY; Chin, Lee-Ying; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim,
Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLV5035J AND SKS1702X ON

07/05/2019
AlG ) <




This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.
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Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya,
membuka attachment.

Click here by 2019-05-14 14:49 +08 to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info



