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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, S May 2019 1:15 PM

To: Vale Oh

Cc: LKK Valuation; zhuangchou.han (zhuangchou.ha n@axa.com.sg); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto);

KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Assistance required: Effect MV for SLG2'109D - Toyota Camry

Dear Vale,

The market value of SLG 2109D is $93K-$95K (Estimated) as atMay 2019.

Best Regards,

Veron chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

BIk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: HAN Zhuangchou <zh ua ngchou.han @axa.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 8:52 AM
To: ad min@autoprobe.com.sg; benson @ lbs-auto.com; bhtay@a utoprobe.com.sg; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

<bryana ng@lkkauto.com>; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; Elgene Teng <elgene@rta.com.sg>;

elson @rta.com.sg; Fran kie Pang <fra nkie @fta.com.sg>; FTA <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg;

KKLau <kkla u@ lkka uto.com>; nick@ lbs-auto.com; Olivia Lau (tKKAuto) <olivialau @ lkka uto.com>; patrick.soo @a-pac.sg;
ricky@rta.com.sg; LKK Valuation <va luation @ lkkauto.com>
Cc: oH Vale <va le.oh @axa.com.sg>
Subject: Assistance required: Effect MV for 51G2109D - Toyota Camry

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Vale oh with the Market Value for this case.

DOA:0710512OL9

Best Regards,



Han ZC

Specialist I SIU & SITF

AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

Email: zhuangchou.han@axa.com.sg
DID: {65) 6880 8723

www.axa.com.sg
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fi etease consider the environment before printing this email

This message is confidential. Any unauthorlzed disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. lf
you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

---Disclaimer---
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. lf you are not

the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. lf you have

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this

message are solely those of the author and do not necessa rily represent those of AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd or any other

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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Owner:D:
Vehicle Details

C0xn1
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

sLG2109D

lntended Deregistration.Date: 07 May 2OL9

TOYOTA

CAMRY2.5AUTO

2ARU338074- -ylSa*irli ta;
133.0kW (178 bhp)I MoiT,I f9y9t g!!ry!

I Open Market Value:

_..Original Reeistration D_ate:_..

Firs{ ReBistration Date:

$29,296.OO

23 Sep 2016

23 Sep 20!6
TransferCount:

ActualARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details

o

ss3,oildd /6tDl

22 Sep2026

$24,767.00

22Sep 2026

E- Open Category

10

$le,eeq.oo

$4L,955.00

966,776.OO
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