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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 4:58 PM

To: Precise Auto Service

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252J AND SJJ 5984G *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIG19008053/Uha3 

Importance: High

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Yan Hong, 

 

We refer to the subject matter and we confirmed in receipt of your LOD. 

 

Our principal noted that the registered owner is already deceased and our principal would like to request for a copy 

of the Grant of Probate / Letter of Administration. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 1:30 PM 

To: Precise Auto Service; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: RE: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252J AND SJJ 5984G *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008053/ja3  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Joy at 6841 2409. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 11:55 AM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252J AND SJJ 5984G 

 

Dear Ms. Mei Kwan,  
 

Kindly send me a copy of  SJJ 5984G's GIA report.   
 

 

 

Thank you 

 

Best regards 

Yan Hong 

 

--  
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  T : 6745 7367   |   F : 6841 3390 
  E : support@preciseauto.sg 
  W: www.preciseauto.sg 
  A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 
 

 

  Follow us on social media:  

https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/          

https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs 

https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/ 


