Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 October, 2019 4:42 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252) AND SJJ 5984G *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIG19008053/Uha3

Attachments: 11102019163408.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

We enclose herewith the discharge voucher duly executed as requested for your attention.

Kindly forward us payment of $4,560.00 within the next fourteen (14) days to be issued in favour of
"PRECISE AUTO SERVICE".

Your prompt reply of the above claims will be much appreciated.

Thank you

Best regards
Yan Hong

On Fri, 11 Oct 2019 at 16:16, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Yan Hong,

We refer to the subject matter.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer settlement as below:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S  3,852.00
Loss of Rental (5100 x 7 days) S 700.00
LTA Search Fee S 8.00

TOTAL $ 4,560.00



If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us(LKK) for our principal to process
the payment.

The above amount is payable to PRECISE AUTO SERVICE.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

N Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg]

Sent: Friday, 11 October, 2019 9:48 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252) AND SJJ 5984G *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19008053/Uha3

Dear Vic

Attached as per your request.



Thank you

Best regards
Yan Hong

Virus-free. www.avg.com

On Thu, 10 Oct 2019 at 16:58, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Yan Hong,

We refer to the subject matter and we confirmed in receipt of your LOD.

Our principal noted that the registered owner is already deceased and our principal would like to request for
a copy of the Grant of Probate / Letter of Administration.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:



This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 1:30 PM

To: Precise Auto Service; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252] AND SJJ 5984G *** . KK REF:
CC4/A1G19008053/ja3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.



SKETCH PLAN
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

OM THE MENTIOMED DATE & TIME, | WAS STATIONARY AT THE 5LIF ROAD OF LENTOR AVEMUE
AND WANTED TO FILTER TO YISHUN AVE 1. | HAVE CHECKED THE TRAFFIC ALONG YISHUN AVENUE [ |
—{1 WAS CLEAR AND CONFIRMED THAT THE VEHICLE INFRONT (5GI3152]) STARTED TO MOVE OFF. | [—
|_|THEM REALESED THE BRAKES AND FOLLOWED. OUT OF ASUDDEN, THE SAID VEHICLE STOPPED

ABRUPTLY EVEM THE TRAFFIC ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 1 WAS CLEAR. | TRIED TO STOP BUT IT WAS
STILL TOO LATE, MY VEHICLE HIT ONTC THE BACK OF VEHICLE SG13252). |

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact _

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 11:55 AM




To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @lkkauto.com>
Subject: Request for GIA report - SGJ 3252] AND SJJ 5984G

Dear Ms. Mei Kwan,

Kindly send me a copy of SJJ 5984G's GIA report.

Thank you

Best regards

Yan Hong

T:67457367 | F:6841 3390

E : support@preciseauto.sg

W: www.preciseauto.sg

A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Follow us on social media:



tps://www.instagram.com/preciseautosys/

ttps://twitter.com/preciseautosvs

tips://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/
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