
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 11/11/2020

Your Ref. No. : DM19HO01235/JT

Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI19008050/Kga3q2

: $ 3,153.66         

: $ days

Rental (If any)      : $ 500.00            5 days 

: $ 7.49                

: $

3,661.15         

: $ 3,600.00         

:

 

1)                   : $ 3,600.00                                

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

JOANNE LEE

GLOBAL SUM

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)
Vehicle No.

4/5/2019

SGE 2200S

SJK 7802E

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

100%

LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 29 August 2019 10:36 AM
To: 'DRTTK9@GMAIL.COM'
Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC4/EQI19008050/Kga3 *** ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SGE 2200S & SJK 7802E ON 04/05/2019 ***

Our Ref:  CC4/EQI19008050/Kga3 
 
29 AUGUST 2019 
 
TAN SIEW YONG 
DRIVER: TAN SU-YEN, ANDREA 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE 2200S & SJK 7802E ON 04/05/2019 
 
We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ 
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance 
policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SJK 7802E. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to 
ceciliachong@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. 
The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required: 

 
 Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any) 
 Driver’s Work Permit / NRIC 

 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
 
“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our 
part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the 
accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference shall be made to this offer 
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 
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Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for 
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment 
on the settlement sum.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 11:05 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGE 2200S / Our Ref: SJK 7802E (Date of Accident: 04.05.2019) //LKK REF: 

CC4/EQI19008050/Kga3

Dear Cecilia 
 
Please fill in your  workshop’s bank details.  
 

Account Name Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd 
Account Number 107-307-934-4 
Bank Name United Overseas Bank Limited 
Bank & Branch Code 7375 / 007 

 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards. 
 
Jenny Lim 
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD 
160 Sin Ming Drive  
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 
Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 64538110 
Fax: 64596267 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 9:38 am 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGE 2200S / Our Ref: SJK 7802E (Date of Accident: 04.05.2019) //LKK REF: CC4/EQI19008050/Kga3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jenny, 
 
Thanks for your acceptance. 
 
Kindly note that NO DV is required for this matter.  
 
Please submit a copy of LOA and fill up the following and email back to us (LKK). 
 
Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes. 
 
Please fill in your  workshop’s bank details.  
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Account Name  
Account Number  
Bank Name  
Bank & Branch Code  

 
Many thanks  
 
“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our 
part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the 
accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference shall be made to this offer 
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 
 
Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for 
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment 
on the settlement sum.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 21 October 2020 5:54 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGE 2200S / Our Ref: SJK 7802E (Date of Accident: 04.05.2019) //LKK REF: CC4/EQI19008050/Kga3 
 
Dear Cecilia 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We are agreeable to your offer to settle our client claim as provided therein. 
 
Please let us have the discharge voucher. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards. 
 
Jenny Lim 
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD 
160 Sin Ming Drive  
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 
Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 


