Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Veronique Guichard <veroniquell8@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 May, 2019 10:52 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 3393C AND SJZ 7846A ALONG JUNCTION OF
HARLYN ROAD & TREVOSE ROAD ON 06/05/2019

Attachments: Renewal license.JPG

Hello,

please find attached a photo of my driving license.

hank you,

regards,

Veronique D'Inca

The D'Inca's
18 Berrima Road
299893 Singapore

Vero +65 9383 0680
Fede +65 9119 9083

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2019 3:20 AM

To: VERONIQUE118@HOTMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 3393C AND SJZ 7846A ALONG JUNCTION OF HARLYN ROAD & TREVOSE ROAD ON
06/05/2019

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/ASM19008047/ha3

YOUR REF : GA350744/1

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 3393C AND SJZ 7846A ALONG JUNCTION OF HARLYN ROAD &
TREVOSE ROAD ON 06/05/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL acting on behalf of the owner of SJZ
7846A against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your policy.

And also we checked your Driving Licence was expired on 12 February 2018.
Please let us have a copy of your Driving Licence if you have renewed your Driving Licence.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



