Jia Le (LKK Autn!

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 11:06 AM

To: lia Le [LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: PRI for GBD1770) and GBDS683K [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear lJia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65 6296 2706

‘.—.

The all (¥% ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) |[mailto:JiaLe@|kkauto.com]|

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 10:28 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: PRI for GBD1770) and GBD5689K [External Confidential]
Lonpac Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021757

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC19007993/Ada3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 06/05/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement
with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance to the
MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “FONG MOTORS” is as follows: -

Claimed Amount | Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) § 6,553.30 $ 2,900.00

2. Loss of Rental (4days x § 684.80 S 684.80 (4days x
S160)w/GST) S160)w/GST)




| Total | § 7,238.10 | $3.584.80

**()5days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval,
« wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Year ~

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue I, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May, 2019 12:00 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh(@lonpac.com>; assignmr:nts <assignments(@lkkauto.com=
Ce: 'MT Claim_SG' <mt_claim(@/lonpac.com=; Admin A <a lkkauto.com™>

Subject: RE: PRI for GBD1770J and GBDS689K. [External Cﬂnﬁdentml]
Dear Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 10:08 AM

To: assignmentsi@lkkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: FW: PRI for GBD1770J and GBDS689K [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC05/021757



Dear Nivitha,

Please proceed as requested.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tt_:rwf-:l 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—

The all (¥ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: FONG MOTORS [mailto:fongmotors@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May, 2019 9:50 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Re: PRI for GBD1770) and GBD3689K [External General]

Dear Gerald,

Please arrange Adran Ling.
Thank you.

Regards
Siew Cheng
Fong Motors
81820548

On Tue, May 7, 2019 at 9:09 AM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh(@lonpac.com= wrote:

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC05/021757

Dear Siew Cheng,



We attached the list of motor survevors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

for your attention

Please revert.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all C¥ew ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: FONG MOTORS [mailto:fongmotorsi@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 5:48 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: PRI for GBD1770J and GBD5689K

Dear Sir,

Kindly arrange PRI for vehicle no.GBD1770]
Will forward the GIA report by tomorrow.
Please let us have your list of survey.

Thank you.



Best Regards
Siew Cheng

Fong Motors

5 This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWww.avg com
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Atta. Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YEHICLE No 58D 1100 aud Gap Yesqic
ALONG ___Uppar Faya L2 bar ON_c[x[30.9

We understand that your are the insurer of © @0XEITE \ehicle.

V'We wish to inform you thut myfour velucle _GAL ' 1103 pave boen completed
repairs 1o myfour sutisfuction by M/ FONG WDBTORL  I/We therefore propose
i claim from vour as follows.

1. Costof Repuirs ss_>.990.C0

2 Lossof Bee/Renal(SS. "% 4 days) ss La.80

3 LTA Search Fee/GIA Reports 5 1.4X
TOTAL ss 9513 .2%

Please lel us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

qﬁh/&- ]
5:\1‘&—7 r1.--.~1I D hermou| . o
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L Mor Universge Seovice Pyp Lié(‘ﬂgﬂ&:dmdﬁnu"]ﬂf 2 Tighon lod

bl 208-21 nieww, &a:ﬂr?mmlmd Gephiiog (vehicle no.) bereby
aithorize FONG MOToRS ("the workshop™) 10 act fior

me Wﬂhmhmydﬁnhmpa&mm’wmm&bmofmﬁﬁm“]fzmy
?ﬁkm-{ﬂb_l‘ﬂ_‘%mewmmmﬂmmmm e[ 5|20}

ate)along . _Jppa, —Eﬂ'-{l Woher (focation) involving vehicle
nofs __ S8DEL 29 e (“the sccident),

Deted this '8 +1\ (gayy o8 Mov (manth) 207 fsear)

T~
: xﬁ\\\!}ﬂ{ FONG MoTORe
q“ﬁeﬁxdputyclm.u" Signed by |
\ %w&m} (vith chp),



' » LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO 181919V C05/021757
DATE : 24 FEBRUARY 2020

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, STAR UNIVERSE SERVICE PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of GBD 5689K the sum of Singapore
Dollar Three Thousand Five Hundred Eighty Only ($3.580.00) i full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the smd M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving GBD 1770) and GBD 5689K on 06
May 2019 along UPPER PAYA LEBAR.

| 'We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHIDY OVERSEAS ASSOCIATES (PTE) LTD AND/OR YEO SEOW JIE)
against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalfl in respect of the said acaident.

I'We further authorize vou to pay the above settlement sum directly 1o FONG
MOTORS.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment 15 made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action

AL

......................................

Name of vehicle owner /Date



Fong Motors
(06897200L)
1 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
#01-45 Singapore 417883

INVOICE No. : INV-042871
GBD1770U TOYOTA DYNA | Your Ref,
QOur D/O No. :
Terms : C.OD,
Date r 21/11/2019
TEL : FAX : | Page + 1of1
[tem Description Oty uomM U/ Price Disc. Total
S5 55
1. Cost of repair as agreed 1 UNIT 2,900.00 2,900.00
2. Loss of Rental 1 UNIT 684.80 684.80
SINGAPORE DOLLAR THREE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED EIGHTY FOUR AND CENTS Total| 3,584.80)

EIGHTY ONLY

Notes

1. All cheques should be crossed and mede payable to
Fong Motors

2, Goods sold are nedther retumabde nor refundable. Otherwise
& cancellation fee of 20% on purchasze price will be imposed

]

o |

Authorised sagﬁam



wellcome motor agencies

B8 Kaki Bukin Avenua & A02-02 ARK @ KB Singapore 417860

v ' Tel: 6344-4012 Fme B8345-3140 Email somin@welloome com.sg
Website: www wallcama.com.sg
CO. REG. NO! 30853800W / GST REG. NO: ME-0DD1Z28:R

TAX INVOICE
Star Universe Service Pte Ltd
¢/o Fong Motors NO: 29587
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-27

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

DATE: 15/05/2019

REF DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
RA NO: Being rental charges for One Unit 4 Days x 5160 S5 640.00
31170 Nissan Cabstar With Hood No:

GBG 1166M for period

07/05/19 to 11/05/19
SUB TOTAL SGD SS 640.00
ADD 7% GST S5 44 .80
GRAND TOTAL 5GD SS 684.80

E&O.E
WELLCOME MOTOR AGENCIES All cheque payment should be made
Customer Copy within 7 days to WELLCOME
MOTOR AGENCIES

W . Thank You
[ For Renting
- Afifhorised s%nure
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wellcome motor agencies

2B8 TANJONG KATONG ROAD SINGAPORE 437072
TEL (65) 6344-4012 FAX; (65) 6345-3140
Email: wnaB8 @singnet.com.sg Website: www.wallcomsa.com.sg

D

RANo: 31170

CO. REG. NO: 38853800W
GST AEG, NO: MB-0001228-R

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT [ -4X5Gu,
HIRER™S PARTICULARS PARTICULARS
Nue ——rraf~ Ljauvertse SE{VH-L vence o BS TG ry ree. vin so.
s ™ makemoon. 75« £5G 1) W ™ .
] - [ gl +ar- oo d
MILEAGE OUT MILEAGE OUT
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1€ No DL No TMEOUT A0 f D TIME OUT
HIREPERION EXPRY
Drale of Bene Dhate oof TuaseFoagnry —y
Muticnaliey. PL il Jusniee " = Charges
Uheeupanie. Dviving Exp: s -‘{" - 1 'gﬂ ey _m —
Weckly | @5 per week
Ted Mic() R (i s = S
B DRIVER'S PARTICULARS [T i 4 per buag
e = afitol kudducs Others *s
Achlress Cow s per day weeimonth
Al L] per day i week month
1CPP N DNy (o BSAHES 1 Uj || DELIVERY SERVICE
Dute of Birth Dlate of DseEpiey L TN SUB-TOTAL 5§
Nathnality PLof e ﬁmml L?EL :
Ohocupation Dehwting Bxas L 1 12 -
Tel ‘4?:‘ 1] 4] n!FI (Hi7) " il B ad
Exngnamn of Rental
Repairs Damages
Chllectinn Seevice
_ = 4
asTem | 4.4 |
§ g TOTAL CHARGES 88 | £ 5o
a % @ SECUNITY DEPOSIT
ADVANCE RENTAL PAID
'___'O a: | casi| wers| cveoue | ans| caro|
CHEQUETARD NO:
= AACCIOENTS C-CRACKED D-DENTS 5-SCRATCHES e
/J % AMOUNT DUE | REFUND
Jﬁ‘ﬂ = DRIVER'S = HEFUND oY :
“ ATURE & STAMP SIGNATURE RECEIVED 58 RECEIVER
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parymble under this Eulrlhglndhm:hw
on the ﬂlﬂm-l:l'lF Information U'Wa heve glven

WeLLCOmE

COME

IMPORTANT

1) Qnly persons mummmmurwﬁm:muﬁ? experisnce, authorised,

2) Vahicls ia stri usa and may not be driven out of Singapore without prior consent of

3 Usa of the vehicle for illegal purpose (for instonce In connection wilh thall dmu paddiing of br
i} Additiomal drivers are required to register s belors they are alicwed to drive (he Otharwina, ha/sha will

mmnnrwuuummnmm hrmhhrﬁtﬂmdimmmn rorpnrﬂny inclusive

8) In case of accident, ||'ll‘ shall mpvﬂ fo awn P:‘lpllillihp m uries a police
ﬂﬂméﬁl

T} No refund will be given for

In eonnection with this sgresment ane trus and accurate.
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&} The hirer s aino tha first 55
excess o tha mwm
RETURN OF VEHICLE - mrm-m 'Ggmﬂl-ﬂm;ﬂm-’mem nd time nsened Delow shall desmed to
ba tha day and lima the vahich s retumsd o HI:ITﬂRnﬂEHDi i the sams shall be sconpted os mmy
challenged or questioned an any
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