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= mE W Consultants
aja BE B Pie Lid Company Reglstration No. 199607198R

SIUBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 405923 TEL : (1165) 62563361 FAX ; (5] 62364315

Your ref’ D19002898MFSH
Qur ref: CS/FCI9007991/T1vd3 Date: 7/5/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO SGN 6468M

We thank you for your instruction on ~ 6/3/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

6/5/2019 at the premises of M/s WAHHONG M S & CREDIT LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8$2,242.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 551,890.00
"Check" Items Amount : 55180.00
Total : 8%

Market Value 15

LTA Reimbursement Value : S§

Nett Value 4t

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cCnReq Mo 1350000060  GST Heg. Mo M2-000167 545
B Raffies Quay 421-00 Singapoee 348580
Tel: [B5) 6222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Mater Undenwriting Degt: 36 Hobinscn Road #16-01 Oty House Singapore 0G2BT7
Tel (65} 6507 3848 Fax (B5) 6507 3849
iy msfirscapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

02-05-2019 Our Ref No. D19002898MFSH
30-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD33Z26A Third Party Vehicle. SGNG468M

38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST #01-57 ENTERPRISE HUB
SUNNY TEE

65155888/ 62630568 Fax No. 68966321

DIRECT SETTLEMENT.

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

WaAH HONG MOTORS & Attention. NIL
CREDIT PTELTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signatura required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 2:26 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002898MFSH/1, SGN 6468M
Attachments: SGN 6468M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGN 6468M
Date of survey: 6/5/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408533)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 12:32 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com=>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002838MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailtm:r.:wsmnturclaims@msfirstcapitat.mm.sgl
Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 12:12 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @LEKAUTOD.COM




Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002898MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
I WWW.avg.com



Veron Chen {LKI{Autu}_

#

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 5:07 PM

To: Michael Tee

Cc: SUR: Taufikh (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: SGNB468M (3) ( And Can You Finalisation)
Dear Michael,

Moted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

Erom: Michael Tee <michael@wahhong.sg>

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 1:22 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com=; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: Re: SGN6468M (3) ( And Can You Finalisation)

OK FOR Lump Sum At 51,300.00 5 Days LOU
On 27 May 2019, at 1:19 pm, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Michael.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $1300 @ 5 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Michael Tee <michael@wahhong.sg=
Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 2:33 PM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>




Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SGN6468M (3) ( And Can You Finalisation)

<MARKING .pdf>



RITIAN19

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Oweener 1D Type:

Owener 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

COriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 May 2019

PARFIMNFE Rahata Frmoing

Singapore NRIC
S915C

SGMNA4ABM

Me

07 May 2019

TOYOTA
COROLLAALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Red

2006

3ZZ46109456
MROSIZEC 107134098
BL.O KW (108 bhp)
$15,498.00

24 Mov 2006

24 Nov 2006

4]

$13.027.00

Forfeited

$0.00

23 Now 2024

A-Car [1600cc & below)
10

£51,641.00

$38,960.00

$38,960.00

OK

REpS.VLIE. gov.sgitalvIvacton/enguIreHeoatedy-ublceetoreUereginputyF LINL | HWIN_IU=Fosusuud i



Mame:
Address:

LEE AH KHIM

Blk 206 Bukit Batok Street 21 #11-74

Singapore 630206

Policy Number; D 300072715 QMY
Ouotation for Reinstste | Repairs for Vehicle

Parts Replacement-Cost Price

1 Pc
| Pe
1 Pc
1 Pc
1'Pe
L'Pe
1Pc
| Pc

| job

I job

Rear Bumper

Rear End Panel

Rear Lamp Panel Below

Rear Rivet .

Rear L/H Lamp — [/H# %‘
Rear L'H Side Bumper Retainer
Rear R/H Side Bumper Retainer
Rear L/H Side Bumper Bracket

—

Date;
Vehicle No:

2/5/19

SGNA46EM

Cost Price

L= T T T T T ]

L

To remove and replace all the parts mentioned adove and knocking
and straighten up the necessary affected arcas

To spray painting on affected areas

Michael Tee

Wah Hong Motors & Credit Pte Ltd
Tel: 67737377

Fax: 68966321

Email; michaeli@wahhong.sg

38 Toh Guan Road East, #03-57 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 6088981 Tei: 6515 5988

Labour's Total : §

Sub-Total : %
GST 7% : % 156,94

Grand Total : _§  2,39894

’H,'f % 'I«'h:{

160.00 efmlﬂr e

410,00 71 =
85.00 &4

BO0 aLe "

180.00 F
22.00 A7
2200 £V
5000

Gio

N
Tauple 1344514
" k\.}{?-’

5;*; !l."-'“ |:-* :".l..i'l.p'h

f,-«-.m 7% e
FZ&‘JN - vt.:”-tr ﬁ{’«‘u g
v @ [rhandoo
“50{&,{ A

{
£ 1.142.00
f -~
$  650.0079°
5 45000 7 <0
[, 10000
224200 (ASS

45 | %,

* Mg legal mogihicat

Itants hence nolify i
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey beforelaftar spray painting
« To display damaged part(s} during resurvey
« Parts prices are subject 1o confirmation
« Third party survey isona “Without Prejudice” basss
on(s) = allowed

"‘51-|:|F|'IE"1E":3-} s 6] et B "".-"-'E_t':'ﬂuﬂnﬁ ;
is subject to final acpr vl from [nsusance Lo pany

Acknowledged by Repais

Signature:

Date:

WAH HONG

Fax: 6896 6321 Email: enquiryi@wahhong.sg



' Vel V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

il i1 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
"’-—_—_! TEL: 6256 3551 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref . CS/FCI18007981/T1vd3n2
#1601 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 i RS W”N”Hl‘lllwun
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 3326A Veh. Inspected SGN 6468M
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19002898MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KARENT Assign Date 06/05/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. MROS3ZEC107134008 Colour RED
Odometer 57262 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[185/70R14 MICHELIN & mirn
L/H Front Tyre 185/70 R14 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/70R14 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |1B5/70R14 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/04/2018 Inspection Date DE/05/2019
Survey held at WAH HONG & CREDIT FTELTD
38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-57 ENTERPRISE HUB
SINGAPORE 608581
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




§y L/

— ==

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya LIbl Indusirial Park, Singapaore 408833
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.;1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGN 6468M
LA Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER CRACKED 360.00 360.00
1|REAR END PANEL BENT 410.00 410.00
1|REAR LAMP PAMEL BELOW BENT 85.00 85.00
1|REAR RIVET MECESSARY 8.00 8.00
1|REAR L/'H LAMP NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|REAR L'H SIDE BUMPER RETAINER MECESSARY 22.00 22.00
1|REAR R/H SIDE BUMPER RETAINER NOT NECESSARY 22,00 -
1|REAR L/H SIDE BUMPER BRACKET CRACKED 55.00 55.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -235.00
1,142.00 705.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE ALL THE PARTS 650.00 500.00
MENTIONED ABOVE AND KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN
UP THE NECESSARY AFFECTED AREAS.
TO SPRAY PAINTING OM AFFECTED AREAS. 450.00 450.00
1,100.00 950.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,242.00 1,655.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) '

Report Ref Mo. CS/FCI19007991/T1vd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $41,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $38,960.00=NETT VALUE: $2,040.00

J@ﬂﬁ

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
MMATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salely for the use and benefit of the Clisnt named on the front page of this Report.

el Lo @ Lhind parm

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

reply on the Repor

o park. Aoy third pad




