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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 12:28 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Kelvin Teo; Admin A
Subject: Re: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3
Attachments: doc20190910122617.pdf

Dear Khanchna: 
 
Please refer to the attached signed DV 
 
 
Thank You ! 
Bridget Poh (Shimin) 
Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  
#01-406 Singapore 408701 
Office: 67431913 
 
 
On Tue, Sep 10, 2019 at 12:16 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

(save as to costs) 

  

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  
Thank you for the acceptance. 
  
We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action. 
  
Thank you. 

  

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 11:24 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Dear Khanchna: 

  

We accept $1110.00. 

  

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 
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On Tue, Sep 10, 2019 at 10:45 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement on a 50% liability basis at global sum of $1,111.00(all in) on this matter. 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 4:24 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Dear Khanchna: 

  

Please refer to the attached. 
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Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Thu, Sep 5, 2019 at 4:06 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

Kindly let us have your LOD. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 
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Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 September 2019 11:56 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Dear Sir: 

  

We have accepted the 50% Offer since 11/06 till now we haven't receive the DV yet, may we know whats the delay 
or do you still need anymore documentations? 

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Wed, Aug 21, 2019 at 10:47 AM shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Khanchna: 
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Please let us have the DV soonest. 

  

  

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Fri, Jul 19, 2019 at 2:11 PM shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Khanchna: 

  

Kindly let us have your DV soon. 

  

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 
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On Thu, Jul 11, 2019 at 12:13 PM shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Khanchna: 

  

Thank you for your offer, we accept 50% 

Kindly let us have the DV soonest, 

  

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Thu, Jul 11, 2019 at 11:49 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SLT8450J                                    Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aka3 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA1005X (AIG) & SLT8450J  ON 02.05.2019 

Based on the video footage, we are of the opinion that both vehicles were making a turn at the bend and 
there is no road lane marking. 

  

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client's claim in the 
above matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we are 
prepared to offer 50% to your client's claim. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed 
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 3:54 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Dear Khanchna: 

  

Please refer to the attached. 

Notice the TP vehicle has cut into our clients lane before making the turn. 

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  
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#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Thu, Jul 4, 2019 at 3:00 PM shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Khanchna: 

  

Will get from our client and get back to you soon. 

  

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Thu, Jul 4, 2019 at 2:25 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SLT8450J                                    Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aka3 

  

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA1005X (AIG) & SLT8450J  ON 02.05.2019 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. 

  

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI 
we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal 
assistance until you heard further from us. 

  

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order 
for us to look into the matter. 

  

We shall revert upon hearing from you. 

  

Thank You. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 12:05 PM 
To: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> 



11

Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Dear Bridget, 

  

We will check and revert back to you as current handler is my colleague Ms Khanchna. 

  

By copy to Khanchna, 

  

Kindly revert liability after review of case. Thanks 

  

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: shimin poh [mailto:shimin@jhk.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 10:08 AM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Kelvin Teo 
<kelvin@jhk.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: [AIG]: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Dear Cecillia: 

  

Kindly let us have liability and if clear please let us have the DV soon. 
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Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 

  

  

On Wed, May 22, 2019 at 1:20 PM Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19007966/Aga3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Shimin, 

  

Thank you for your email. Our case handler is Cecilia, who is copied in this email. 

  

To check case handler in charge in future, you may write to our admin-a@lkkauto.com.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Olivia Lau | Admin Manager 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: olivialau@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: shimin poh [mailto:shimin@jhk.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 1:12 PM 
To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLT8450J | VOLKSWAGEN JETTA 

  

Dear All: 

  

Accident involving SLT8450J/SMA1005X (AIG Insured) on 02/05/2019 
 
We act for JENNY LEONG, the owner of vehicle no. SLT8450J, which was involved in the above accident.  
 
Our client suffered loss and damage as a result of your Insured’s negligence in the driving of motor vehicle 
no. SMA1005X.  
 
We quantify our client claim’s as follows:  
Cost of Repair inclusive of GST                          : $ 1,979.50 
TP Insurer Enquiry inclusive of GST                    : $ 2.00 
Loss of Use @$60/day X 4 days                         : $ 240.00 
 
Total Claim Amount $2,221.50 
 
Pre-repair inspection of our client’s vehicle was carried out by Surveyor Adrian on 22/05/2019 and we have 
finalized $1,850.00 before GST 
We enclose herewith the necessary invoices for your immediate action 
Please let us know whether you are accepting liability and will be doing settlement within 7 days upon 
receiving this letter. If there are no discrepancies, please assist to forward the DV to us within 7 days.  
 
Best Regards,  

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 
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On Tue, May 7, 2019 at 2:02 PM shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Adrian: 

  

Attached complete estimate. 

  

 
 

Thank You ! 

Bridget Poh (Shimin) 

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1  

#01-406 Singapore 408701 

Office: 67431913 


