Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 5:56 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI'; assignments; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SJB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA:

03.05.2019 Our Ref:18/19/19/VP05/021750 [External General]

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Li Li,

Survey done on 07/05/2019. We will submit WP report to your good office.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 1:07 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SJIB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA: 03.05.2019 Our
Ref:18/19/19/VP05/021750 [External General]

Dear Li Li,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Joy,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/LPC19007960/ja3

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 12:59 PM

To: Car workz <carworkzws@gmail.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments@Ikkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SIB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA: 03.05.2019 Our
Ref:18/19/19/VP05/021750 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Nivitha

Please cancel assignment as the matter has been settled privately.
Kindly confirm that there is no fee incurred at your end.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew™ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 10:39 AM

To: Car workz

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments@lkkauto.com; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SJB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA: 03.05.2019 Our
Ref:18/19/19/VP05/021750 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Mdm
As of now, we only have the below list of surveyors (LKK) in our panel for third party survey.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

F -
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Car workz [mailto:carworkzws@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 10:34 AM
To: ONG LI LI




Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments@lkkauto.com; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: Re: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SJB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA: 03.05.2019 Our Ref:TBA
[External General]

Dear Ms Ong,
Can u send a few surveyor company for us to choose instead of only one?
Sent from my iPhone

On 6 May 2019, at 10:13, ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear Soon Ng

Please see the motor surveyors named in the following list and liaise with LKK
Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey and assessment of liability.

No. [ Name Please tick Vv
1 Kalvin Ang
2 Xing Guo Qiang
3 Mohamad Taufikh
4 Bryan Ang
5 Adrian Ling
6 Mohammed Rasul
7 Marcus Chua
8 Kenneth Kong
9 Muhammad Nazril Bin
Abdullah
10 Ong Hwee jie/Steve Chen

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the
appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
<image001.jpg>

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
From: CHEW BENG KEE
Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 9:57 AM



To: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: FW: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SJB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA: 03.05.2019
[Internal General]

Lonpac Internal - General

PRI, pls assist.

Lonpac Internal - General data can be shared within the Company. This data cannot be sent to
external parties unless authorised.

From: Car workz [mailto:carworkzws@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, May 03, 2019 5:57 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: To Arrange Surveyor To Survey SJB5102C (TP Against SGX5392B) - DOA: 03.05.2019

Dear Officer,

We would like to propose direct settlement for the above case and will like you to send your list of
10 surveyors for us to choose.
The estimate will be ready once your panel surveyor reach. Please revert on liability also.

Our Client's Veh: SIB5102C
Your Insured's Veh: SGX5392B
DOA: 03.05.2019

Best Regards,

Soon Ng

Carworkz

Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C
#01-22

Singapore 575645

H/p: 8118 4734

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com
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