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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Foo Chit Yan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FooChitYan@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: 14 October 2020 10:53 AM
To: Admin A; Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto 

Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
Subject: OUR REF: BUS/04/19/1066; YOUR REF: TBA; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB1325S & 

PA7272R ON 27.04.19 ALONG CLEMENTI AVE 6
Attachments: Letter of Demand.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Khanchna,  
 
We refer to your email dated 13.10.20. 
 
The accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your insured encroached lane while our client is 
moving straight, thus BOLA S16 apply.  
 
Without any admission of liability, we are prepared to recover our client's losses $1,194.50 in full and final 
settlement as follow:  
 
Cost of Repair: $1,050.00 
Loss of Use: $137.50 ($275.00 x 0.5 days) 
LTA receipt: $7.00 
 
Total: $1,194.50 
 
Kindly let us hear from you soon 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Jimmy Foo 
Claims and Insurance Agency 
Direct line +65 6556 3521| ChitYan@smrt.com.sg 
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 
Singapore 569140 

 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2020 2:34 PM 
To: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 
IA/Buses) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: Accident between SMB 1325S & PA 7272R (CTI) on 27/04/2019 


