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> Back to OneMatoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner |D Type: Singapore NRIC
Cwener 1D 17276
A T T e e e e i
Vehicle Mo FZ9447C
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 07 May 2019
Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Wehicle Model: RXZ
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2005
Engine MNa.: 5PV012991
Chassis Mo.: PMYSPV10050012971
Maximum Power Cutput: =
Open Market Value: $2,438.00
Criginal Registration Date: 14 Dec 2005
First Registration Date: 14 Dec 2005
Transfer Count: 7
Actual ARF Paid: £366.00
e R PR R B e e B e i N
PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
A0 [0 T 4 T ) 8 T 9711 i 3 AR 2 oS IV G0 S WSS S S N TS R eSS
COE Expiry Date: 13 Dec 2020
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE PeriodiYears): 5
PCP Paid. $3,133.00
COE Rebate Amount: $1.071.00
Total Rebate Amount: %1,071.00

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan {if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 May 2019

OK



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle No. FZ9447C

Wehicle Type: POG - Passenger Motarcycle/autocycle/Moped
Wehicle Attachment 1: Mo Attachment

Vehicle Scheme : Marmal

Vehicle Make ; YAMAHA

Vehicle Model : RXZ

Chassis Mo.: PMYEPV10050012991
Propellant : Petrol

Engine Mo, : SPVD12971

Engine Capacity : 133 cc

Maximum Power Output

Maximum Laden Weight :

Unladen Weight : 106 kg

Year OF Manufacture : 2005

Criginal Registration Date : 14 Dec 2005

Lifespan Expiry Date :
COE Category :

D - Matoreycle

PGP Paid : £3,133.00
COE Expiry Date : 13 Dec 2020
Road Tax Expiry Date: 25 ul201%
Inspection Due Date: 25 lan 2020
Intended Transfer Date 07 May 2019
CO2Emission: =

CO Emissian:

HC Emission : *

MOx Emission :
PM Emission :

The current road tax expiry is 25 Jul 2019, You may renew the road tax fram 26 Apr 2019 with all pre-requisite(s) fulfilled. If the road taxis
renewed after 25 Jul 2019, late renewal feels) will be imposed. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable to check on the late feels) payable.
Road tax, including Over Payment [if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered cwner when its ownership is being transferred.

Amount Before G5T GST Amount Amount After G5T

(5%) (5%) (5%)

Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 25.00

Sub Total : 25.00

Mett Road Tax Amaunt (After 446.00 446,00
Offsetting Over Payment) :

Total Amount Payable : 71.00

Amount Before GST GST Amount Amount After GST

(53) (5%} (53]

Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 2500

Sub Total : 25.00

Mett Road Tax Amount [After 24.00 - F4.00
Offsetting Over Payment) :

Total Amount Payable : 119.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichewver is earlier.
You may print this page for reference.

OK




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Manday, 6 May 2019 9:12 AM

To: FOO MEI MEL; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Sherini Pillai

Subject: RE: Request PRI check for Accident Vehicle FZ9447C

Attachments: india international ins.pdf 4'2Sam OC e ’W‘I
EpLc

Dear Sir / Mdm, Ois [

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FZ%447Cand let us have your report urgently. gl “‘{“ [

This claim will be handled by Ms Sherini.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen,

Thank You,

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

P |npI1a
o @ INTERNATIONAL
( [NsuRANCE
§ i1 NG AF O KD
Serving the region since JRI7

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 045711
Tel: 8347 6100, Ext — 248

From: FOO MEI MEI [mailto:fmmjcngrp@gmail.com]

Sent: 03 May, 2019 7:19 PM

To: Mator Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Request PRI check for Accident Vehicle FZ9447C

Good day sir,

Kindly arrange LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD for the survey
Please contant Mr.Erik Chan for the time for the surveyor.

Contact at 9677 5772

On Fri, 3 May 2019 at 16:44, Motor Claim - 11 <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email,

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

1



* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
+« \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

o InDIA
s o INTERNATIONAL

]HSUMNCE
JINGATFTORTLE
Serving e region dace 1957

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: FOO MEI MEI [mailto:fmmjcngrp@gmail.com]
Sent: 03 May, 2019 3:33 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: Request PRI check for Accident Vehicle FZ9447C

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
2



It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
mnotified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If vou do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER.:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



JCN AUTOLUTION PTE LTD ... e
Address: No B, Kaki Bukit Ave 4, $07-23, Premier® Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

AUTOLUTION W™ +6568811772 B sales@jengrp.com

Date: 037 May 2018

India International Insurance Pte Ltd BY EMAIL@ motorclaim@iii.com.sg
64 Cecil Street

#04/ 06-00, 108 Building

Singapare 049711

Attention: Motor Claims Department

Dear SirfMadam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES FZ 9447C & SH 7273T ALONG BUKIT BATOK STREET 34 ON 06/04/2019 AT ABOUT
1845 HOURS.

. We act for the Owner of Vehicle No. FZ 9447C whose vehicle was damaged as a result of an accident with your Insured, the
Driver of Vehicle No. SH 72727 on 06/04/2019,

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Please kindly revert to us once youInsurer have received this
notice and a Pre-Repair Inspection will be arrange within the next 02 working days before we camry oul any repairs to the men-
tioned vehicle.

If we do not receive any reply or instruction from you/Insurer within the stipulated timeline, our clientiwe shall procesd to repair
the mentioned vehicle without further reference to you/lnsurer.

Please kindly contact @ 9677 5772 Erik Chan should you require more information,
Venue for vehicle to be inspected as follows:
39 Weoodlands Close

#01-34/35, Mega@ Woodlands
Singapore 737858

Yourg/faithfully,

PTELTD



BiR20490 Merimen e-Claims

Print Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*FZ9447C (MCT13040217)
[SH7272T]
TP

MOHAMMAD ZULQURNAIN BIN ROSLI
Apr 6 2019 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Jon Autolution Pte Litd - Kaki Bukit

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 08/08/2019 14:01 PM.
To sherini@iii.com.sg
cc WI_SG; chewht@lkkaulo.com; admin-a@lkkaulo.com

Subject <Submit PRI= MCT19040217

I-'Jear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we have checked with third party repairer that no DS as they engaged independent surveyoru
for this matter.

In view of this, we will proceed to close file and submit PRI report to your good office.

Thank you.

Hsiao Tong

https:/fsingapore.manmen.com/claimaindex.cfm?fusebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=57244T68&CFTOKEN=a3164228detabd09-4FE61A5... 1M




BAG2019 Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

r'_:_LﬁIH SUBFOLDER TRACKING _ e
Case | Kotified Est Submitted l-'-"L'-=I__-'E'-'_.~__'1r!..'-! Adj Apt | Ad| Submitted Ins Auth'ed Statuc
o |09 Apr 2019 06 May 2019 1¢0.00 5$0.00 s gt |
aln | H
| Edit Reg Edit Ad) Rpt || ~EGIt Estimates | | viewnpt | Fan Soag ] |

Main Reference Claim Details Documents Show All I

‘CLAT SUBFOLDER DETALLS ~ (created by adjuster]

Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg, No.: -

Main MOHAMMAD ZULQURMNAIN BIN ROSLI, ID: 59621727G
 Claimant:

Vehicle Reg. . |06/04/2019 20:00 - :59
No.: e Date of LOSS: | 115 Months and 23 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
Claim Type: | TP/ MCT19040217 ﬁﬂ?’ﬁf“ MCOMOO15 (TP, Fire & Theft)

[Vehicle Reg,
|Na. SH7272T
[(Insured): |

Policy No.

{Claimant): SOE7ER0941-02

Excess:

e Bukit - Tel: 96775772

;l:;ﬂ':? India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .., [Handled by Sherini Pillai]

Claimant's
Insurer:

| NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah] ... [Final Rpt due
[OWSER 115/05/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Enmgse-tase Mail | |

« 111_SG (10/05/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - FZ9447C - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSE view All | Search Tasks || Create New Task | | Complete ||

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

https:/isingapore. merimen.com/claimsiindex.cim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheaderfcaseid=8196158extid=3028734CFID=5760679... 1/2



BM62019 Merimen e-Claims

https:#singap-ure.rnerimenmmfdakrnsﬁndax.cfm?msebux=MTFtadjusiar&ius:&actiun=dsp_dmheadar&caseld=ﬂ1Qﬁ1ﬁﬂsaxtid=3DZBT3&CFID=5TﬁDB?Q... 2z



8162019

Claim Documents

*FZ9447C (MCT19040217)

Merimen e-Claims

[SH7272T]
™

MOHAMMAD ZULQURNAIN BIN ROSLI

Apr 6 2019 8:00PM

[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Jen Autolution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit

Upload Documents I Upload Photos I Compaose New Le!‘terl

View | View in Browser ¥

Photos/Images |3 per page || &
o | Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) = | [Thumbnail | Print
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2 |08/08/1913:55 | General View © | Ladwc | @ |
3 |08/08/1913:55 | General View i ) - €© | Loadirg | & |
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Documents Checklist

Merimen e-Claims
Photos/Images  3perpage v | @ |
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hitps:fisingapore. merimen com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=MT Rdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docview&domainid=1&corole=4&objid=819615&extid=3028734 ...

22



862013 Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.regno:1ss07198r)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Induslrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS3/119007909/NPB3S2

Date: 16/08/2019

REFERENCE
Handling Insurer;  India International Insurance Pte Lid Policy No: MCOMOD15
ﬁ:"_'""“‘ Vehicle  c79147C Insured Vehicle No :  SH7272T
Date of Loss: 06/04/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No:  MCT19040217
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FZ9447C
Make & Model: YAMAHA RXZ, 133cc (M) Engine No: 5PV012991
Reg. Date: 14/12/2005 (Man. Year: 2005) Chassis No: PMY5PWV10050012991
Colour: Red Odometer: 51262 km
Engine Capacity: 133 ce
Market Value/Mew Car Price: A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Fair Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: B0/80 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 80/80 R18
Front Left Side: Dunlop 5 mm Rear Left Side: FKR 4 mm
Frant Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The ahove values represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's ~ Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00

Nett Amount (S$) 0.00 0.00 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 06/05/2019

! : 39 WOODLANDS CLOSE #01-34/35

Dite Ingpected: OGARA018. finapacid At Repairer: Jcn Autolution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit
Estimated Period of Repair: 0.0 days
Adjuster:  Muhammad Mazril Bin Abdullah Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE; This report reprasents our findings at the ime and place of inspeclion slated heredn, Such inspection has been carred oul to the best of our knowfedge and ability but
any other fability undsr any other circumslances is hereby expressly sxcluded.

hitps:/isingapore. merimen. com/claims/index cfmMusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpi&caseid=819615&extid=302873&CFID=576067938C... 114



BME62018 Adjuster Report

A} THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B) THE REPAIR ESTIMATE WAS NOT PRESENTED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION.

THE REPAIRER WAS TOLL TO FREPARE THE ESTIMATE.
C) ENCLOSED PLEASE FIND DAMAGED VEHICLE PHOTOGRAPHS.

hitps://singa pore.marimen.ﬂmﬂdaim&ﬁnd&x.cfm?ﬁmab-uFMTFtadjustar&{useactiun=gﬂnjﬁnlrp1&¢asaid=ﬂ-19515&5:M=3025?3&GFID=5?ED'ET93&C.. .24



BME2018 Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 16 Aug 2019)

Parts: NI YAMAHA RXZ 133cc (M) (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for FZ9447C)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with the

END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page
Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

There are no new parts selected.

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,
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BM62019 Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus items selected,

Recommended Labour

There are no labour items selected.

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

=< END OF ESTIMATES >
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