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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 3:42 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Between SLA 2316D & SHC 5952J on 01-05-2019 along 

South Bridge Road. (Your Insured Policy no : Z19VP05022328)  *** LKK REF: 

CC3/LPC19007899/Kha3 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

 

We will now close the matter and will submit our WP report to your good office. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 3:30 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Between SLA 2316D & SHC 5952J on 01-05-2019 along South Bridge Road. (Your 

Insured Policy no : Z19VP05022328) *** LKK REF: CC3/LPC19007899/Kha3 [External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Vic, 

 
We shall reject the claim at our end.  

 
 

 
 
Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
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Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 3:21 PM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Between SLA 2316D & SHC 5952J on 01-05-2019 along South Bridge Road. (Your 
Insured Policy no : Z19VP05022328) [External Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC3/LPC19007899/Kha3 

 
Dear Gerald, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

In view of the PIR that is against TP, kindly advise if we will deny the TP claim. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 2:42 PM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Between SLA 2316D & SHC 5952J on 01-05-2019 along South Bridge Road. (Your 

Insured Policy no : Z19VP05022328) [External Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC3/LPC19007899/Kha3 

 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

Hi Vic, 
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Kindly assist. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 2:37 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Between SLA 2316D & SHC 5952J on 01-05-2019 along South Bridge Road. (Your 

Insured Policy no : Z19VP05022328) [External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 

Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Since Joy is no handling the case, kindly assist to forward the email to 

current the case handler.  
 

 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 2:27 PM 

To: MT_Claim_SG 

Cc: Coretta Leong 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving Between SLA 2316D & SHC 5952J on 01-05-2019 along South Bridge Road. (Your 

Insured Policy no : Z19VP05022328) 

 

Your Ref no : 19/19/19/VP05/021749 

Our Ref no : SLA 2316D/T/19 

 

 

Dear Mr. Gerald Poh, 

 

We refer to the above reference number for the accident case of your insured : SLA 2316D. 
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We hereto enclosed our client's traffic police investigate result for your attention. Please be informed that 

third party driver has been charged and committed an  

offence of Inconsiderate Driving under Section 65(b) of the Road Traffic Act Chapter 276. 

 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Best Regards 

Arine 

 

On Thu, 18 Jul 2019 at 11:39, Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg> wrote: 

Your Ref no : 19/19/19/VP05/021749 

Our Ref no : SLA 2316D/T/19 

 

 

Dear Mr. Gerald Poh, 

 

We are the repairer and case handler of SLA 2316D (vehicle owner : Ms. Ng Wai Yee). 

 

We refer to the road traffic accident mentioned above, herewith attached our client GIA Report, Accident 

Scene Video for your attention. 

 

Our client received a notice from third party insurance's solicitors. 

 

Kindly noted that our client has filed a claim to Third Party Insurance and denied all liability in this case.  

 

Please do not prejudice our client's claim in any settlement with the third party. 

 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Best Regards 

Arine 

 

 

CC to : Driver (Ms. Coretta Leong) 

--  

 

 
  T : 6745 7367   |   F : 6841 3390 
  E : support@preciseauto.sg 
  W: www.preciseauto.sg 
  A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 
 

 

  Follow us on social media:  
https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/          

https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs 

https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/ 
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--  

 

 
  T : 6745 7367   |   F : 6841 3390 
  E : support@preciseauto.sg 
  W: www.preciseauto.sg 
  A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 
 

 

  Follow us on social media:  
https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/          

https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs 

https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/ 


