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FINALSETTLEMENT DusTime: o[l (1" Confirmwilh L .\4 ] \aogmn Eirail |
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' OPT/MALERHZ SEAVREnsET™

y SINGA_F'QFIE e 0 /Oothmawerks @ /OptmaWwerk
Date: 02.05.2019 Third Party Insurer: AlG
Vehicle No: SMC9094A Third Party Veh No: YK5661E
Maodel: TOYOTA NOAH HYBRID 1.BX CVT Date of Accident: 30.04.2019
Chassis: ZWRS800325163 - 2018
Reg.Year: 2018
ESTIMATE
NO. DESCRIPTION aTy UNIT 58 AMOUNT 55
1 [FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR ASSY RH 1 P’V e s $910.00| C—
SUB TOTAL 591000
LESS 25% §227.50
PARTS TOTAL 5682.50
LABOUR CHARGES:
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE E REPLACE DOOR SIDE MIRROR R ETC SRB0.00 di?('
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS 5120.00 ﬁ::-(
TO CHECK & REFIX SIDE MIRROR WIRING & ETC 530.00 Zﬂ(
LABOUR TOTAL 5230.00
ONG TOTAL 5912.50
s
o7 MH&/
%Mv ,9’64‘#‘)’7
faéy
aad office Brarsch Branch
ey | s s QUYL



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 2:11 PM

To: 'Lily loi@ow sg’

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); ‘angela.tan@ow.sg’; 'adeline@ow.sq’; ‘sharon@ow.sg
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC9094A & YKS5661E ON 30/04/2019 (AIG)

Your Ref :SMC9094A [ TP#B18B

Qur Rel : CC&/AIG 19007869 /Kpa3

Without Prejudice

(save as lo costs)
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
we refer to the above matter.

We propose sefllement as follows: -

|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 880.08
2 Loss of Rental [1days x $120.00) (w/GST) $ 128,40
TOTAL | § 1.008.48

Please confimn acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/Influence on the issues ol
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lily.loi@ow.sg <Lily.loi@ow.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 5:26 PM

To: Admin A; CS A Team

Cc: 'Sharon Ten'; angela.tan@ow.sg; adeline @ow.sg
Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC9094A E YKSG661E ON 30/04/2019 (AIG)

Our Ref : SMC9094A / TPHE18
Your Ref : YKS5661E

Without Prejudice



Dear Officer-In-Charge,
We refer to the above mentioned accident.

We are claiming as below:

- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST) 5$880.08
- Loss of Rental (incl. of GST) 55192.60 (55192.60 x 01 Day)
Grand Total 5$51,072.68

Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: 465 6481 1011

ORPT/IMALHERKZ i

Head offiCa: 0 Kung Chong Road SNapors 15814 Tei: («08) 04TR 1313 Fax: («06) 04TE 31T
Brancth: QA Serangodn Morth Ave § Singapors BE4500 Tet (-60) G484 000  Fax: [+88) 8451 0N
Branch 667 Upp Thomson Rosd Sngagore 674418 Tel (+68] GALT GOGE Fax (+60) 0453 022

www ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Conlidential information may be contained in this massage. If vou are not the intended reciplent, you must not copy, distribute or usa it for any purpose,
nor disciose its contents to any other person.
Please notify the sender if you recelve this emall in error, and delete the emall and ity content immediately after which.



Our Ref : SMCO094A / TP#BI18B
Your Ref :YKS661E

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Date :23 May 2019

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
AlG BUILDING

78 Shenton Way #07-16

Singapore 079120

Attention: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC9094A & YKS5661E ON 30/04/2019
ALONG QUALITY ROAD HAWKER CENTRE

We refer to the above captioned.

We are claiming the below followings:

- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST) S$880.08
- Loss of Rental (incl. of GST) 5%192.60 (55192.60 x 01 Day)
Grand Total 5%1,072.68

If you have any enquiries, please contact our representative, Ms. Sharon Ten & Ms. Lily ot
64849019 or email sharonow.se / lilv.loiwow sp

All payment is to be issued direct to Optima Werkz Pte Litd.

Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement.
Yours faithfully

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Encl.

This is a computer generated printout and no signature is required.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 1:50 PM

To: shirley-er@sakuratech.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK5661E & GWO91K ALONG NO 45 QUALITY ROAD ON
30/04,/2019

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19007869/Kpa3

SAKURA TECH (S) PTE LTD
BLOCK 5002

ANG MO KIO AVENUE 5
#05-09 TECHPLACE Il
SINGAPORE 569871

Attn: Ms. Shirley
Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK5661E & GW991K ALONG NO 45 QUALITY ROAD ON 30/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GW991K against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ilkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



AUTHORISA T

UWe, lan 122 Hina C Chen 2K Hua) (“the third party claimant") of
BIK 162 Burit Bokal S4. (1 #of—n2 SEL0/6a (address), owner of
cﬁdf?ﬁ q} (vehicle no.) hereby authorize OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD (“the
wuorkshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of
use (“claim"”) for my vehicle no, SMC799¥A . was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on_39/0%/1§ _(date) along H-Pﬂfﬂ:{ Rd Hevker Centee

(location) involving vehicle no/s Yks6l/ F‘thc accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of
my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

| further ncknowledge that any seftlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and withoul admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers

af the other vehicle's is concerned.,

e
Dated this L (day) of a—{munlh] Eﬂ_‘r?_ {year)

7

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




RELEASE VOUCHER
AIG Asia Pacific - Ex Thi arty Claim

“We/l, __OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD (“the workshop") hereby confirm that
we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed
for S8 880.08  (Repair Cost), SS 12840  (Loss of Us€/Rental), 88__ - (Disbursement) for
vehicle no. _SMC 90844 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 30/04/2019

(date) along _______NO 45 QUALITY ROAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s _ YKSBB1E |, This is pursuant 1o the inspection conducted on 02/05/2018 (date)

ot “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner TAN TZE HUA (CHEN ZHIHUA)

(the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. _SMC 9084A make the claim as set out in the above
paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l
deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimam”™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,

loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”

after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses

suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to
SMC 8084A  (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this [ﬂ (day) of gl {month) 20 18 _(vear)

Signed hyﬁin‘[ﬁd SUTVeyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)

Without Prejudice

"The contents of this document apply lo
property damages claim only. All personal
Injuries and damages arising therefore are
not included from the ambit and application
of this document.”




Optima Werkz Pte Ltd
©A Serangoon North Avenue 5, Singapore 554500

Tel (+55) 6484 9510 Fax: (+85) 6481 1101

CoReg & GST Na: 201212455W

TAX INVODICE
To: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD INV NO. : 121903294
INVOICE DATE « 23/052019
T8 SHENTON WAY REF - TP#818
IZ‘]ME A-I'E Bi.IILDING "JEH m‘ . mm
SINGAPORE 079120 CAR MODEL : NOAH HYBRID 1.8X
CURRENT MILEAGE:
;:xmagmﬂﬂ ADVISOR + ONG HOCK KONG
TERMS : COD
U.PRICE AMOUNT
DESCRIPTION QTyY UuUom 5GD 86D
FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR ASSY RH 1 PC BH2.50 B82.50
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REPLACE DOOR SIDE MIRROI 1 JOB 60.00 60.00
LETC
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & 1 JOoB £0.00
FURNISHING MATERIALS
TD CHECK & REFIX SIDE MIRROR WIRING & ETC 1 JOB 20,00 20,00
Remarks: DOA: 30/04/2018 @ 1100 HRS
CLAIMANT TAN TZE HUA(CHEN ZHIHUA)
TP VEHICLE: YKS8B1E
Singapore Dollars: Eight Hundred Eighty And Cent Eight Only
Nama:
NRIC No.: SUB TOTAL SGD 822.50
GST7.00% SGD 57.58
Signature: GRAND TOTAL SGD BBO.0E
e confirm thal e intuned ihe Parein and wil chaare agreeran wil the mpars
mmnmummﬁmmuﬁm for Optima Werkz Pte Lid
) Mew pars purchased and inaished by Oplena Werk P Lid sl be envliled ko wartanly penod of coe
(1) yer & milsage w@ & 30 0007, whichever comes firsl, fram [he dale of invose, with the sszepten in
Lo X§9
&1 meeths or misege up to 10 B00kMm. whc hewer comes firt. fom the caim of srvoce, wfih The sscepson
SN R - AUTHORISED SIGNATURE(S

3] Gods solf are not refundalieretismabie

Origing inysios & oy welil ahan e papman 5 schnowisdge recegl by Optima 'Werss P Lid inherest
of % per month will be charped on any sutsiandeg amount



Optima Werkz Pte Ltd

8A Serangoon North Avenue 5, Singapore 554500
Tel (+65) 8484 9919 Fax: (+85) 6481 1011
Co Reg & GST No: 201212455W

TAX INVOICE
Toe TAN TZE HUA INV NO., : 121803010
. e : ':'1PH‘IB.I"I15A1IJ1ZEB
1 9 REF $
ﬂ-:ﬂnlik 62 BUKIT BATOK ST 11 VEH NO. . SMCH084A
SINGAPORE 650162 MAKE : TOYOTA
MODEL : NOAH HYBRID 1.8
Tel 91003753 CURRENT MILEAGE:
Fax ADVISOR : TRIOD
TERMS « COD
ue
# DESCRIPTION ary uUoMm SGD SGD
1 CAR RENTAL CHARGES 1 DAYS 180.00 180.00
RENTAL AGREEMENT NQ 101258
VEHICLE NO: SLR4011E
MODEL: TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID
FROM: 09/05/2019 - 09/0572019
Remarks: DOA : 30/04/2018 @ 1100 HRS
Singapore Dollars: One Hundred Ninety-Two And Cent Sixty Only
MName:
NRIC No.: SUB TOTAL SGD 180.00
GST 7.00% SGD 12.60
SGD
Signature: TOTAL _llm
Oustanding SGD 192.60
mmf;uﬂﬂxrmuﬁm o For Optima Werkz Pte Ltd
1) Mw pam purchased snd instaded by Optime Wens Pie L, wil be sntited to warrssty pariod of ane
(1) ymar o milage v = 30 000km, whichever comes first, fem e ot of race il e scepbon i
it
:p‘:;nn::mnm—uum-mmhm wil b ertnied 13 warrnrty penod of s %—
4] morihs or miesge B to 10,000km whichayer comes frsl, fom (e cate of iveste, wiih The escepllan
e AUTHORISED SIGNATURE(S)

1) Goods soid gre nol rehnstieretursie

Crgina Inwmice m onlg wRii shen e pepmel e ecknowedge ieoeol by Opima Wes P Ll messt
o I ST mSAIR w B CRATDED P By SUIBIAREING MO

Page 10of 1



Mernimen e-Claims Page | of |

.+-CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane
|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING o
_Case | Wouified | Est Submitted | Ad) Asmpned Aa) Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status |
oy |02 May 2010 gg:‘;" @01 5$822.50 S$822.50 m for Svey
— fon 249 e agyupe | | Emrsmases | | view not | Cancel Case |

Main Refersnce

'CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
SAKURA TECH (5) PTELTD, Co. Heg No.: 199808326

TAN TZE HUA (CHEMN ZHIMUA), 10: S7927547F

. [30/0473019 00:00 - ;59
SMC9094A Date of Loss! | g wisnthi and & Days From LTA Reg Date {Man Yr}]

TP / 09980191355G wg“”' 2100348825 (Third Party Only)

Policy No.,
YKSE61E (Claimant): 5102407406(DRIVOCLASSIC)

| N Excess:

HEpairer: | Optima Werkz Pte Ltd (HQ} & Kung Chong Road, 159143 Leng Kes - Tel: 64771313
Handiing | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel, 6564153000 .., [Handled by Ler, Bernard-1Q]
Insurer: | BernardliQian. Ler@aig, com

ﬁ'“mr::“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Te: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt dus 14/05/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All I Compase Case Mall ]
« AIG_5G (0%/05/2019); Ra: Request for O1 GIA report

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Search Tasks | Create wew Task | Complete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Croated On Done?
No refults.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 17/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SMC9094A (09980191355G)
[YK5661E]
TP
TAN TZE HUA (CHEN ZHIHUA)
Apr 30 2019 12:00AM
[SAKURA TECH (S) PTE LTD]
Optima Werkz Pte Ltd
Uplosd Documents | Upload Photos | _ campose New Letier |  pioad vides | _uplusd Audio View [View in Browser v ]
|Letters/Correspondences iperpage v A |
(N6 [Finaiized On LMX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbeall| Print|
1 |(Deat) Third Party Express Settiement - Paymant Breakdown O =
Photos/Images Gperpose V]| @ |
o |Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) T [Thurbesil| Print
1 |06/06/19 14:08 | General View 0 | cedwsc | B
7 |OB/OB/19 14:08 | General View D | eadc | A
3 |06/0B/19 14:08 | General View D | eadic | @
4 |DB/D6/19 14:08 General View g Load G | B
5 |DE/D6/19 14:08 | General View D | waaws | A
6 |06/06/19 14:08 | General View D | cadirc | B2
7 |D8/06/18 14:08 | Genersl View D | adws | 4
B |06/06/1% 14:08 | General View 0 | tdrc |
3 |0E/DE/1T 14108 | General View D e | @
16 |06/06/19 14:08 | General View D | e | B
11 06/06/12 14:08 | General View © | osaws | @
st iperpage  [V] B4
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumtinall| Print
1 0B/OS/15 1120 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF |
F (0BSOS/19 11:20 TP GIA REPORT Load POF |
'3 |D3/06/19 13:54 | Emall to O1 Load POF |
4 17/06/19 10:40 | WORKSHOP INVOICE 0 | LoscFoF |
'S [17/06/1% 10:40 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM ) | LoaaFoF |
(6 17/06/19 10:40 | Release Voucher © | Loaa FoF
|7 |17/06/1% 10:40 | RENTAL RECEIPT © | Load FOF
|Wo | Finalized On | ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnall| Print
! |09/05/1% 15:02 | O GIA REPORT © | Load FOF
Documents Checklist
'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST reset | save | pom |

There are no document checklists configured,

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Aute Consultonts Pte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To: D Handiing Insurer

Womw EBarn@nid Ere PVl UL pOu ENEw 1 10 olher parties

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...

17/6/2019
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Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: YKS661E (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA NOAH 1.8 (A)
SMCI094A (TP veh)

|Date of Accident: |30/04/2019

Global Sum Settlement || [ ] Yes | [X] Ne

Repair Estimate 5 976.38

Final Repair Cost $ B80.08

Loss of Use 5 days at 50,00 per day
Rantal (if any) -1 12840 1 days

LTA | GIA Search Fee 18 0.00

Others: g 0.00

'8
Final Settlement Sum '$ 1,008 48

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registerad? [ ] YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): {%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Optima Werkz Pte Ltd 1 1,008 48
2) ' 8

17 Jun
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting decuments to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Repaort/ BIIl (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (- Rieg No: 199807 108R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B44-8805 Email sur@ikkauto com,assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCB/AIG19007TBE9/KPA3OZ
Date: 17/06/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid.  Palicy No: 2100348825
Finimant Vehicle smceosaa Insured Vehicle No :  YK5861E
Date of Loss: 30/04/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 088801813586
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMC2004A
Make & Model TOYOTA NOAH, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 2ZROB71879
Reg. Date. 26/07/2018 (Man, Year; 2018) Chassis No: ZWRB00325163
Colour: Metallic Grey Odometler. 206489 km
Engine Capacity: 1797 cc
Market Value/MNew Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
TIOMN OF I THE T F
General Condition: Sieering (Serviceabla), Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Conditior
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size 195/85 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 8 mm
Front Right Side Yokohama B mm Rear Right Side; Yokohama 8 mm
The above values represant (he remaining byve reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 682.50 682 50 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 230.00 140.00 90.00 38.13
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (5§) 812.50 822.50 80.00 B8.BE
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 6368 57.58 6.30 8.86
Nett Amount (SS) 976,38 880,08 96.30 9.86
+ Car Rental (1.0 x S$128.40/day) (S$) 128 40
Nett Liability (S$) 1,008.48
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 03/05/2018
Date Inspected: 03/05/2018 Inspected Al 8A SERANGOON NORTH AVE §
SINGAPORE 554500
Repairer:Optima Werkz Ple Lid (HQ)
Estimated Period of Repair 1.0 days
https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuscaction=gen_... 17/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This repant mpresents our findings al bre lime and piace of inspection steted harein. Such inspaction has been camed ouf fo the best of our
knowlsdge snd abilly but any ather labdity under any other circumetances is hereby expressly sxciuded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Gty PariNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR ASSY RH Cented / Cracked 910.00FL *810.00FL
F=Franchisa part LeListimDisc
Sub Total (S$) 910.00 910.00
- List Item Discount on L tems 25.00/25.00% (S5) 227.50 227.50
Total Parts (S5) 682.50 682.50
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour tems
1 LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REPLACE DOOR SIDE Mew 80.00 680.00
MIRROR & ETC
2 LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & MNew 120.00 680.00
FURNISHING MATERIALS
3 TO CHECK & REFIX SIDE MIRROR WIRING & ETC New 30.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 230.00 140.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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