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ABSIGNMENT (Oifice)
" P i Jenar Wl pamne:__O3S[1T
' Cost: Bill to;
o WS1'TP RES/ OD RES /EVA /INV | MV /-CS £ g
To Mepot Vehicle No: b0 10407 ) Sl fuptic Odﬂ(-hi
at Workshop m/s ChC , Tel: - q6q1 GO‘!Q.
o (35 Panden (oo |

~ " Paolicy No:_ | ClaimNo: L “0568‘9114”03
Sum Insured: Fxcess:
Miake of Veh: o D.OA os]o‘H&ulq _
(Clienf's Record)

Daua v §imoy (an

CA | REV | REP. / REV 24 HRS
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ASSIGNMENT
.
Fromy Date: vVieh Mo stO [080T 7t Regn a.o-t\ ?_atsa
Estimated Cost Type h@.‘-.ﬂ.ﬁycie | Bus [ Van | Lorry | Taxi [ Prime Mover |
00@; WS/ TP RES / OD RES / EVA / INV [ MV Truck ] Trailer or
To Inspect Vehicle No Make MI’CL C{SO ce /g?b’
at Workshopmis  (” LiC Colour VV{ML"{"Q AIC. Insured/Std /NI | NA

of

Insured

Policy No.

Claims No.

Sum Insured: Excess:
(Client's Record)

Make of Veh:

(Policy Condition)

Remark: The veh had commenced its NIS 0I5

repair at the time of inspection.

4%k .

Consistent? : Yes or No

Bal. orMarket Value:
IDAC Accident Rport:,

GIA | PR Seen; Consistent? : Yes or No
Est Repairs: days Res: Yes or No
Lum Sum: % 3Val: Yes or No

CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS

Vehicle: IN/OUT

Date: Persan Contacted

T/IRzdio Insured | Std | NI/ NA

Sp.Reading 6‘7 2’36
Eng/No
Co wp p22Se Fo2 R 00273

Gen. Cond: @ [ Fair | Poor / Burnt
Steering: Inwer I Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or

Brake In@er [ Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or

Modi: il ISRim | STR/ARIm or

Tyre Size. F: ’QJS/S_QR(7
"R //

BS/DUN/EXNOVA/GY |FS/LIZAIMIC | OHTSU 1@ SUMI/
TOYO/YOKO or

Front Rear

R/Bal  mm Ribal. é i
UBa é— L/Bal ‘é =
DOA DO 0‘3 -~oX - //‘
Survey held at “/{ s

Des. of Damages :@ Rear / O/S | NIS | UIC | Rooftop or

So/h—._

The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affacted due to collision

Date / Time Adtion / Instruction

/s sud estimde o Alan

DataTime, File Pass to? : Preli. Report

na’:\'—[—maﬁ E/Flnal Report

Resurvey No. of Trip: -— Survey Fee: :10
DatelTime. File Return to? Transportation L0
% Add Fee: Site Insp (9 ). S+R5._SI
D Interview (S ) Photos ] Py
Report Format : -[P Tech. Invs (3 ) Cith -
Lump Sum / L@: ($ B%QBGJ% ) Weekend ($ ) _
i _JDH__ =

Days Of Repair: (‘('




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

—
From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 3:34 PM
To: assignments@Ikkauto.com
Cc: CHAN LI SI; GOH NADIA (Internal); LEE KATIE
Subject: URGENT - Our Ref: L11D56891905 ; TP Veh: SDD1080T ; DOA: 23.04.2019
Attachments: 4498_001.zip
Importance: High
Dear Shiau Chan,

We refer to the above.

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Mr Simon Lau's house by today, his contact number : 9671 6092.
Enclose the estimate from the Cycle & Carriage.

Thank You.

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Ansan Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 078909
Main «(65) 6222 7733 | DID « (65) 5490 9329 | Fax « (65) 6327 3869 | Email - jennylew@uoi com.sq

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 June 2019 1:33 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Ce: SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments; CHAN LI SI

Subject: RE: URGENT - Our Ref: L11D56891905 ; TP Veh: SDD1080T ; DOA: 23.04.2019
Dear Denise,

There is no GIA accident report filed by our insured and we do not have the GIA report filed by the driver of
SDD1080T. Our insured is the car park operator. The incident involved a car park barrier arm dropped
onto the said vehicle.

Regards,

Katie Lee
Manager
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 079909
Main = (65) 6222 7733 | DID » (65) 6490 9318 | Fax = (65) 6327 3889 | Email - katielee@uoi.com.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 28 June, 2019 9:43 AM

To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>; CHAN LI Sl <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: RE: URGENT - Our Ref: L11D56891905 ; TP Veh: SDD1080T ; DOA: 23.04.2019

Dear Katie,

Would like request for SDD 1080T GIA Reprot.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:46 PM

To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; assignments

1



| Pl Vs
- o - Consultants
Bl BB = Ple Lid

51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: L11D56891905

Our Ref: CS/UOI19007824/Gtd3

The Motor Claims Department
United Overseas Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Mdm

Date: 07/06/2019

AMENDMENT PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. _SDD 1080T

We thank you for the instruction on 03/05/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 03/05/2019 at the premises of M/s Cycle & Carriage and have the following to report:

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check” Items Amount
Total

Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor

: S§ 5.240.94
: S$ 2.055.25
- S$ 175.69
- S$ 2.326.00
: S$ -
:S§ -
: S$
nearsige
rear "'__'E““M“____:'_‘:—'ﬂz.



Denise Ta! (LKKAutO) — e .

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:46 PM

To: ‘LEE KATIE'

Cc: SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments; CHAN LI Sl

Subject: RE: URGENT - Our Ref: L11D56891905 ; TP Veh: SDD1080T ; DOA: 23.04.2019
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SDD 1080T.pdf; Full page photo.pdf

Dear Katie,

Apologise for the mistake and re-amend the preli advise.

Enclosed preliminary revised and photograpgh of vehicle SDD 1080T
Repair days: 4

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4215
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408233)

From: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:33 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; CHAN LI S| <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: RE: URGENT - Our Ref: L11D56891905 ; TP Veh: SDD1080T ; DOA: 23.04.2019

Dear Denise,

We are shocked to learn that the repair costs now increase to $S$10,000. This is not a motor accident but
the vehicle was hit by car park barrier arm.

Please provide us some colour photographs for our information.

Regards,

Katie Lee

Manager
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singap«
Main +(65) 6222 7733 | DID + (65) 65490 9315 | Fax 3l » kaliglee@uoi.com.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachmeni(s) contained. shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,

1



ESTIMATE FOR SDD1080T

Mercedes-Benz .~ .\

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited
Authorised Doalar

Company No. 194400267W
GST Reg No. MR-85001 {1-X

( Lau Kai Mun 1\ WIP No 32848
Reg No/Reg Date SDD1080T /15/10/2014
Date In/Mileage -y q.! £ P T‘
Chassis No .:_"_'; 403 RQdS
Engine No 27491030198192
Mobile: 96716092 Make/Model MB/MB C 180 SEDAN (W205) "AVANTGARDE / A
\ —/J Colour/Trim 021 149 Polar White/ 041 101 ARTICO Blac
Account No Tems Dale/Time Printed CSE Operator
CSM00128 Cash 24/04/2019/ 11:35 AQ 305 / Alan Quek Ai Lun
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
N ai;gsuﬂ . e ; - _ e
o e G LTtk OFFICIAL TAX INVIQICE:
- DRIVE rh% N nB¥ M ) b : L -
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: _
BY/AUTHRIZED ON
! BPI:SE’E & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER & REPAIR RIGHT 'A' PILLAR (@ ?é i
RE
A BPIRES 60"4 f@? 0.0 | 2B ss0.0
RESPRAY FRONT BONNET & FRONT RIGHT 'A' PILLAR
M BPNSUN ‘. 72e 720.00 Y
CAR RENTAL FOR 4 WORKING DAYS \ “ " \\
M BONNET e N ‘T | S 1 00 2055.25 00.00 | gf . 2055.25 /
M RHS ROOF MOULDING ,?\k AN L 1.00 175.69 00.00 [ (4! 175.60 -
A f \\\\ )
e A% U
rr L '\J
P i S ;_\}
(PP he)
V‘?A' ("\_-/)
\ e
W
foe powk -
: &. _ 8"2%01{ Aldi Quek
W ‘m Cysie &L-umagc Industries Pre Lut
DID: 677 Body Car apar Center
67714377 Hr' 91865112 Fax: 5872 1272
03 é ,? el ahincof wwveleererings som. g
Confirmed & accepted by IL‘I"\“' AUTO Lonsuliants hence notify Saus 63
I..'. 2PE a I,C,‘::ﬂgr[ Nett 5,240.94
T PLSY. e 7% GST on  5240.94 366.87
I dunng resurvey
* Fan

* Third party survey

Signature;
Date:

* No lllegal modificati ion(s) is a!lowed

* SuplemEntary iém(s) musi be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowiedged by Repairer

0 confirmation Tyne
a "Without Prejudice” basis

= an




15-08-16;22:38 LKK AUTD P P
@ Mercedes-Benz
Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited
Finalization Coempany o, 156400367W
ESTIMATE FOR SDD1080T - GST Reg No. MR-8500111-X
T T T A T T e Vahi e ! lon
by — ] Vehicle 3 Document Informalion
f( Lau Kai Mun WIP No 32848
; Reg No/Reg Date SDD1080T  /15/10/2014
! ¢/o United Overseas Insurance Lt Date InMileage ‘wngl S
Mator Claims Departrment i e Smg § %0 I
r- - s , )
i 3 Anson Rd #28-01 Springleaf Tow e (/= .
- Singapore 079809 Engine No 27491030198192
t’\ 62227733 s \ IMake/Modal MB/MB C 180 SEDAN (W205) "AVANTGARDE /A
\ ColourTAm 021 149 Polar White/ 041 101 ARTICO Blac
Account No Tarmrs Date/Tima Printed CSE Qperator
£S100003 Cash 25/06/2019/ 22:35 AQ 305 / Alan Quek A1 Lun

Description of Gaods / Services

Unit Price  Dise% °

Amount

OATE IN/DATE SURVEY:03-05-2019 // LKK QIANG
BY/AUTHRIZED CH  :CHAN LI SI // 12-06-2019
A BPILAB

REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER & REPAIR RIGHT 'A' PILLAR
A BPIRES 0.11
RESPRAY FRONT BONNET & FRONT RIGHT 'A' PILLAR
00
0

X BONNET 2055.25 00.00

A RHS ROOF MOULEING 175.69 00.00
® CLIP \ 1.00 4.74 00.00

=

Atan Quek
Cycle & Carriege Industries Pie Lid
Bady Care & Repair Center
DID: 67714377 HP: 9186 5112 Fax: 6872 1272
Email: alm.atekfrcvelesomiage.com.ss

ﬁ%m‘*ﬂﬁ;%ﬁ%ﬁ%ﬁ%ﬁ?nOFFﬁl TAX INVOICE

$60.00
700.00
2055.25

175.69
4.74

(

Confirmad & accepted by
Nett 3,895.68
7% GSTon 3B895.68 272,70
Authorized signatory and company slamp Total Payable UL
Yaiidity of theis eatimate 12 14 days from dite of guote. THis 15 & comp genarated ¢ t, no signature 11 required.

Eetimated conts quoted are excluding GST, ¥e would mention that the wbeve estimate 15 based 3a sur Initial inspection and dees net Anclude any additions! parts or labour which may be
ragquived ATtar PaEale work Nad coamanced. Dccantoadlly worn or damaged pirts sre discoversd Aftar work has atarted and nesded for repairs or replacemant. However, should this occer,
wh w0uld BEvIe you, Plakse be 1nforsed Chat & depastt of 508 of the above sitimats s payable defors commencemant of the work, Payment for this may be mada in casn. credit card or
chegue, Tou mict aVso agree to pey ful) amount for renewal of the windigrass fn the svent of (nadvartent breakige in the course of runwing the rutbar wea] or other repair raquiring

the remove] af the windecreen,

Pendan Laop Servies Centar
188 Pendan Loop
Singapere 128370
Tel: 6777 6388
Faxe 6779 5382
m Marcedas-2eng - e ragiatered wademarks of Daimier, Stuttparn, Germeny vaww.marcedes-benz.com 8§

Pags 1af 4

1%



@ Mercedes-Benz '

Cycle & Carrizge
Industries Pte Limited
Authetlsed Desler

o |L_SUPPLEMENTARY | Gk wesmcoinx

ESTIMATE FOR SDD108

- — 1 Vahlels & Document Information
’/ Lau Kai Mun -\. WIF No _ 32848 _
| ReghoRegDste  SDD1080T /15/1012014

clo United Overseas Insurance Lt | Date InMilsage ATI06) TrRSSEE
Motor Claims Department j R Sﬁ%‘;@%{% %G T
3 Anson Rd #28-01 Springleaf Tow SR £ _.,5'4

Frmit et ) o S St

Singapore 075909 | Engine No 27491030198192
62227733 | MakeModal MB/MB C 120 SEDAN (W205) "AVANTGARDE /A
\ Colour/Trim 021 149 2olar White/ 041 101 ARTICO Blac
Acsount No Terms  Dale/Time Printed CSE Qperator
cs160003 Cash 25/06/2019/ 22:35 AQ 305 / Alan Quek Af Lun
Cescription of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price  Disc% Amount

THis4% NEaT.AK.OFFICIAL TAX INVOIC

DATE IN/DATE SURVEY:03-05-2019 // LKK QIANG
BY/AUTHRIZED ON :CHAN LI SI // 12-06-2019

«\@Vﬁ% -

Alnd Yuek
(\!CIB:OL& Cg?iﬂ{ic]lzndastﬁcc‘s Pz Lid
y Care & Repair Center
DID: 6'.’7'1 4377 HP: 9186 5112 Faxi 6872 1272
Exncil: clannuek@eyclecearinge.com.sg

Confimed & accepled by

Nett- 474
7% GST on A4.74 0.33
Aotk Siarairy and ComETY Stan Total Payable 5.07

Validity of this eatimite 18 14 days from date of guete. This 13 & comp FLLUR . B0 pignaturs 1 required.

Extimated costa gueted are excluding UST. e would mentien that the sbove satimate 18 based on our 1n1t1a) trspection and dues pot (nglede any additional parts or Tabour which mey be
raquired afte= Pepale work hit commanced. Dccantonally wore o damaged parts sre disceversd afear work has sterted and neadsd for repalrs or replacemant. Mowwver, shou'd this sccer,
we would agviee you. Flenie Le trformed that » depoatt of 508 of the above estimeto 15 paysdie befere of the werk, Paymant for this may Ge made in cash, crudit card or

chogin, Yau must aleo agres o pry fu]) amount for ronswal of the windscrasr in the sveet of (nsdvertast braakign {n the courcs of renewing the rubber seml or other raphic requiving
ths resoval of the windscreae, .

Pandan Loop Sarv.ca Centar
138 Pandan Loop
Singepora 128378

Tel, 4777 0380

Faw 6779 5383

m Mergedes-Senz - are reglstered trademarks af Dolmiler, Stuttgar, Genany weanw.mercodos-banz. com.sg Page 1 of 1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CS!UOI19007824Ith3e2

gs&a%v_;?%ﬁg?smmpone 079909 Date:  05-07-2019 M“||’||I|I|m|”"m
Code: UOI2
Insured Veh. PUBLIC LIABILITY Veh. Inspected SDD 1080T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. L11D56891905 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JENNYLEW Assign Date 03/05/2019
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C180 c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WDD2050402R003731 Colour WHITE
Odometer 67336 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

General

Size

Make

Balance

Accident Date

UH Rear Tyre

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS

23!04!201 9

R/H Front Tyre |[225/50 R17 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[225/50R17 PIRELLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [225/50 R17 PIRELLI 6 mm

225/50 R17 PIRELLI 6 mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.

lnspecﬂon Date

03/05/2019

Survey held at

CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL

188 PANDAN LOOP
SINGAPORE 128378
(MERCEDES-BENZ)

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
S, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

4 Working Days

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR




_’ 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-8V 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page No.:1 of 1

1|BONNET (SN) BENT 2,055.25 2,055.25
1|RHS ROOF MOULDING (SN) cuT 175.69 175.69
1|CLIP (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 474 474
2,235.68 2,235.68
LABOUR
REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER & REPAIR RIGHT 1,440.00 960.00
'A' PILLAR.
RESPRAY FRONT BONNET & FRONT RIGHT 'A’ PILLAR. 850.00 700.00
CAR RENTAL FOR 4 WORKING DAYS. NOT NECESSARY 720.00 -
3,010.00 1,660.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,245.68 3,895.68

007824/Gtd3e2

XING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




