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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 9:38 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021738 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jia Le 
 
Please proceed. 
 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 9:13 AM 
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021738 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Dear Li Li, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Insured mentioned that he did not saw another vehicle involved in the accident on that time. We propose 
to offer third party for rear damages only due to insufficient evidence.  
  
Summary to offer to third party repairer, “J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD” is as follows: - 
  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 14,292.63 $ 6,527.00 
2. Loss of Rental (11days x $120) $   1,320.00 $    960.00 (8days x $120) 

Total $ 15,612.63 $ 7,487.00 
  
**06days recommendation for repair + 1sunday + 1PRS = 8days. 
  
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
  
The above is for your approval. 
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Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 3:52 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); MT_Claim_SG 
Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021738 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jia Le 
 
As spoken, please verify with Insured.  He has reported only 2 vehicles instead of 3 vehicles’ 
accident. 
 
If there is insufficient evidence, we should only be offering the rear damages of TP vehicle. 
 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2019 2:27 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG 
Cc: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021738 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021738 
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC19007819/Adb3 
  
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have highlighted to your good office on 06/05/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with 
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
  
The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance to the 
MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 
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Summary to offer to third party repairer, “J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD” is as follows: - 
  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 14,292.63 $ 8,560.00 
2. Loss of Rental (11days x $120) $   1,320.00 $ 1,320.00 (11days x $120) 

Total $ 15,612.63 $ 9,880.00 
  
**09days recommendation for repair + 1sunday + 1PRS = 11days. 
  
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
  
The above is for your approval. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May, 2019 10:46 AM 
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021738 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Shu Pei 
 
Please see attached. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 6:51 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 [External Confidential] 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
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We have inspected TP vehicle SKB 1097Z at M/s J-mart Motor Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed 
for a direct settlement. 
 
Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet. 
 
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 1:56 PM 
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Sir / Mdm, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 12:54 PM 
To: assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Nivitha, 
 
Please proceed as arranged.   
 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 



5

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: jmart jmart [mailto:jmartauto@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 12:52 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: Re: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 [External General] 
 
Hi 
 Please arrange Adrian Lin to conduct the survey. Thank you 
 
On Fri, 3 May 2019, 12:36 GERALD POH WEE BIN, <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 
Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VP05/021738 
 
Dear Angie, 
 
Attached list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for your attention. 
 
Please revert.  
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: J-Mart [mailto:jmartauto@gmail.com] 
Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 12:27 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: SKB 1097Z claiming against SLW 6683B DOA 2/5/2019 
 
  Hi, 
 
Kindly refer me the surveyor names. Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Angie 


