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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 12:41 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE]- Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L

DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General]

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Hsiao Tong 

 
Please proceed but start offer with 1 day and up to 1.5 days(max) of loss of use/income as 
per mileage record. 

 
 

Regards, 
Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  

Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 10:37 AM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 

<AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE]- Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General] 

 
Your ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021752 

Our ref : CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3q2 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK120Z(LONPAC) AND SHB4473L(TP) ON 02/05/2019 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

The accident occurred when our driver changed lane and collided onto third party taxi. Liability is not in our driver’s 

favour. 

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer “COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $2,252.75(all-in). 

 

The summary is as follows: - 
 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,623.98 $ 1,919.92 
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2. Loss of Rental (2days x $112.67) $    225.34 $    225.34 (2days x $112.67) 

3. Loss of Income (2days x $80.00) $    160.00 $    100.00 (2days x $50.00) 

4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $         7.49 $        7.49 

Total $ 3,016.81 $ 2,252.75 

 

Surveyor recommended 2days for repair. 

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

 

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.  
 

 

Best Regards,            (On behalf of Asher) 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 3:12 PM 

To: 'Olivia Wendy Kunjan' <OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Kazali Haji Selahudin 

<kazali@cdge.com.sg>; Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General] 

 

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Asher 

 
Are you handling this case? 
 
 

Regards, 
Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

 

From: Olivia Wendy Kunjan [mailto:OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 2:43 PM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; 'AsherSng@lkkauto.com' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Kazali Haji Selahudin 

<kazali@cdge.com.sg>; Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General] 

Importance: High 

 

URGENT 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ms Ong/Mr Asher, 

 

We have not heard from you since our email below. Matter has been long outstanding since 2019. 

 

Kindly let us have your proposal towards our claims. 

 

Thanks & Regards 

 

Olivia Wendy K 

For & On Behalf of Mr Kazali 

Claims Department 

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd 

DID: 62148736 

 
 

 

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 12:05 PM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; Olivia Wendy Kunjan <OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com>; GERALD POH WEE 

BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'AsherSng@lkkauto.com' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; 

MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: Re: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General]  

  
Dear Li Li, 
 
We attach the VF as requested. Kindly let us have your proposal towards our claims soon. Thank you.  
  
The video footage is confidential information.  In possessing, using or viewing the CCTV footage, you do 
not acquire any rights, title or interest in the CCTV footage and undertake to preserve its confidentiality.  By 
downloading, using or viewing the video, you agree that you will not disclose, provide, reproduce, store, 
transmit or otherwise make available the CCTV footage, in whole or in part, to your client or any third 
party.  
 

 

Best Regards 

Kazali Hj Selahudin 
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Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 

Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843 

 

 

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 11:58 AM 

To: Olivia Wendy Kunjan <OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>; 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 

'AsherSng@lkkauto.com' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General]  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment 

unless you know the sender.  

 

Lonpac External - General 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Olivia 
  
How about video footage?  Please provide. 
  
  

Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
  
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
  

From: Olivia Wendy Kunjan [mailto:OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 11:56 AM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>; 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 

'AsherSng@lkkauto.com' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: Re: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General] 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Ms Li Li, 

  

We have sent the PIR to Ms Hsiao Tong for her record and perusal through our email of 27th of October 

2020 and copied to you as well. We await your favourable response soon. 
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Thanks & Regards 

  

Olivia Wendy K 

For & On Behalf of Mr Kazali 

Claims Department 

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd 

DID: 62148736 

 
  

  

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 10:27 AM 

To: Olivia Wendy Kunjan <OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>; 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 

'AsherSng@lkkauto.com' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/021752 [External General]  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment 

unless you know the sender.  

  

Lonpac External - General 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Olivia 
  
Taxi should have the video footage of the accident. 
  
Have you provided it to LKK? 
  
Dear Asher/Hsiao Tong 
  
Please check and advise. 
  
  

Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
  
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
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From: Olivia Wendy Kunjan [mailto:OliviaWendyK@sparkcarcare.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 10:22 AM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>; chewht@lkkauto.com; AsherSng@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Y ref:- CC3/LPC19007818/K1eb3 (SKK 120Z) O ref:- SHB4473L DOA: 02/05/19 

Importance: High 

  

URGENT 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

M/s Lonpac Insurance BHD 

M/s LKK Auto Consultants PTE LTD 

  

Dear Mr Gerald/ Ms Li Li, 

  

Kindly assist to review and settle the below mentioned case as it has been long outstanding since 2019. 

  

Please assist to respond within 7 days hereof as matter is long protracted. Your prompt response is much 

appreciated. 

  

  

S/N TAXI NO 
ACC 

DATE 
LONPAC'S LONPAC'S REMARKS 

   VEH NO CLAIMS HANDLER  

1 SHB4473L 02/05/19 SKK 120Z chewht@lkkauto.com 

Awaiting proposal 
since 2019. 
PIR given. 

  

Thanks & Regards 

  

Olivia Wendy K 

For & On Behalf Of Mr Kazali 

Claims Department 

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd 

DID: 62148736 

 
  

  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  
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ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  
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therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  
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ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  
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