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SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING

Blk.3006,UBI ROAD 1,#01-390,SINGAPORE 408700, TEL:68414445 & FAX:67473546
To: Motor Claims Dept

QBE INSURANCE (S,PORE) PTE LTD

(\&
1, Raffles Quay #29-10 (eata.
South Tower 5,pore 048583,
Accident date:28/04/2019 ENDF anmugﬁf% US‘E '

Date: 09/04/2019

Estimate cost to repair vel: SLG3099C (Kia Cerato) claims under vel:5K) 8661G.

1pce front left fender o tv .l ) S  345.00 =
1pce front left fender inner shield 1 - 12800 -
1ipce front left door e s 989.00
1pce front left door side rubber /¢ o 50.00 -
1pce left headlamp LA 1,523.00 —
lpce frontbumper e L—d 359.00
1pce front bumper samliral sticker ¢ 20.00 -
ipce front bumper lower sticker 7<f ~— 12000 -~
1pce front bumper side holder A+ 3500 —
10pcs front bumper inner clips@56 7+ 60,000 3~
1pce front bumper side airoutlet A~ “ 4700
1set front shock absorber  Bot - %ﬂ §z.§ p
1set wﬂm l':-.{- 2' 520 [$M ),
1pce left front tyer pr=— (% 186:80— /Sofs~)
1pce left knuckle arm Bed 359.00 -
1pce leftknucklearmhup < 197.00 *
1pce left knuckle arm bearing 7~ 145.00
1pce left drive shaft Nt = 983.00 <«
1pce left front lower arm  Qeod 399,00
1pce steering rack & pinion M-t =~ 589.00 .«
ipce axle arm b o 1,091.00 -~

$10,677.00
Lessd8% (b 7/ 1,601.55

$ 9,075.45 pagel
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SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING

Block 3006, Ubi Road 1, #01-390, Singapore 467800
Tel: 68414555 Fax:67473546 “°B7FC0

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

K Vorte X21.6 A

m;m ............. Y Ll LR L L R R e L L LR s L] R TR R

claimNo. .. VOO20UTR  veniceno. SLG 039G
C—‘h e e We .

1IWe......... R b S "‘q ..................................................

NRICNo..S S12268| -C ¢ &k 183D

Ryervale Cresced #14-3 S Sgyez

hereby declares that | have received my / our motor vehicle No. ..........
ELGqcﬂGﬂmmlinmm
after repairs and have no further claims what-so-ever for the repairs

done which have been involved in an accident on ...f.;e..kf’:?t\‘!j ........

The repairs were done to my satisfaction and what ever money due
Please pay to the repairers

Thank You.

4 _
T i PR Date : 'lL’l“ b

The contents of 1his o
Iamages anfy. All par

ing therefrom are axcludad from the '




 Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qgbe.com>
Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 11:57 AM
To: ‘assignments’
Subject: SKJ 8661 G

[2-10pm® 35/ 14
Our ref: VC012543 }

\A«h}dl. In .

Dear all Peﬂ NG WINUN
Kindly survey the third party vehicle on WP basis S@@ &M on

Please contact Winson from Soon San Motor Trading at 6841 4445

Thank you

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 6224 B33 | +65 6477 1225

VWensita Linkedin Twitied

@S QBE

From: soonsanmotor@yahoo.com.sg <soonsanmotor@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 May 2019 10:39 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Subject: Re: SKI 8661 G

Please arrange [ LKK Auto )

Thanks
Sent from Android device

On Apr 30, 2015 10:48 AM, Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com> wrote:
Our rel : VOD20478
Dear sil'

We refer to the above captioned matter.



'+ . We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to vour client’s vehicle. We propose to use one of the
maotor surveyors named in the attached list:

COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Ple
Lid

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
MOLOr SUrVeyors.

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Yebsile Linkadin Twittar

T —

From: soonsanmotor@yahoo.com.sg <so onsanmotor@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 10:32 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.tohi@gbe.com>
Subject: SKJ 8661 G



. .Sent from Android device

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

e m s ———

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e e e e it e o b0 e ———ro _—,——m—————s —_—_—e—

From: Jenny Toh <jenny toh@gbe.com>
Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 917 AM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: SKl 86616

Attachments: SKIBGA1G pdi

Jenny Toh

Senlor Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Aatlies Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
-65 6224 6633 | +65 B4TT 1225

 QBE

Our ref. vC012543
Hi Shu Pei
Kindly find attached as per requsted.

regards

From: Shu Pel [LKKAUto) <shupei@Ikkauto com>

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 3:26 PM

To: lenny Tah <jenny.toh@gbe.com>»

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CedliaChong@lkkauto,com>
Subject: RE: 5K] B661 G

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SK] B661G at M /s Soon San Motor Trading on a WP basis and TP repalrer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Please be informed that estimarted cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action,

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilla and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274,
Thank you,

Blost Repards

Shu Pei| Adrmin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone. BI66-0055 | email: ihupei@Elkauto com | fas 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industral Park, Uty Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuta)
Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 12:12 PM
To: Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh@gbe.com>; assignments <assignmentsi@|lkkauto. com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>
Subject: RE: SKI B661 G

Disar Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment

Passt e rels,
Summer Lee | Adimin
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone 6741-8434 | el gesignmentseclkbamocom | fas 62564315
Bk 51. Paya 1Thi Tndustrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1. ®02-25 | S{4080349)

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:enny toh@gbe.com]
Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 11:57 AM

To: ‘assignments’ <assignments@ kkauto com>
Subject: 5K| BE61 G

Our ref: VCD12543

Dear all

Kindly survey the third party vehicle on WP basis

Please contact Winson from Soon San Motor Trading at 6841 4445

Thank you

Jenny Tah
Senlor Assistant



Claims / Asia
1 Raffles Quay. #29-10 South Towar, Singapore 048533
«B5 G224 6633 <65 6477 1225

> QBE

From: soonsanmotor@yahoo . com sg <soonsanmotor@yahoo.com sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 May 2019 10:39 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny toh@Egbe com>

Subject: Ae: SKI 8661 G

Please arrange | LKK Auto |

Thanks
Sent from Android device

On Apr 30, 2019 10:48 AM, lenny Toh <jenny toh@gbe com> wrote:

Chur rief © VOO20478
Dear Sir
We refer to the above captioned matter

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle We propose to use one of the motor
wWreyors named in the attached list

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automoblle Inspection Services
KM Auto Assessors Pte Ltd

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal S5ervice

Quantum Risk Management (5) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two [ 2) warking days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
SUMNVEYOrsS

[



Jenny Tah
Sonior Assisiant

Claims / Asia

1 Haftfles Quay, #29-10 Soudth Tower. Singapore 048583
+65 B224 6633 <65 B4TT 1225

J—

From: suonsanmator@yahoo com sg <sponsanmotor@yahoo . com sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 10:32 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny tah@gbe com>

Subject: SK) 8661 G

Sent from Android device

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this emall is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply emall
ot telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

tot the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this
email is unasuthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us
by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this emall is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissermination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is



unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard coples produced.
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SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING

Blk.3006,UBI ROAD 1,#01-390,SINGAPORE 408700, TEL:68414445 & FAX:67473546
To: Motor Claims Dept
QBE INSURANCE (S,PORE) PTELTD
1, Raffles Quay #29-10
South Tower 5,pore 048583
Accident date;28/04/2019
Date:28/05/2019
Dear sir/madam:-
Accident involving vehicle no: 5LG 9099C & SKJ B661G along Changi Airport Jewel Basement Carpark.
We understand that your are the insurer of SKJ B661G vehicle.
I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SLG 9099C have been completed repairs to my/our

Satisfaction by M/S SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING we therefore propose to claim from your as follows:-

Cost of repair $4,500.00
Loss of use 1 day 5200 x 11days 2,200.00
Total; $6,700.00

Please let us your reply soonest possible

Your faithfully
CAMN hy e—
D s .f_,.-é_%r}{
P ':’-',
S T ——
he ¢ .r||r“:r__| { this doe ——— =
[P document annl,
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Ligraturg -~ Wby .rllr All persanal INjuries and o THCN
wEINg herefrom are S oglemn iMmages (

| Bl SXCIunes : e
Nl ag plication of Ihie de .I-rlr:r.ll fr HT Mk & ambii

—_—



'8 74 74

- L A
dm BA B Pre Licd

51 URIAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC4/QBE19007817/Agh3
14 JUNE 2019

LOH ZHUANREN

288C PUNGGOL PLACE
#09-825

SINGAPORE 823288

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 8661G AND SLG 9099C ON 28/04/2019

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster
Company by your Motor Insurer (QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid) to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up
with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SLG 9099C.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

NN
\ :;‘; /\f

Cecilia Chong
Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: cs-a@lkkauto.com

ce.  QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

( Qge Tewgq Wowy, (the third party claimant™) of
m; 83D Waevvale Treseeh 14319, S YUHER (address), owner of SLG 9099 C
(vehicle no.) hereby suthorize Soon San Motor Trading __(“the workshop”)
mmhmwﬂmmmmhhmmwmmﬂnﬁmm&mﬁlﬁm’]ﬁr
my vehicle no SLS 909 < _that was damaged pursuant to the accident which ocourred o
R |ey |19 (date) along Clongy Miiget\ Jewel Razapen) C-ﬁ'?or\\ (location)

involving vehicle no/s SX3 BEEV G (“the accident”).

Iﬁnﬂnmmﬂﬁmidmhmhmrnbw:mﬁmﬂdﬁmhlmmﬂmwdmﬁl
and the workshop is further suthorized to receive paymennt further to settlament of my claim with
p-ymﬂnchqndlbcimgmid:inmdth:wurhhup.

Immmmmummmmmmhm.m

ﬁmmmmdhﬁlwmmmuuwmu{um

vehicle/s is concemed.

Datedthis_ 21 (day)of __ Al (month) 20,5 (year)

y R T
Eipﬂby“é:ﬁhﬂpmnlﬁmmf‘ Signed by “the workshop”
i i cabl (with chop)

(with chop if applicable) oo
o~ °
L TRADING %

ansing therefrom are excludad rom the ambil
and apphcation of this decurmen

e 8
The contenils of This documeant apily cvhitle | *——-—- 4}‘:“---"“ -~
damages only  All personal inji I damagss | w




DISCHARGE VOUCHER Gl i

Without Prejudice
Save As lo Costs

Yeur Refarance . SLG 9009C
Our Referenca  ° VC012543

Iwe, Sunn Bm MuhrTrﬂmﬁuhmbvmmMuumumnfBlwmm

ou . 800.00) being full discharge and
uhafadiun nfandulmaagnimtuBE Immmn:u (Singapore) Pte Ltd and their Insurad,
Ldlmmnmn.uwdmmtnmﬂnuuhlnhsmﬂmﬂc#nmmmmm
SLG 9089C and SKJ 8661G at/along Changi Airport Carpark(Jewel, Lobby B Level
HB), which occurred on 28 April 2018 at about 1605 hours.

Further, liwe hareby acknowledge and accept thal the above said sum paid to me is
‘strictly on a wilhout admission of iability basis’ and Uwe hereby discharge and relsase
the said QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid and their Insured ‘Loh Zhuanran, from all
claims, demands or action of demages as a result of the said accident.

Also, Iiwe hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnified the sald QBE insurance

(Singapore) Pte Ltd against all and any claims whatsoaver made or to be mada by any
paraon or persons on myfour behalf in respect of the sald accident.

Dated this (d (o ofimenth)  OF ¢ |

Witness's Signature
& Hg% -IF:E-E-HH &tlﬁ Vace See ey Saiq
Claimant's Nam Wilness's Name

S§q 2265 | [c:, S2\Fo2 63 [ C
FIN/NRIC No. FIN/NRIC No.
[ﬂfs §20 Riw Hk RIE Boct Uy R

C’]eﬁ'cdlf* #f"'f".;?l? ol -390 § Yorten

S' 4483
Addresa Address

Pleasa return to;

General Claims Department

QBE Insurancs (Singapore) Pe Ltd c_w

80 Anson Road \‘.
#11-01 Mapletree Anson \‘s\&

Singapore 076914
Fax: 6534 5258

Company slamp I applicable

—

Ine contents al his AocLrmeni apply to vahicke
damages anly. All parsonal injurias and dam Wes

AMsing therafrom are excluded from the ambit
il application of his o '|"| mard '




' SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING

Blk.3006,UBI ROAD 1,#01-390,5INGAPORE 408700, TEL:68414445 & FAX:67473546

To: Motor Claims Dept

QBE INSURANCE (S,PORE) PTE LTD
1, Raffles Quay #29-10

South Tower S,pore 048583
Accident date;28/04/2019
Date:28/05/2019

Final bill cost to repair vel: SLG 9099C (KIA CERATO) claims under vel: 5KJ 8661G.

To contract lump sum repair recommend by your surveyor and ourselves for Total: $4,500.00 nett

(sin/Dollars: Four Thousand Five Hundred Only)

e
- (R i
- E © et by
- N .
-y .
m e
g
The cantents of this dommmam:
I | CLIT .
‘ 18 | nl s document apply 1o ehicle |
iy nal injuries and mag
4 TI&T, =y " i 1 s '.."1
zd A N are axcluded from the ambit
M MR an of this dacuymant I

— —



Cecilia Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Sent: Monday, B July 2019 10:22 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: VC012543 (OUR REF: CC4/QBE19007817/Agb3/q2) *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SKJ B661G & SLG 9099C ON 28/04/2019 ***

Qur ref;: VC012543
Hi Cecilia

Kindly proceed with the settlement.

_regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 B633 | +65 6477 1225

Websie Linkedin Twitler

SQBE

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com=>

Sent: Saturday, 6 July 2019 10:43 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com=

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: VC012543 (OUR REF: CC4/QBE19007817/Agh3/q2) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 8661G & SLG
9099C ON 28/04/2019 ***

Dear lenny,

We refer to the email dd 28/06/2019.

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction for the mandate.
TP chasing for settlement.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Ceeilin Chong | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong @ lkkauto.com| fix: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

1



From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 28 June 2019 6:00 PM

To: 'Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh g.cam>

Subject: YOUR REF: VC012543 (OUR REF: CC4/QBE12007817/Agb3/q2) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 8661G & 5LG
9099C ON 28/04/2019 ***

Your ref : VC012543

Cur ref : CC4/QBE1F007817/Agb3/q2

Dear Sirs/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ B461G & 5LG 9099C ON 28/04/201%

We refer to the above matier.

Liability is not in our driver’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be
alfected.

We seek your approval fo offer Third Party repairer "SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING” af 55,040,00.

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
Cost of Repair £12.83545 $ 4.500.00
Loss of Rental $ - 5 -
éuss of Income (11days x $ 2.200.00 $  540.00 (9days x $60.00)
200)
LTA/GIA Search Fee $ - g =
Total $15,03545 $ 5,040.00




' **05 days recommendation for repair + 1Sunday + 1Saturday + 2PRS = 09 days
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval/instruction please.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong @dlkkauto.com| fnx: 674:-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this
email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us
by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

81 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 189607198R GST Reg. Mo 18-8607188-R

AMNliiated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 RAFFLES QUAY #29-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583

Ref . CC4/QBE19007817/Agh3q2

Date 17-07-2019.-

Code: QBE

AR

1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Vieh. SKJ BEE1G Veh. Inspected SLG s088C
Policy No. E'VWENTB-;-W& Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. VCD12543 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  JENNY Assign Date 03/05/2019 7
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIA CERATO FORTE c.c 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. KMNAFX411MH5858088.~ Colour BLACK,
Odometer BO161 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15. GOODRICH B mm..
L/H Front Tyre |1985/85R15 GOODRICH 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15- GOODRICH 8 mm-
L/H Rear Tyre [195/5R1% GOODRICH & mm-
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/04/2019 Inspection Date 03/05/2018
Survey held at SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING
BLK 3006 UBI ROAD 1
#01-390
SINGAPORE 408716
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




i

1 7d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B258 3561 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg No: 189607188R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R Page No.-1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 9099C
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT LEFT FENDER DENTED 345.00 345.00
1|FRONT LEFT FENDER INNER SHIELD DEFORMED 128.00 128.00
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 689.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR SIDE RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|LEFT HEADLAMP cur 1.523.00 1.523.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 358.00 358.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SAMLIRAI STICKER NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER STICKER NOT NECESSARY 120.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
10|FRONT BUMPER INNER CLIPS @5§6.00 NECESSARY 60.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE AIROUTLET NOT NECESSARY 47.00
1|SET FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER BENT B658.00 326.00
1|LEFT KNUCKLE ARM BENT 358.00 358.00
1|LEFT KNUCKLE ARM HUP DAMAGED 197.00 197.00
1|LEFT KNUCKLE ARM BEARING NECESSARY 145.00 145.00
1|LEFT DRIVE SHAFT NOT NECESSARY 883.00 -
1|LEFT FRONT LOWER ARM BENT 389.00 399.00
1|STEERING RACK & FINION NOT NECESSARY B6806.00
1|AXLE ARM NOT NECESSARY 1,091.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -B48.70 -386.60
T.647.30 347540
1|SET SPORT RIM (SN) cuT 2.000.00 500.00
1|LEFT FRONT TYRE (SN} cuTt 180.00 150.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -218.00 -
1.862.00 650.00
LABOUR
TO TOWING . 120.00 80.00
TO RUSTPROOF . NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE18007817/Agb3q2




TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- -8V ~ 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg No: 190607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-9607188-R Page No. 2 of 2
: j Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition |, mmp?;n “'*[:1]
TO FOCUS HEADLAMP & WIRING. 100.00 30.00
TO COMPUTER WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 140.00 80.00
TO DISMANTLE /RENEW UNDERCARRIAGE 400,00 220.00
TO DISMANTLE /RENEW STEERING RACK & PINION NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO DISMANTLE /RENEW ACCIDENT 1.500.00 500.00
PORTION .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT LEFT
DOOR
TOD SPRAY PAINT 1.200.00 600.00
3,760.00 1,480.00

GRAND TOTAL 13,369.30 5,619.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE18007817/Agb3q2

B8.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES: - This Repor] s mase salaly lar the wes snd berelil of tha Cllent named an ihe frond page of ihis Rapon




Joanne Lee (LKK Autn!

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 4:10 PM

To: joyce foo@qgbe.com’

Cc ‘CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com’

Subject: SUBMISSION OF ADJUSTER'S REPORT / Your Ref: VCD12543

Attachments: AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM.pdf; DISCHARGE VOUCHER. pdf; EMAIL pdf; LETTER TO

Ol.pdf; LKK PHOTO.pdf; LKK PHOTO-2 pdf; LKKAdjustmentia (16).pdf; LKKInspection
(9).pdf; LKKInvoice1 (32) pdf; LOD.pdf, WORKSHOP INVOICE. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.

Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

JOANNE LEE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@|kkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,



