Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 October, 2019 2:21 PM

To: Hua Meng

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AIG INSURED: SGL 8351 M OUR REF: SKP 9971 Z D.O.A: 29.04.2019 LKK REF
CC6/AIG19007745/Ahb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Jing,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that till date, we are still pending for our Insured to lodge the GIA report.
We are also pending for further instruction from our principal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hua Meng [mailto:huameng@live.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 17 October, 2019 11:24 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: AIG INSURED: SGL 8351 M OUR REF: SKP 9971 Z D.0O.A: 29.04.2019 LKK REF CC6/AIG19007745/Ahb3

Dear Vic

We refer to our email dated 28.08.2019.
We had yet to get any offer from you.
Kindly let us have your offer/ update soonest.

Thank You.
Regards,

Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop



Tel: 6746 5519 Fax:6743 4896

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2019 2:11 PM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG INSURED: SGL 8351 M OUR REF: SKP 9971 Z D.O.A: 29.04.2019 LKK REF CC6/AIG19007745/Ahb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Jing,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that till date, we are still pending for our Insured to lodge the GIA report.
We will follow up and will seek further instruction from our principal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RLERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hua Meng [mailto:huameng@live.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 3:34 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: AIG INSURED: SGL 8351 M OUR REF: SKP 9971 Z D.0O.A: 29.04.2019

Dear Vic

We refer above mentioned accident.

We would like to inform that we have finalized with your surveyor.
Kindly revert your offer within 14 days.

Your prompt reply will be appreciated by us.

We enclose relevant documents for your attention.

Thank You.

Regards,



Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
Tel: 6746 5519  Fax:6743 4896
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