
Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Subject:

Attachments:

Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & lA/Claims & lA/Taxis) < Leecek@smrt.com.sg >

Thursday, 2 January 2020 12:24 PM

Khanchna (LKK Auto)
URGENT / REIVINDER Re: Accident on 26/4/2019 involving SHB 1046G & SLT 9188K
(AlG's insured) (Our Ref: TAX/04/19/2114/lg)
img-X14O9442O O0O1.pdf; vehicle attachment history.pdf; SHB 1046G - PlR.pdf; {resh

invoice.pdf; img-1 021 21 525-0001.pdf

Dear Kha nchna,

Frrther to our email sent earlier at 11.59, we attach copy of letter of 18/1012A19 trom the agent - Borneo Mciofr iti
you r perusal.

i::e ;ards
:':n i-ee.6ek (D:ili 6866 2647)
al:.rims Dap(}r'lmant
iiMRT Automctive $a:"vices Pt€. Lld

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)
sent: 02/0U2020 11:59
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Subject: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on Z6l4l20L9 involving SHB 1046G & SLT 9188K (AIG'S insured) (Our Ref:
rAd l04lt9l2tL4lts)

Dear Khanchna,

As there is supplementary parts, we now re-quantify our claim as follcws:-

Please Iet us have your offer soon. Thanks.

tq*rds
-:-an 

i-ee 6ek {blb: 6366 e647)
/ ^ -,- \^-^--*^-"
ri&Q f Autornotive S*rvrces Pf e LirJ

5L6927.4o ( 140 davsx 5120.91

Loss of lncome

LTA Search Fee
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-il liRI Avli l. #lX.l5 P,\Yi URI l;r.'l)USTRlAl,I'ARK, SIN(;APORE J0llg.l.l TEL: {065) 62-s6-r561 FAX : 1065) 6256111-r

Our Ref: CC3/AIG 190077071Jha3

30 MAY 20r9

FOO CHIEII HSIA ISABEL
2]O PETIR RD
#11-4',15

SINGAPORE 670210

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 9188K & SHB 1046G ALONG/AT ANG MO KIO A\'E IO
oN 26/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SHB 1046G against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident repoft and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour as you were turning out from a minor road towards the main road. We will therefore
pfoceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within l0 days from the date ofthis letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, ifyour
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us ifyou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

l]
v
I

fl'
CI-IAN JIA LE
Case Handler
DID:6749 5792
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: JiaLe@lkkauto.com

c.c. AIG Asia PaciJic Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)


